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DAVID R. ZARO (BAR NO. 124334) 
TIM C. HSU (BAR NO. 279208) 
865 South Figueroa Street, Suite 2800 
Los Angeles, California 90017-2543 
Phone:  (213) 622-5555 
Fax:  (213) 620-8816 
E-Mail:  dzaro@allenmatkins.com 
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501 West Broadway, 15th Floor 
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Phone:  (619) 233-1155 
Fax:  (619) 233-1158 
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Attorneys for Receiver 
Thomas A. Seaman 
 

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 

CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA 

WESTERN DIVISION 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION, 
 

Plaintiff, 
 

v. 
 
STEVE CHEN, USFIA, INC., 
ALLIANCE FINANCIAL 
GROUP, INC., AMAUCTION, INC., 
ABORELL MGMT I, LLC, ABORELL 
ADVISORS I, LLC, ABORELL 
REIT II, LLC, AHOME REAL 
ESTATE, LLC, ALLIANCE 
NGN, INC., APOLLO REIT I, INC., 
APOLLO REIT II, LLC, AMKEY, INC., 
US CHINA CONSULTATION 
ASSOCIATION, and QUAIL RANCH 
GOLF COURSE, LLC, 
 

Defendants. 
 

Case No. 2:15-cv-07425 RGK GJS
 
RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM 
FEE APPLICATION 
 
Date: August 29, 2016 
Time: 9:00 a.m. 
Ctrm.: 850 
Judge: Hon. R. Gary Klausner 
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Thomas A. Seaman ("Receiver"), the Court-appointed receiver for Defendants 

USFIA, Inc., Alliance Financial Group, Inc., Amauction, Inc., Aborell 

Mgmt I, LLC, Aborell Advisors I, LLC, Aborell REIT II, LLC, Ahome Real 

Estate, LLC, Alliance NGN, Inc., Apollo REIT I, Inc., Apollo REIT II, LLC, 

Amkey, Inc., US China Consultation Association, Quail Ranch Golf Course, LLC, 

and their subsidiaries and affiliates (collectively, "Receivership Entities"), hereby 

submits this Second Interim Fee Application.  This application covers the period 

from January 1, 2016, through March 31, 2016 ("Second Application Period"). 

During the Second Application Period, the Receiver and his staff spent 

687.1 hours executing the duties set forth in the Preliminary Injunction Order 

entered on October 6, 2015 ("PI Order").  As set forth in the Receiver's Third 

Interim Report ("Third Report"), the Receiver recovered $6,107,660.62 during the 

quarter and had recovered $28,626,182.71 in gross receipts for the receivership 

estate through March 31, 2016.  The Receiver seeks approval of $121,417.50 in fees 

incurred from January 1, 2016 through March 31, 2016.  The fees were incurred at 

hourly rates ranging from $75 to $375 per hour and the weighted average hourly rate 

was $177 per hour.  The Receiver requests authority to pay 90% of this amount, or 

$109,275.75.  The Receiver does not seek reimbursement of any expenses. 

I. SCOPE OF THE RECEIVER'S WORK 

As previously reported, the Receiver encountered highly volatile and 

multifaceted circumstances upon his ex parte appointment.  During the Second 

Application Period, the Receiver continued efforts to identify and take possession of 

funds in bank accounts, identify and marshal assets, collect and organize bank 

records and began an accounting of the receipts to and disbursements from the 

receivership entities and otherwise investigate potential sources of recovery.  The 

Receiver also cared for and preserved real estate assets, including several single 

family properties, an apartment building, and a hotel in San Bernardino. 
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II. SUMMARY OF RECEIVER'S FEES 

Exhibit A provides a detailed listing of each time entry comprising the total 

fees for the Second Application Period of $121,417.50.  Exhibit B provides a 

summary by timekeeper and Exhibit C provides a summary by task.  The fees were 

incurred by month as follows: 

January 2016 $28,546.00 
February 2016 50,472.00 
March 2016 42,399.50 
Total $121,417.50 

During the Second Application Period, the gross receipts to the receivership 

estate were $6,107,660.62.  The gross receipts may be summarized as follows: 

Turned over by U.S. Treasury $5,636,402.69 
Turned over by banks $1,722.14 
Unearned retainers from attorneys $128,308.77 
Rental revenue $130,565.72 
Hotel revenue $209,025.78 
Tax refunds $1,636.51 
Interest income $1,109.06 

The total fees as a percentage of the gross receipts were 2.0%.  In order to 

reduce fees, the Receiver delegates work to lower priced employees of the Receiver 

at rates ranging from $75 to $190 per hour.  These employees worked 626 hours at 

an average hourly rate of $157, bringing the weighted average hourly rate to 

$177 per hour.  Prior to the Receiver being nominated to serve as receiver in this 

matter, the Receiver agreed to discount his normal hourly rate from $400 to $375, 

which resulted in savings of $1,527.5 during the Second Application Period. 

Inception to date for the First and Second Application Periods, the total fees 

for the Receiver are $323,506.  Gross receipts for the First and Second Application 

Periods were $28,626,182.71.  As a percentage of gross receipts the fees were 1.1%. 
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III. SUMMARY OF CHARGES BY TASK 

The following summarizes the charges listed in Exhibit A by category of fees: 

Task Hours Rate Amount
Accounting and Reporting 112.2 $135 $15,097.50 
Forensic Accounting 1.2 $375 $450.00 
Investor Relations 37.8 $175 $6,618.00 
Litigation & Support 4.0 $190 $760.00 
Manage Business 78.1 $160 $12,496.00 
Project Management 144.8 $184 $26,586.50 
Property Management 148.1 $166 $24,545.50 
Receiver 58.3 $375 $21,862.50 
Receivership Administration 10.8 $153 $1,652.00 
Research Files 72.3 $111 $8,021.50 
Sell Liquidate Assets 19.5 $171 $3,328.00 
Total All Activities 687.1 $177 $121,417.50 

Accounting and Reporting.  This category covers the cost of setting up and 

maintaining an accounting system to account for the receipts and disbursements of 

the receivership estate.  Tax reporting work, including establishing a Qualified 

Settlement Funds ("QSF") and notifying taxing authorities of the Receiver's 

appointment is also included in this category.  For the Second Application Period, 

112.2 hours were spent on accounting and reporting activities for a total of 

$15,097.50.  The average hourly rate was $135.00. 

Investor Relations.  This category covers the cost of communicating with 

investors and includes creating and updating the receivership website, 

www.usfiareceiver.com, as well as responding to inquiries from investors and 

interested parties by telephone, mail, and emails sent via the www.usfiareceiver.com 

website.  For the Second Application Period, 37.8 hours were spent on these tasks 

for a total of $6,618.00.  The average hourly rate was $175.00. 

Manage Business.  This category relates primarily to managing the hotel in 

San Bernardino, which took 78.1 hours at a cost of $12,496.00.  The fees in this 
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category have declined with hotel operations having been stabilized.  During the 

Second Application Period, the hotel generated revenue of $209,025.78 and the cost 

of managing the hotel was 6% of the revenue.  The average hourly rate was $160. 

Project Management.  This category covers a variety of functions of 

managing the receivership estate and includes taking possession of bank accounts, 

identifying and marshalling assets, initiating subpoenas, investigating business 

operations and records, analyzing digital records, responding to subpoenas, 

managing and reviewing digital information, taking possession of real property 

assets, and a variety of matters required of the receivership estate.  In total, 

144.8 hours were expended managing the affairs of the receivership estate for a total 

of $26,586.50, which equates to $184 per hour. 

Property Management.  This category covers the cost of managing the estate's 

real property assets.  During the Second Application Period, 148.1 hours were spent 

managing real estate for a total of $24,545.50, or $166.00 per hour.  Rental income 

was $130,565.72, making the fees 18.8% of revenue.  However, several properties 

do not generate income, such as the golf course land of 860 acres, as well as single 

family homes where eviction actions are or were pending, and make the ratio of fees 

to revenue higher than it would customarily be.  This ratio should improve in future 

application periods. 

Receiver.  This category is only used by the Receiver and includes work to 

manage the myriad requirements of the receivership estate.  During this Second 

Application Period, identifying and marshalling assets, investigating the nature of 

the enterprise and its assets, reporting to the Court, dealing with Defendant Steve 

Chen and interested parties, gathering accounting information and beginning an 

accounting of the receipts and disbursements of the Receivership Entities were the 

primary focus of the Receiver's efforts.  The Receiver spent 58.3 hours, or 

approximately 12% of his time in the Second Application Period, on these tasks.  At 

his hourly rate of $375, the total amount is $21,862.50. 
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Receivership Administration.  This category consumed 10.8 hours for a total 

of $1,652 at an hourly rate of $153.  The work is primarily comprised of document 

preservation and organization, and review of incoming mail, which provides 

invaluable clues to locating assets and other matters requiring the attention of the 

Receiver. 

Research Files.  This category includes investigative work in reviewing 

accounting and other business records to locate assets and understand the business 

operations.  The hours worked were 72.3 for a total of $8,021.50, or $111 per hour. 

IV. STANDARDIZED FUND ACCOUNTING REPORT 

Attached hereto as Exhibit D is a Standardized Fund Accounting Report 

reflecting the receipts and disbursements for the Second Application Period. 

V. THE FEES AND COSTS ARE REASONABLE 

AND SHOULD BE ALLOWED 

"As a general rule, the expenses and fees of a receivership are a charge upon 

the property administered."  Gaskill v. Gordon, 27 F.3d 248, 251 (7th Cir. 1994).  

These expenses include the fees and expenses of this Receiver and his professionals, 

including Allen Matkins.  Decisions regarding the timing and amount of an award of 

fees and costs to the Receiver and his Professionals are committed to the sound 

discretion of the Court.  See SEC v. Elliot, 953 F.2d 1560, 1577 (11th Cir. 1992) 

(rev'd in part on other grounds, 998 F.2d 922 (11th Cir. 1993)). 

In allowing fees, a court should consider "the time, labor and skill required, 

but not necessarily that actually expended, in the proper performance of the duties 

imposed by the court upon the receiver[], the fair value of such time, labor and skill 

measured by conservative business standards, the degree of activity, integrity and 

dispatch with which the work is conducted and the result obtained."  United States v. 

Code Prods. Corp., 362 F. 2d 669, 673 (3d Cir. 1966) (internal quotation marks 

omitted).  In practical terms, receiver and professional compensation thus ultimately 

rests upon the result of an equitable, multi-factor balancing test involving the 
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"economy of administration, the burden that the estate may be able to bear, the 

amount of time required, although not necessarily expended, and the overall value of 

the services to the estate."  In re Imperial 400 Nat'l, Inc., 432 F. 2d 232, 237 (3d Cir. 

1970).  Regardless of how this balancing test is formulated, no single factor is 

determinative and "a reasonable fee is based [upon] all circumstances surrounding 

the receivership."  SEC v. W.L. Moody & Co., Bankers (Unincorporated), 

374 F. Supp. 465, 480 (S.D. Tex. 1974). 

As a preliminary matter, the TRO and PI Order confer on the Receiver 

substantial duties and powers, including to conduct such investigation and discovery 

as is necessary to locate and account for all receivership assets, take such action as is 

necessary and appropriate to assume control over and preserve receivership assets, 

and employ attorneys and others to investigate and, where appropriate, institute, 

pursue, and prosecute all claims and causes of action of whatever kind and nature.  

See TRO, Part XI; PI Order, Part XI. 

The Receiver believes the rates and the total fees charged are reasonable in 

view of the challenges and circumstances encountered and respectfully requests an 

order approving the total fees submitted in the amount of $121,417.50 and ordering 

an interim payment of 90% of the fees incurred, or $109,275.75, from funds held by 

the Receiver.  Payment of the 10% holdback will be sought at the conclusion of the 

receivership. 

VI. CONCLUSION 

The Receiver, therefore, respectfully requests that the Court enter an Order: 

1. Approving the Receiver's fees, on an interim basis, of $121,417.50; 
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Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA  92614

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen

July 09, 2016

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11175

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

1/4/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.40 60.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

1/5/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.90 135.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, sent wire.

1/6/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.80 270.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

1/8/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.80 120.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

1/11/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.60 90.00
150.00/hrSet up monthly recurring ACH for warehouse rent, reviewed Accounts

payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review, and mailed out.

1/14/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 3.60 540.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, entered hotel revenue, booked month-end journal
entries for Hills Garden.

1/15/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 3.20 480.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, entered hotel transactions.

Exhibit A, Page 9
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 2Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

1/19/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.60 90.00
150.00/hrRan 1099 reports for Hills and USFIA, reviewed, called to track down

W-9 info, determined who needed to get 1099s. Contacted Heidi
about getting pre-receiver vendor payment data, and to get W-9's.

1/20/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.60 90.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

1/21/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.10 315.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, meeting with Todd at Crowe to discuss various
entities, and tax returns and extensions.

1/27/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.20 180.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

1/28/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.30 195.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

1/8/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 37.50
75.00/hrCalculated Fedex, court filing, and receivership website fees paid by

Thomas Seaman Company in November/December on behalf of
USFIA and processed reimbursement check.

1/13/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 37.50
75.00/hrInput the payroll for the period ending 12/31/15 to Quickbooks for the

Hills Garden Hotel.

1/14/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrDeposited rental income collected from the Alhambra apartments and

made the accompanying Quickbooks entries.

1/15/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.80 135.00
75.00/hrEntered the 1/1/16 rent statement charges for the Alhambra

apartment building.  Received rents in Quickbooks and deposited the
checks received.  Spoke with Tim McDonnell re tenant
underpayments and housing authority payments for the apartments
with subsidized rent.  

1/19/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.20 15.00
75.00/hrDeposited funds received re rental payments and utility refunds.

1/22/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrDeposited rental income received and made the accompanying

accounting entries.

Exhibit A, Page 10
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 3Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

1/26/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrDeposited remaining rent payment from Alhambra apartments and

performed the accounting re same.

1/29/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrInput the payroll for the Hills Garden Hotel to Quickbooks for the

period ending 1/15/16.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.20 15.00
75.00/hrProcessed payment for notary and overnighted document re Hills

Garden Hotel.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.90 67.50
75.00/hrReviewed and scanned bank statements to send to attorney. 

Provided instructions on professional fees paid by USFIA.

SUBTOTAL: [ 22.70 2,985.00]

Investor Relations                  

1/4/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.90 171.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence. Call with victim.

1/5/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 114.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

1/6/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrReview emails and correspondence from victims.

1/11/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.50 95.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.

1/13/2016 AJ Investor Relations 1.70 323.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence as well as mail collected from

135 Live Oak.

1/18/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrCalls with victims, provide status of case, etc. 

1/20/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.80 152.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.

1/21/2016 AJ Investor Relations 1.00 190.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.  Call with

several victims, provide status and future claims process.

Exhibit A, Page 11
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 4Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

1/22/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.50 95.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.

1/29/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 114.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.  Calls with victim that was

also a vendor. She had questions related to 1099, etc.

1/5/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved translation invoices. Email to translation company.

1/8/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrAssisted Matthew with Network Solutions billing questions re email

system and web hosting.

1/26/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrWorked on change to header picture on web site.

TM Investor Relations 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrUpdated web site to make it easier to see Chinese translations and

the original Court documents in English.

1/27/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER for new documents.

SUBTOTAL: [ 10.40 1,916.00]

Manage Business                  

1/1/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

1/4/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 1.80 288.00
160.00/hrReceived final sales report for 2015.  Created year over year analysis

for previous four years graphing key metrics.  Reviewed prior years
reports for month of January and created projections based on
performance of Q4 of 2015 compared to Q4 of 2012-2014.

1/8/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

Exhibit A, Page 12
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 5Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

1/10/2016 DC Manage Business 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrDrivetime to hotel billed at half.

DC Manage Business 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrDrivetime from hotel billed at half.

DC Manage Business 1.40 224.00
160.00/hrWalked property at hotel and reviewed. Looked for additional

encroachment by homeless population; met with employees.

1/11/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

1/12/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrSent email regarding need for early payroll figures due to holiday.

Incorporated language regarding employee raises due to raise in
minimum wage.  Created schedule and forwarded to manager.

DC Manage Business 1.20 192.00
160.00/hrReceived information regarding failed back flow test at the hotel

including report and photos.  Reviewed estimate to repair and
researched procedure and City ordinance regarding repair. 
Researched additional contractors to handle repair and forwarded
necessary information regarding repairs. Scheduled appointments for
additional quotes and relayed information to manager.

1/13/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed payroll numbers and forwarded to Alison Juroe for

processing.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrContacted additional contractor for bid on backflow testing. Reviewed

photos and discussed options. Scheduled appointment for Friday and
discussed payment options.

1/15/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrHad call with contractor after backflow inspection. Scheduled meeting.

1/17/2016 DC Manage Business 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrDrive time to hotel billed at half.

Exhibit A, Page 13
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 6Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

1/17/2016 DC Manage Business 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrDrive time from hotel billed at half.

DC Manage Business 1.40 224.00
160.00/hrPerformed routine check of property at hotel.  Checked on homeless

camps.

1/18/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed proposal from Charter communications re internet; respond

with additional questions.

1/19/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrReviewed multiple bids for completion and certification of back flow

equipment. Scheduled repair/replacement and gathered essential
paperwork. Multiple calls and emails to get proper insurance
certificates from service provider. Verified that certifications could be
performed and negotiated price.

1/20/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrHandled workers comp inquiry from Aprel Glass regarding network.

Forwarded information from policy.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReviewed deposit for hotel.

1/21/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.90 144.00
160.00/hrWorked on the business certificate application for Tom Seaman.

Contacted City clerk for answers to numerous questions.  Created file

Exhibit A, Page 14

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 91   Filed 08/01/16   Page 15 of 117   Page ID
 #:2334



Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 7Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

for Receiver and instructions and available days to complete app.

1/22/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

1/24/2016 DC Manage Business 1.40 224.00
160.00/hrPerformed routine check of property at hotel.  Inspected faulty back

flow test and damage. Checked on homeless camps.

DC Manage Business 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrDrive time to hotel billed at half.

DC Manage Business 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrDrive time from hotel billed at half.

1/25/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

1/26/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

1/27/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

1/28/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 1.40 224.00
160.00/hrMet with Sean Yarnell from Magnusson hotel to discuss history of

hotel, contract options, name change and eventual sale of hotel.
Received instruction on property management software and reviewed
sales history of hotel from time as Day's Inn to switch to Magnusson
(as Hills Garden Hotel). Set short tem goals and scheduled follow up
call for end of February.
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1/28/2016 DC Manage Business 1.20 192.00
160.00/hrReceived, printed and reviewed plans from Metro PCS for  fiber pull

occurring at hotel in February. Summarized and reviewed with
Receiver. Printed documents and scheduled notary. After signatures
obtained, FedExed documents to Crown Castle development and
informed them transaction complete and work can be scheduled. 
Informed hotel manager.

1/29/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

SUBTOTAL: [ 21.80 3,488.00]

Project Management              

1/5/2016 AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tim re Wells Fargo re accounts.

AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrEmail from Tim Hsu with subpoena production on Gainsborough. 

Reviewed production and comments from Tim.  

1/6/2016 AJ Project Management 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrMet with Tom re Gainsborough subpoena. Telephone call with  David.

AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReview emails from Tom and Ted re Gainsborough.  Review demand

letter draft.  

1/7/2016 AJ Project Management 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrReview mail and correspondence.

1/8/2016 AJ Project Management 1.40 266.00
190.00/hrReceived email from Tim re bank records produced.  Review records,

and respond with comments, additional items needed, etc.

1/11/2016 AJ Project Management 1.50 285.00
190.00/hrContinue to review banking records turned over.  

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from payroll processor.   Set reminders for important

deadlines, and forward to Darren re same.
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1/13/2016 AJ Project Management 0.50 95.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tom and Tim re status of tenants.  Call with Tim re same.

Review email from Tim with picture of property.

1/14/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tom re bank records, escrow payments, forensic

accounting.

1/15/2016 AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrEmail Darren re payroll hours needed.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReceived payroll numbers and forward to processor. Confer with Tom

to confirm employee hourly increase.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tim re running credit check on tenant.  Look up and

provide info re same.

AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReceived preliminary payroll amounts, received approval from Tom

and gave the go ahead to run.

AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrReview correspondence and messages from victims. Also open and

review incoming mail.

AJ Project Management 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tom re additions to real estate assets, consider actions

needed.

1/18/2016 AJ Project Management 1.60 304.00
190.00/hrReview mail and notices received.  Work on organizing paperwork,

documents and files.  

1/19/2016 AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReview emails from Ted re Judges ruling on ALLY.  Call with Tom re

same.

1/20/2016 AJ Project Management 0.90 171.00
190.00/hrReview email from Tim Hsu with additional items from East West

Bank.  Review same.

1/21/2016 AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrEmail from Darren re paystubs for hotel.  Email reports and stubs to

Darren, Matt, and Kristine.

AJ Project Management 0.60 114.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tom re Dominican Trip, discuss local counsel, etc.  Email

to Martin Kenney re same.
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1/22/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview message from David re former USFIA counsel.

AJ Project Management 1.80 342.00
190.00/hrReview email from Tim with subpoena production from Jade Escrow. 

Review records, and analyze banking records, as well. 

1/25/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrEmails and calls with Tim re running a credit check on potential

tenant.  

1/26/2016 AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tim and Tom re tenant application to rent.  Review

production received from vendor with Tom.  Forward email re same.

AJ Project Management 1.40 266.00
190.00/hrReview productions received, etc.

1/27/2016 AJ Project Management 3.20 608.00
190.00/hrReview data extracted from USFIA and Amkey databases.  Met with

Tom to discuss, and call with David re same.  Requested additional
data fields etc.  Reviewed screen shots received and worked on
processing the information with other back office reports located at
the Arcadia site.  

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrReview invoice from IT forensics team.

1/28/2016 AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrMet with Tom re list of actions needed and outline of game plan,

review real estate holdings, etc.

AJ Project Management 0.90 171.00
190.00/hrConference call re subpoena to receiver, and our response and

production to date.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrEmail from payroll processor re deadlines for next payroll.

AJ Project Management 1.50 285.00
190.00/hrReview email from Ted re efforts for USFIA to continue in foreign

countries.  Download info in email and research same.  

AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrWork on formatting entities list and email to Richard Robinson

pursuant to subpoena.  

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrEmail to payroll processor re getting payroll approval from Tom in my

absence.
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1/29/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrCall from Richard Robinson.  Answer questions related to accounting

firms services.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrEmail to Christine Yin and request information on additional entities

that she provided services for.

1/26/2016 TM Project Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrResearch on bead company. Located documents online and gave to

Tom.

1/27/2016 TM Project Management 1.70 280.50
165.00/hrDownloaded entity information from Secretary of State web site,

entered onto Master List.

1/29/2016 TM Project Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrDiscussed mail with Tom, prepared new letter for him re attorney's

input.

SUBTOTAL: [ 26.50 4,977.50]

Property Management           

1/4/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed Quail Ranch caretaker's weekly report. Scanned and

saved to files.

1/11/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed Quail Ranch caretaker's weekly report. Scanned and

saved to files.

1/18/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed Quail Ranch caretaker's weekly report. Scanned and

saved to files.

1/25/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed Quail Ranch caretaker's weekly report. Scanned and

saved to files.

1/5/2016 TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from tenant re water intrusion at Alhambra Gardens. Texts to

manager and handyman re things to be done. Replies and direction
to manager. Received photos of problem.
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1/5/2016 TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCalls and emails to vendors of telephony services to USFIA.

1/6/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail to contractor re need for rainwater run-off requirement. Call to

contractor to set up time for him to visit the property.

1/7/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices for utilities for Alhambra Gardens.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to security people and sent by email pictures and other

information.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReport from security re security issue and minor water damage.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrText and call from security re water leak in roof. Gathered keys for

padlock and fed ex'd them to security. Call to handyman re need for
roof drain check. Labeled sets of keys and stored additional.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to contractor and text re roof issue at Bradbury.

1/8/2016 TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from contractor and discussed jobs for three properties for minor

issues. Discussed potential need to pull permit for drain line at
Alhambra Gardens, minor roof leaks.  Discussed Sunday possibility to
view properties. Gathered pictures, and sent in email with list of
problems to check.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCalls to and from security guard re delivery of keys. Calls and texts to

handyman re time to check drains. Call to reschedule.

1/10/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from security re handyman visit to Live Oak re any potential drain

clog. Text to handyman with direction.

1/11/2016 TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrFilled out insurance papers.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed utilities bills for 135 E. Live Oak.

1/12/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed security at Oak Mountain and 135 E. Live Oak. Direction

from Tom re additional security.
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1/12/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrApproved invoices for utilities and landscaping at 135 E. Live Oak,

Lynd, Alhambra Gardens.

TM Property Management 1.40 231.00
165.00/hrFilled out additional insurance papers, made pdfs of information and

sent to broker.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to contractor re visits to properties for roof checks.

1/13/2016 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail to Hsu re chinese translation for demand to contact Receiver's

attorney re 30-day notice to quit. Reply re same. Gathered info to give
to tenant. Texts to contractor and locksmith.

TM Property Management 1.70 280.50
165.00/hrTravel to and from 919 Fairview, 4116 Lynd, 135 E. Live Oak,

Alhambra Gardens, and back.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrChecked if tenant had vacated at 919 Fairview. Spoke with person

who identified himself as next door neighbor. Call to Alison re same,
took down information, call to Hsu re same. Left previous notice at the
property with phone number for tenant to call Hsu immediately.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrChecked out if tenants in residence at 4050 Lynd and 4116 Lynd. Call

to Alison re same. Talked with nearby resident if he has seen anyone
at 4116 Lynd and took notes.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrWalked through 135 E. Live Oak to determine total amount of any

roof damage, attempted to get on roof but door unable to be opened. 
Took pictures of items related to golf course development to give to
Darren. Gathered items from property to take to office.

TM Property Management 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrArrived at Alhambra Gardens and discussed invoices to be sent to

me re repairs in various apartments. Reviewed need for trench work
on north side of property with handyman. Took pictures of problem
and noted distances needed for trenching. Discussed need for minor
gutter repair and additional downspout. Discussed if any solutions
can be found to install drain line from courtyard to alleyway. Gathered
rent checks, gathered laundry monies.
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1/13/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrLeft message with Whitfield re roof repairs.

1/14/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrGathered items from car and took up to office. Discussed mail issue,

creditors needing claims, with Receiver.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed golf course items found at Live Oak with Darren and

showed him pictures of graphical displays of plans for development.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived fire inspection notice, scanned and copied. LM with fire

department inspector re same. Entered contact information into
Outlook and phone.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail with pictures re needed work at Alhambra Gardens to

contractor showing wall, ceiling elements in need of repair. Loaded
pictures onto computer, compressed all for ease of emailing.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrFound information related to potential rent for 919 Fairview. Searched

internet for rental estimates, made spreadsheet and exhibits for Tom
to review.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMade copies and scans of checks and rental amounts.

1/15/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls to Storch re need for proposals. LM's.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with fire inspector and discussed issues in need of correction.

Gave him my contact information and timeline to complete work.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail to Whitfield re items requiring work per inspection.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved bid for trench on north side of apartment property.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from JP Morgan re mortgage payment. Email to Kristen for

pay-by-phone instructions. Took down contact information.

TM Property Management 1.40 231.00
165.00/hrSearch for credit report service for tenant checks. Found two web site

programs, spoke with Alison and found forms on credit reporting
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program. Made pdf, sent to tenant's attorney.

1/15/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed with Alison and Tom the personal property in storage at

Live Oak re possible auction.

1/18/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrSent accounting to attorney for Unlawful Detainer Action.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall with contractor re scheduling time to review all the stucco work

needed at Alhambra Gardens.

1/19/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from U/D attorney requesting receivership order. Emailed in

reply. Scanned engagement letter, asked Tom re same. Sent to
attorney.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to Storch re status of bids. Discussed occupancy and circuit

breakers. Wrote email reply and sent.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrResearched for lease info. Filled out 3-day notice, call to attorney and

advised to go with 60-Day Notice. Made notice and prepared for
attorney.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrReceived mail re dis-connect notice re Gilman Springs. Called and

discussed. Added Darren to call.

1/20/2016 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReview of U/D complaint sent from attorney on Fairview matter.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to Chase re mortgage payment. Email to Kristen re additional

charge and need to pay by phone in future.

TM Property Management 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrPrepared documents to send to the attorney for the U/D action for

4116 Lynd. Sent with instructions.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to apartment manager re check to cash for January rent.

1/21/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCompressed photos of various properties for sending in emails to

contractors re needed work with vendors.
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1/21/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText from apartment manager re check to cash for rent. Gave

appropriate check to Matthew for deposit.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReview of info from Matthew re overpayments re rent at Alhambra.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrMade new notices for all tenants at 849 Balboa. Sent.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrMade new notice for 4116 Lynd. Sent to tenant.

1/22/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from attorney re complaint out for service on 919 Fairview. 

Email to Receiver re same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall and email to insurance agent re property insurance.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall and LM with contractor re checking stucco work and roofs.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to SCE re bill. Edited tracking spreadsheet for utilities.

1/24/2016 TM Property Management 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrTravel to and from Alhambra Gardens Apartments and Bradbury

property; at half pay.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrMet with contractor re stucco work at AGA. Discussed landscaping

issue re drainage. Checked property for all stucco work needed. 
Discussed smoke alarms and carbon monoxide detector installation.
Met with manager and gathered laundry monies, discussed potential
vacancy in a month. Directed that potential tenant receive an
application, met with applicant.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrTexts and calls with handyman re installation of smoke alarm and

carbon monoxide detectors. Checked status of the trench work on
back side of property.

TM Property Management 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrChecked property and minor cleaning of kitchen area, removed

bottles from area to avoid earthquake problems. Checked property for
any evidence of roof work needed.

1/25/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from fire extinguisher service company, discussed pricing and

time to visit property.
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1/25/2016 TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrResearch into alarm needs, texted info to handyman. Discussed with

him pricing.

TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrCalls to HOA, numbers not working. Wrote letter to HOA re taxes, etc.

Numerous calls, Faxed letter to HOA. Calls to others in the same
building of HOA manager, no phones worked. Called cell phone of
agent in building.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrRan credit report for Tom re current tenant at 919 Fairview. Call to

credit company to re-set password. Text and call to Alison re same.
Entered info and ran report. Gave to Tom for review.

1/26/2016 TM Property Management 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrDiscussed with Tom the property tax issue at 919 Fairview. Emails to

and from HOA manager sending notice and getting guidance on
property tax. Made edit to letter, made pdf and sent via email.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to Storch re insurance.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls to and from handyman re smoke detectors and combos

needed. Sent text as well.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice for fire extinguisher work. Approved.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrChecked taxes on County web site.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrChecked Alhambra City web site for info on business license and

occupancy permit.

1/27/2016 TM Property Management 1.80 297.00
165.00/hrReceived application forms from agent, filled out and sent via email.

1/28/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls to inspector re fire extinguishers and need for time to complete

stucco work.  Left detailed message re all progress on three issues
and gave approximate completion time. Text to contractor re
completion and start time of project.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrRan reports to determine laundry revenues. Ran Quickbooks info re

same, entered onto spreadsheet.
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1/28/2016 TM Property Management 3.50 577.50
165.00/hrSent insurance info to broker. Multiple conversations re building

values, replacement costs, difficulty in underwriting, sent multiple
emails with property profiles and constructions information.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from handyman re water heater leak, text from manager.

Plumber called.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrChecked Alhambra web site to determine which type of business

license needed.

1/29/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from inspector re Alhambra Gardens and gave update and

approximate time of completion of tasks re stucco work and smoke
detectors. Discussed specific type of business license needed for the
property and discussed occupancy permit.

TM Property Management 2.70 445.50
165.00/hrGathered overhead photos of properties, compressed photos to send

to the insurance agent for several properties. Filled out forms for
coverage and returned all via email. Multiple calls to the agent with
additional info re finished square footage of clubhouse, types of
construction, etc. Multiple calls with agent, multiple emails. Discussed
replacement cost with Tom and forwarded best estimate to agent in
email with direction.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from security re mail. Had him send me an email with item.

Printed.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall to landscaper re meeting at property to discuss cleanup, weekly

maintenance, irrigation.  Finalized reduction in cost at 135 Live Oak
starting in February. Call to security re landscaping.

1/30/2016 TM Property Management 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrTravel to and from Bradbury; at half pay.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to security person to arrange meeting at Bradbury site. Call to

gatehouse re same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall and text with landscape maintenance person to meet at site.

TM Property Management 0.90 148.50
165.00/hrMet with security person re improving security. Checked utilities.

Found minor physical issue to fix, checked doors, windows. Checked
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lighting.

1/30/2016 TM Property Management 1.40 231.00
165.00/hrMet with new landscape maintenance for bid for cleanup, irrigation

equipment repair and weekly maintenance. Checked irrigation system
to better understand circuit box and three timer systems for irrigation. 
Discussed hillside issue and fescue maintenance with re-seeding and
fertilizer. Walked border of property to better understand scope of
work, need for pruning of roses and significant pruning around all
sprinkler heads in initial clean up. Arranged to have spare wood with
nails in them removed for safety reasons plus removal of empty water
bottle and box trash in garage.

SUBTOTAL: [ 46.10 7,600.50]

Receiver                                

1/4/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position.

1/5/2016 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrArrange access.

1/6/2016 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrReview subpoena production re Gainsborough, consider same and

options, email to demand turnover and need to approval to file
fraudulent conveyance action, also for other assets and funds, confer
with Alison re same, Telephone call with  David re same; also re
selling certain assets, forensic accounting

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David re AUSA questions.

1/8/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position 

1/11/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re East West production, Gainsborough mortgage

payoff with Ahome funds.

1/14/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrRead email from tenant's lawyer, confer with Tim re rents, prepare

email re conditions to staying, inform Unlawful detainer counsel.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re bank records, escrow payments, forensic

accounting.
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

1/16/2016 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrGive re direction re Quickbooks classes and accounting.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time from Arcadia.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer re payroll taxes on pre-receiver payroll paid just before

appointment, direct re payment and payroll tax returns.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re additions to real estate assets, consider actions

needed.

1/19/2016 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview Court ruling re ALLY, confer with Alison and Ted re same.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and execute Unlawful Detainer lawyer engagement letter.

1/20/2016 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position 

1/21/2016 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReceive email from Robert Hsu with credit application for Unlawful

Detainer tenant, application was sent ten days ago, review same,
direct Tim re running credit, review employment and income, call
employer, not a business, send email declining tenancy and not
granting extension in time to answer.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrConfer re Dominican assets and counsel, candidates re same.

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position.

1/25/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re unlawful detainer, tenant credit, next steps needed.

1/26/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ona, guard at Oak Mountain re access.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrSeries of emails with Robert Hsu re Unlawful Detainer, call purported

employer, review credit application, reply re guarantor, reply re
advance rent.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview New Sparkle production, note same address as former

employees new employer on credit app, review corporate information,
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Telephone call with Tim Hsu re additional information.

1/26/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re entity attorneys and waiver of

privilege.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview bead company direct Tim re information needed review

same, subpoena.

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re property tax issue re HOA.

1/27/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position for Hills

Garden.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position.

TAS Receiver 1.60 600.00
375.00/hrReview data extracted from USFIA and Amkey databases. Telephone

call with David J. and confer with Alison re same, and re additional
compilation.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David re privilege issues.

TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrReview books and records re Steamfont real estate, Qun Yan, HB

visa stuff, other.

1/28/2016 TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrConfer call re subpoena to receiver response and production.

TAS Receiver 3.60 1,350.00
375.00/hrPrepare list of actions needed and outline of game plan, review real

estate holding add actions needed to list, confer with Alison re details. 

SUBTOTAL: [ 15.00 5,625.00]

Receivership Administration  

1/28/2016 MRF Receivership Administration 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrReceived instructions from Thomas Seaman and forwarded executed

declaration to attorneys.  Prepared fedex of originals re same.

1/4/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReceived automatic reply to request for account info re National Bank

of California. Call to attorney representing bank, gathered contact info
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of additional attorney, sent email with request for information.

1/4/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Chase re our previous request re new entities.

TM Receivership Administration 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrFollow-up call to East West Bank re returned email. Got some contact

information and left message for person in risk management. Made
new letter to another bank and sent to their legal order processing
department. Email to Kristen re same. Received call from bank
representative and gathered new contact information from same.

1/5/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrRevised letter to bank, sent in email re freeze request. Followed up

with previous requests to banks.

TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Wells Fargo legal order processing requesting tax ID's.

TM Receivership Administration 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived reply from Wells Fargo re accounts. Discussed with Kristen

re Tax ID's. Discussed with Alison re same.

1/6/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Skyriver re equipment on site and what services provided.

TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to ATT to get LOA for discussion of services. Confirmed not a

cell phone account.

TM Receivership Administration 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall to security personnel re alarm system future requirements and

other security matters re other properties. Call to gate personnel re
same.

TM Receivership Administration 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrCalls with bank re need for additional notice re accounts. Made new

letter with extensive listing of entities and Court orders. Made copies
and delivered personnally.

1/7/2016 TM Receivership Administration 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrGathered items for insurance companies. Filled out forms.

Responded to emails from Storch. Call to Storch and discussed
vacant properties, use of properties, value of improvements.

TM Receivership Administration 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices for utilties for Live Oak.
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1/7/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to Cardenas at East West Bank re request letter.

TM Receivership Administration 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrScans of receipts of letters to banks. Attached to pdfs.

1/15/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail re need for tax ID's for searches at banks.

1/18/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDownloaded PACER documents into Pubdocs.

1/20/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrApproved security invoices.

1/21/2016 TM Receivership Administration 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrPrepared initial templates for form 56's.

1/29/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDownloaded item from PACER.

SUBTOTAL: [ 7.40 1,194.00]

Research files                        

1/12/2016 AJ Research files 2.30 437.00
190.00/hrContinue to review records, documents and files.  Emails to counsel

re same.  

1/14/2016 AJ Research files 1.70 323.00
190.00/hrContinue to review bank and other records turned over pursuant to

subpoenas, etc.  Look up property and title info, etc. 

SUBTOTAL: [ 4.00 760.00]

For professional services rendered $28,546.00153.90

Balance due $28,546.00
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Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA  92614

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen

July 09, 2016

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11175

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

2/29/2016 AJ Accounting & Reporting 1.10 209.00
190.00/hrReceived request from Tom re number of accounts frozen initially and

additional accounts located.  Ran reports and provided figures to Tom.

2/1/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.80 270.00
150.00/hrRan and sent 1099s for both Hills Garden and USFIA.  Called to get

several missing W-9s.

2/4/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.80 420.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

2/5/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.60 240.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

2/9/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 4.30 645.00
150.00/hrHad meeting with TSC staff and Allen Matkins Attorneys (2.5 hrs)

Reviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,
and mailed out (1.8 hrs).

2/10/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 5.30 795.00
150.00/hrTSC staff meeting, did USFIA bank recons, entered Hills Garden

deposits, working with Mark Doucet and Tom to get brokered CD
account open.

Exhibit A, Page 32

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 91   Filed 08/01/16   Page 33 of 117   Page ID
 #:2352



Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 2Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

2/11/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 4.80 720.00
150.00/hrWorking on Hills Garden bank recons, fixed entries, reconciled

turnover from Central Payments to daily deposits, posted Accounts
receivable, entered hotel revenue. Reviewed Accounts payable
invoices, cut checks, had Tom review, and mailed out.

2/12/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 4.60 690.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, finishing Hills Garden bank recons, emailed Aprel
regarding transactions we did not have.

2/15/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.20 330.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.  

2/17/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.20 180.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out. Entered Hills daily transactions.

2/18/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.30 345.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out. Working with Mark at WF Advisors to get brokered
CD's account open.

2/22/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.20 30.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

2/23/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.60 240.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

2/24/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.80 270.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

2/26/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.20 180.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

2/29/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.60 90.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

2/1/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 30.00
75.00/hrAssisted with processing and sending the 2015 Form 1099s to

eligible vendors.

2/2/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.30 97.50
75.00/hrSpoke with Tim Hsu re New Sparkle payments and sent copy of

check register.  Located payment schedule re professional fees and
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

spoke with Thomas Seaman re same.

2/3/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 37.50
75.00/hrRan documents and sent invoice sample to Tim Hsu along with

corporate information re New Sparkle.

2/5/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrInput the Hills Garden Hotel payroll for 1/31/16 to  Quickbooks.

2/8/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrResponded to email from Tim Hsu re check copies.  Reviewed fedex

return re notice to Taiwan.

2/9/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 3.30 247.50
75.00/hrAttended status meeting with Allen Matkins re Chen Receivership. 

Discussed records recovered and additional steps to recover assets,
perform a forensic accounting, and identify investors.

2/10/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 30.00
75.00/hrStaff meeting re requests for bank statements to perform a forensic

accounting, recovery of assets, and professional fees paid
pre-receiver.

2/16/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrDeposited and made the accompanying entries to Quickbooks for

rental payments and laundry coin received.  Additionally, sorted bank
statements on hand.

2/19/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.10 157.50
75.00/hrInput statement charges to Quickbooks for February's Alhambra

apartment rents.  Received and deposited rent checks.  Generated
report of exceptions to review with Tim McDonnell.

2/26/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrDeposited and made the accompanying accounting entries for rental

payments received.

2/29/2016 TM Accounting & Reporting 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrAssistance with fee app. Made spreadsheet from report.

SUBTOTAL: [ 47.50 6,438.50]

Investor Relations                  

2/8/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.80 152.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

2/15/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.80 152.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence. Calls with victims.

2/19/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 114.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.  

2/21/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.50 95.00
190.00/hrReview emails from victim, including you tube video, etc.  Forward to

Tom with note re same.

2/24/2016 AJ Investor Relations 1.30 247.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.  Forward email to Tom re

same.  Request he prepare letter to the victims with an update on
case.

2/25/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

2/26/2016 AJ Investor Relations 1.60 304.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.

2/5/2016 CM Investor Relations 2.30 138.00
60.00/hrOpened and sorted all mail.

2/23/2016 TM Investor Relations 3.20 528.00
165.00/hrCall from Alison re trouble with Constant Contact. Got onto site to

determine why problem continues with sign ups for different countries.

2/24/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrFurther updates to web site to ease signing up for email updates.

Updated both the English and Chinese sides. Added spacing for the
dialogue boxes for email signups to show more of the identification
items to enter. Copied over html used on the English side to the
Chinese side.

2/26/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived status report to post to web site.

2/27/2016 TM Investor Relations 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrSent translation request to translator. Posted items to web site.

2/29/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from translator with questions re translations to be performed.

Replied re same.

SUBTOTAL: [ 13.40 2,114.50]

Manage Business                  

2/1/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
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160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for
hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

2/1/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

2/2/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed and completed payroll for Hills Garden Hotel. Checked

numbers vs. last year. Sent to payroll company for processing and to
Tom Seaman for approval.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReview invoice for plumbing work and approved after calling vendor

and double checking with hotel.

DC Manage Business 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrMet with Tom Seaman regarding deadline for paying business license

permit with City of San Bernardino. Exchanged emails and
documents with hotel to insure all documentation was complete.
Verified with City Clerk, compiled documents and passed to Tom
Seaman with instruction; requested check for payment.

2/3/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrFinal check of file before Receiver's meeting with San Bernardino City

Clerk.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrContacted Aprel Glass to meet Receiver at City Hall for completion of

paperwork.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReceived completed paperwork back from Receiver. Reviewed,

scanned to document storage and filed originals.

2/4/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed adjustments to January revenue and deposit statement.

Saved to files and forwarded to Kristen Janulewicz.
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2/4/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived phone call from plumber regarding bill; check with

accountant and call plumber back with timing.

2/5/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

2/7/2016 DC Manage Business 0.80 128.00
160.00/hrReceived email from hotel manager. Unruly guest threatening to

contact Police and Yelp regarding service at hotel. Asked manager
for background of incident and reviewed options. Instructed manager
to proceed as usual regarding incident report and take a wait and see
approach.

2/8/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

2/9/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed statement from Merchant Services for Hills Garden and

inquired into cost of canceling account. Penalty for canceling is less
than taking contract to term so gave go ahead to cancel the account.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

2/10/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

2/11/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.
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2/12/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills and expenses from Aprel Glass at hotel and forwarded

to accounting.

2/15/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

2/16/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills and expenses from Aprel Glass at hotel and forwarded

to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed reports sent by PMS1 and Magunsson regarding internet

reservations of third party vendors.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed payroll hours; approved.

DC Manage Business 0.80 128.00
160.00/hrReceived list of questions from Ted Fates sent by Bird Marella

regarding RAID rebuild assistance.  Reviewed requests and
forwarded to BRG and Dan Pryor. Had conference all to determine
most effective way to answer questions.  St meeting at USFIA offices
to review server information.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrSent response to Ted Fates after conference call with IT staff

regarding RAID rebuild info.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived and responded to questions from BRG regarding RAID;

forwarded to Dan Pryor.
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2/16/2016 DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrForwarded Dan Pryor's questions regarding RAID.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReviewed Magnuson invoice.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed reports from Sean Yarnell and PMS 1 for room

reservations.

2/17/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed reports from Sean Yarnell and PMS 1 for room

reservations.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills from SkyRiver for hotel internet access. Sent copy of

revised contract and bill to Skyriver to inquire about difference. Had
call and resolved charges; instructed Kristen Janulewicz on payment
amount and bill going forward.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrSent pay stubs to Aprel at hotel.

2/18/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReviewed Shift 4 report.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed unpaid bills spreadsheet from Heidi Gong; discussed with

Kristen Janulewicz.

2/19/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.
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2/22/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReceived FedEx package from Angela Roque at Crown Castle

regarding paperwork for work to be done at cell tower at hotel. Had
conference call.

2/23/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

2/24/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReviewed payroll email from Alison Juroe; notified hotel manager of

deadline for figures.

2/25/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReceived application for San Bernardino Chamber of Commerce;

reviewed application, website and fees.  Approved and notified
Kristen Janulewicz and hotel manager.

2/26/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills and expenses from Aprel Glass at hotel and forwarded

to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

2/28/2016 DC Manage Business 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrTravel time to hotel.
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2/28/2016 DC Manage Business 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrTravel time from hotel.

DC Manage Business 2.00 320.00
160.00/hrWent to hotel to review operations and talk with employees. Walked

property to check for vandalism. Checked updates on computers and
checked general appearance and cleanliness.

2/29/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed payroll figures and approved hours.

SUBTOTAL: [ 20.50 3,280.00]

Project Management              

2/8/2016 AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReview emails re Amkey Global database access disabled.  Email to

David re contacting 3rd party to resolve. 

2/9/2016 AJ Project Management 0.60 114.00
190.00/hrReview Game plan for meeting.  Review documents, and prepare for

meeting.

AJ Project Management 3.30 627.00
190.00/hrCase status meeting with team to review game plan and receive

assignments, etc.

AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrCall with Andrea at Allen Matkins.  Locate items discussed related to

Dominican entity.  Scan and email same.

AJ Project Management 1.80 342.00
190.00/hrReviewing banking files, to locate additional subpoenas to be issued. 

Confer with Tom re Mexico factory.

2/10/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrStaff meeting re real estate sales, emails, pending matters.
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2/11/2016 AJ Project Management 1.00 190.00
190.00/hrResearch property purchases, etc.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrCall with Andrea re Dominican Republic efforts.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrEmails with former employee from USFIA.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrFollow up email to former accountant for Chen re entities represented.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrEmail from payroll processor re Hotel payroll deadlines.

AJ Project Management 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrEmails with David re Amkey Global database, etc.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrEmails with Tim Hsu and Tim McDonnell re subpoenas to issue.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrSet up meeting with Tom and IT person for Tuesday.

2/12/2016 AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrReview mail and respond to notices.  Confer with Tim and Darren re

same.   Review cell tower money received with Kristen. Discuss cell
towers with Tom and Darren.  

AJ Project Management 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrSearch for info needed for demand letters and subpoenas.  Email to

Tim Hsu.  Call with Tim Hsu re same.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrEmails to/ from Andrea re progress on hiring local counsel in the

Dominican Republic.  Confer with Tom re same.

AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrEmails with Amkey Global 3rd party cloud host. Met with Tom to

discuss.  Confer with Darren re him taking over and getting access to
copy data, etc.

2/15/2016 AJ Project Management 1.60 304.00
190.00/hrReview mail and process notices, etc.  Look up address for returned

W-2's.  
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2/16/2016 AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to and from Arcadia.

AJ Project Management 6.80 1,292.00
190.00/hrMeeting at Chen to review back office with former IT employee and

others.  Also continue to review records and files.

2/17/2016 AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReview payroll report and email to Christine at Allied Accounting for

processing.  Received preliminary payroll and reviewed, Sent to Tom
for final approval and advised Christine to process final.  

AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReview messages from Andrea re efforts with bank in Dom. R.  

Forward to Tom for his review as well. 

AJ Project Management 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrReview email from David Jimenez with list of email accounts

requested.  Compare to others located.

2/18/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrEmails with the DOJ re turnover of records pursuant to subpoena.

AJ Project Management 0.60 114.00
190.00/hrEmails with David Jimenez re additional emails located, etc.  

Attempts to access, etc.

AJ Project Management 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrReview draft of Toms report.  Call with Tom to discuss same.

AJ Project Management 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrEmail to Andrea re go ahead with filing in Dominican.

2/22/2016 AJ Project Management 2.60 494.00
190.00/hrReview report from BRG with list of USFIA victims.  Run analysis, and

test various investor accounts, etc.  Confer with Tom re same. 
Review emails from Tom and David.  Call with David to discuss report
and fields utilized.  He will revise and resend.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tom re retaining counsel in the Dominican Republic. 

Advise emails sent re same.  

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrConfer with Matthew and Tom re vehicle purchases.  Confer with

Darren re same.
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2/23/2016 AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrCall with Andrea re decision on counsel.   

AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReview email from DOJ, get Tom's signature and scan and email

back to Justin re approval to copy emails pursuant to subpoena.

AJ Project Management 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tom re Dominican counsel.  Call with Andrea and Tom to

discuss.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tim re issues for foreign victims to register on constant

contact.   

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from Andrea to Domincan attorney regarding our

request to retain them, billing instructions, etc.

AJ Project Management 0.90 171.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

AJ Project Management 3.70 703.00
190.00/hrReview revised report received from BRG re USFIA victims.  Save

and begin to review.  Confer with Tom re same.  Research largest
member ID.  Call with David re additional items and reports needed. 
Email Tom re same.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrCall from Rich Robinson, forward to Tom. Confer with Tom re same.

2/24/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview emails from Andrea and Lucas re engagement, and scope of

work on Dominican matter.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from Tim Hsu re location of rifles.

2/25/2016 AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrSend email to Darren re deadline for submitting hotel payroll.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tom re email from Tim re rifles located and steps needed

to turnover to Receiver.

AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tim re guns, and conference with security and dealer. 

Advise Tim need to research before proceeding.  Confer with Tom re
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same.

2/25/2016 AJ Project Management 4.20 798.00
190.00/hrResearch gun models, local dealers, CA law re possession and sale

of rifles, etc.  Calls with Wallie to get serial numbers, etc.  Confer with
Tom re findings.  Meet with Darren and provide paperwork and
discuss steps needed to get them turned over, and various options for
selling, consigning, auctioning, etc. 

2/26/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from Ted related to Chen's counsels response to

subpoena's received from DOJ. 

2/29/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview emails from Andrea and Lucas re follow up on engagement

letter, etc.

AJ Project Management 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrReview email from Ted regarding employee request for W-2. 

Research files and locate copy from one entity.  Review info from
accounting firm and call Christine to discuss W-2's for Amkey Global. 
Provide direction to process the final payroll reports etc.  Discuss that
Mo Chen had called her in Oct and given instruction not to run any
payroll, etc.  He called in Jan to request W-2 and she reminded him
that he had told her not to do anything.  Provide Tom with update. 
Email to Ted the copy of W-2 we have. 

AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrReceived and reviewed additional reports requested from David

Jimenez with additional metrics run on the USFIA back office victims. 
Confer with Tom re same. 

AJ Project Management 0.80 152.00
190.00/hrReview bank account matrix and update info on certain accounts. 

Confer with Matthew re additional files to include, location of records
etc.  Confer with Tom re same.

2/2/2016 DC Project Management 0.70 112.00
160.00/hrSearched for missing Quickbooks entries relating to email Matthew

Flahive received from Tim Hsu. Looked in multiple copies of
Quickbooks and reviewed bank statements received from BofA to
locate payments to Sparkle Gems. Reviewed Arizona state filings for
Sparkle Gems, printed and filed.

2/8/2016 DC Project Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed forwarded voicemail from Tom Seaman regarding FedEx

shipment. Logged into FedEx and contacted customer service.
Relayed information to Matthew Flahive for further follow up.
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2/8/2016 DC Project Management 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrReview, research and respond to emails regarding New Sparkle from

Tim Hsu and Matthew Flahive.

2/9/2016 DC Project Management 3.30 528.00
160.00/hrStrategy meeting with Allen Matkins to discuss entirety of case so far,

discuss options and determine pressing to do items, assignment and
deadlines for each.

2/11/2016 DC Project Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrConference call with Ted Fates, Bird Morella,  and Dan Pryor

regarding hard drives and RAID array.

DC Project Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrHad call with David Jiminez from BRG regarding RAID issues and

meeting next week.

DC Project Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReceived email from Charles Carmona at Guild Laboratories inquiring

about payment for letter and report he wrote regarding value of
jewels. Asked for second invoice; relayed to Receiver for approval
and passed to accounting for payment.

DC Project Management 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrHad follow up call with Dan Pryor regarding earlier call with Bird

Marella. Discussed the issues with the RAID configuration and
possible dates for trip to Arcadia offices.

DC Project Management 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrRelayed questions to Tom Seaman to ask Eric (IT) from USFIA

regarding server information.

2/12/2016 DC Project Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrCompleted Department of Labor Information for Amkey Inc. 

Research, file online, print and scan for files.

DC Project Management 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrContact ByDesign website re Amkey Global hosting. Had conference

call to discuss gaining access to site and function and operation of
the site. Listed documents necessary to provide in order to gain
access.

DC Project Management 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrSent necessary documents to ByDesign to gain access to multi level

marketing site for Amkey Golbal.

DC Project Management 0.90 144.00
160.00/hrMade multiple calls regarding cell phone towers. Looked for

documentation in physical files and on servers for payments from
lessees. Called caretaker at golf course to get information physically
located on tower enclosures. Gave instruction to caretaker to get
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specifics from maintenance crew when servicing is completed.
Received info from caretaker and looked up leasing companies online
for further investigation.

2/17/2016 DC Project Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReceived updates from BRG and Dan Pryor. Confirmed Friday

meeting and sent updates to Ted Fates regarding RAID progress.

2/19/2016 DC Project Management 0.50 80.00
160.00/hrTravel to Arcadia office billed at half.

DC Project Management 0.50 80.00
160.00/hrTravel from Arcadia office billed at half.

DC Project Management 3.40 544.00
160.00/hrMet with David Jimenez from BRG and Dan Pryor from OC

Networking and spent late morning and early afternoon at Arcadia
office assisting with questions related to RAID array specifics on
certain servers.  Rebooted multiple servers and wrote down specific
server settings from BIOS of each server.  Discussed multiple ways to
get individually copied disks in a RAID array to function as regular
server.  Tested multiple scenarios with VMWare.

DC Project Management 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrWrote report on status of RAID arrays and sent screen shots of each

BIOS to Ted Fates to relay to Bird Marella regarding getting RAID to
function for discovery purposes.

2/21/2016 DC Project Management 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrWent to South Coast Plaza to Bloomingdales for meeting with

manager regarding legitimacy of Louis Vuiton bags from Arcadia
office and options for resale.

2/24/2016 DC Project Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrHad conference call with Todd Stefan re Bird Marella discovery

assistance.

DC Project Management 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrSent email to Dan Pryor and David Jimenez re Todd Stefan and Bird

Marella discovery assistance.

2/26/2016 DC Project Management 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrHad additional call with By Design regarding MLM website

functionality.

DC Project Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrScanned and sent additional information on new email boxes to David

Jimenez to find on servers.  Looked up domain on GoDaddy to
determine registration and ownership.
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2/2/2016 TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDelivered notice to post office and discussed problem, gathered

contact information of Postmaster.

2/3/2016 TM Project Management 2.10 346.50
165.00/hrOpened mail from offices. Added info to master list, discussed with

Tom items found of potential relationships and entities. Discussed
with Darren. Research on entities, gathered info from State web site
and other sites. Saved on document.

2/4/2016 TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to Hsu re need for subpoena, discussed with Tom re same.

2/5/2016 TM Project Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrOpened mail and sorted for insurance, attorneys, mail for ex-tenant,

etc.

2/8/2016 TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to Hsu re preparing for subpoenas. Discussed other entities,

state database issues.

TM Project Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrReview of mail.

2/9/2016 TM Project Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrOpened mail and sorted.

TM Project Management 3.00 495.00
165.00/hrMeeting with attorneys re USFIA case. Discussed asset sales,

insurance, documentation, etc.

2/11/2016 TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrSent copies of previous Post Office Change Of Address Requests to

Tim Hsu for subpoena.

TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Hsu re addresses for entities and person. Discussed with

Alison, email to Alison.

2/15/2016 TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed responses to interrogatories. Gave to Tom for his review.

2/16/2016 TM Project Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCalls from Tom re address of entity. Checked records on table and

Outlook.
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2/16/2016 TM Project Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrTransferred vacant land data to master list.

2/17/2016 TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrOpened mail and checked entity names associated with recipients on

Secretary of State web site. Question from Tom re security at Live
Oak. Question to Tom re entity name.

2/22/2016 TM Project Management 1.80 297.00
165.00/hrEntered vacant land info onto master list. Search for additional parcel

number listed on grant deed. Located info on assessor web site.
Downloaded additional grant deed info.  Printed copies for Darren re
getting listing brokers.

TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDiscussed broker search, info for brokers and properties with Darren

and Cindy.

2/24/2016 TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEdits to Master List and printed list of property to sell for Darren.

TM Project Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMet with Alison re mail received at Live Oak and investigated with

her. Updated Master List with info.

SUBTOTAL: [ 70.10 12,528.00]

Property Management           

2/1/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed Quail Ranch caretaker's weekly report. Scanned and

saved to files.

2/8/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed Quail Ranch caretaker's weekly report. Scanned and

saved to files.

2/15/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed Quail Ranch caretaker's weekly report. Scanned and

saved to files.

2/22/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrHad call with Mike Schwabe regarding insurance inspection for Quail

Ranch golf course land.  Set inspection date and answered questions.

DC Property Management 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrCalled caretaker and texted appointment time for insurance

inspection.
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2/22/2016 DC Property Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrHad conference call with Merri Terrill regarding leasing Quail Ranch

property on a monthly basis for medical/military support training.
Discussed pricing options, timing, and reviewed their website.

2/23/2016 DC Property Management 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrSpent time researching and searching for additional information on

1st and second cell tower rental for Quail Hills. Made multiple phone
calls, internet searches, and reviewed Quickbooks payments.

2/24/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrHad meeting with Tom Seaman regarding renting out golf course and

had follow up call with possible renter.

DC Property Management 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrTexted caretaker regarding property rental after meeting with Tom

Seaman.

2/25/2016 DC Property Management 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrHad phone call with Jessica Almekies from SBA Site regarding

payments for cell tower land lease. Sent preliminary injunction; got an
accounting of monies owed and set call for morning.

2/29/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReceived confirmation that paperwork approved and hold released

for cell tower payments. Printed change of address form, obtained
signature from receiver, scanned and sent to SBA Site.

DC Property Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrHad follow up call with Mike Schwabe after inspection of golf course

property.  Emailed info on all of land parcels and answered other
questions.

2/1/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to gatehouse re security, pool.

TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrEmail to Warlin re insurance re difference in price of occupied vs.

vacant. Call with Warlin re initial offer, discussed need for higher
valuation per square footage and if other efforts could lower price.
Calls to and from agent re property. Bound coverage, prepared letter
for agent, sent via email.

2/2/2016 TM Property Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrCall to Pool cleaner and arranged time to meet at Oak Mountain. Met

with pool cleaner, started pool equipment and discussed needed
equipment repairs re water squirting from pump. Approved cut out of
piping to more easily remove pump for re-build, cleaning and
re-installation. Discussed need for filter care and possible costs once
unlocked. Discussed water quality and told it is ok. Gave approval to
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begin work on Friday, call to Burrtec re getting green waste bin for
leave by Friday morning. Discussed what could be done if bin not
delivered in time for pool cleaner. Gave direction re start of account,
invoice info, need for insurance cert, etc.

2/2/2016 TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrCall to House cleaner and arranged time to start working at Oak

Mountain. Call to gatehouse to arrange entry. Met with cleaner and
gave direction on refrigerator, floor, dusting, removal of any trash, etc.
Swept floors, etc. I assisted in floors and trash pick up. Arranged for
cleaner to take away trash.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall to Locksmith and arranged meeting at Oak Mountain. Call to

gatehouse to arrange entry. Met him and got duplicates made,
garage door re-keyed, entry from garage re-keyed.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrInsurance docs signed. Sent and call to Warlin re same.

TM Property Management 1.60 264.00
165.00/hrTravel to Oak Mountain, then 135 E. Live Oak, then Oak Mountain,

and back; at half pay.

TM Property Management 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrCall to landscaper to determine time he began. Gave direction.  Met

with landscaper and reviewed cleanup. Direction on lumber removal
and pruning of rose bushes, clean up of broken patio furniture, clean
up of area around pool pump equipment. Reviewed removal of
leaves, ornamental grasses on border of property. Gave direction re
dead branches of evergreen tree on slop near driveway. I picked up
ribbon materials left in flower areas. Discussed timers as ground was
clearly wet and gave approval to reduce one watering day this week.
Direction re removal of trash from garage.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with Warlin re insurance requirements. Discussed golf course.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrPicked up mail at 135 E. Live Oak. Discussed roof issue with security

guard.

TM Property Management 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrReview of balcony leak, checked upstairs to find any other source of

water leak. Took pictures, emailed to contractor. Call to contractor
and discussed immediate need for repair of minor leak and how I
think the water is entering.

2/3/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCalls to and from potential tenant. Reviewed application, discussed

need for income verification. Prepared to run credit check.
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2/3/2016 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCalls to and from insurance agent and discussed size of sheds,

fencing, potential ponds, other items related to getting quote.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMade key labels.

2/4/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Burrtec and arranged bin for Oak Mountain.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to Postmaster re changes of address. Discussed need for

subpoena re other change of address forms.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrLabeled numerous sents of keys for properties.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from Whitfield, edits to photos, sent info re balcony leak.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to pool maintenance person re insurance, invoices, etc.

Received email with cert.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from potential tenant re getting additional income verification.

Email from apartment manager re other tenant that wishes to switch
units.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to agent re quote, email from same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Huron re trial date for U/D re Fairview.

2/5/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from handyman re invoice, need to start with detectors

installation. Text to manager re same.

TM Property Management 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrFilled out application forms for HACLA. Sent. Follow-up call and LM

re same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to Warlin re quote.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from pool maintenance re work performed at 345 Oak Mountain,

re corroded plate replacement, filters in good shape and system
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working now.

2/5/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived insurance cert for pool maintenance. Replied re need for

address change.

TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrFilled out application forms for HACLA. Sent via email.

2/8/2016 TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrCall from HACLA requesting additional documents, gathered, sent via

email with extensive notation for ease of understanding.

TM Property Management 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrEmails from Warlin, filled out vacant property form, emailed to agent.

Call from Warlin re same and made small change to clarify number of
buildings and square footage, construction, etc.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReview of trial notice re U/D action. Prepared for Tom.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmail from Warlin re quote, reviewed, call to agent re need or revised

acreage amounts.

2/9/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from insurance agent for pool services. Reviewed new cert.

Email to agent to change name of city. Received new cert and saved.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrReceived quote from agent and reviewed. Prepared for Tom's

signature. Sent to agent. Made ""No Loss"" letter for Receiver and
sent.  Calls from agent re same and discussed needed language for
letter.

2/10/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmails from agent re invoices. Reviewed and submitted. Email to

agent re status of previously sent check and upcoming checks.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails to Warlin re quote on vacant land.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from house cleaner re invoice. Approved and submitted. Email to

cleaner re W-9.
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2/11/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived W-9 for house cleaner and submitted.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived utilities invoices, entered info onto tracking spreadsheet,

approved, gave to Kristen for payment.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from insurance agent re mortgagees, investigated, replied re

same.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrText to handyman re installation of alarms. Call from same and

scheduled weekend work and reiterated need for writing install date
on alarm. Also discussed potential plumbing issues with upcoming
vacant unit. Asked for pictures.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail with three questions to Huron re upcoming U/D Trial re

Fairview property. Response from same re Receiver needed at trial.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from insurance agent re quote re San Bernardino County. 

Discussed and bound.  Discussed any potential upcoming properties
and items to send to insurance companies.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from security guard re visitors to Live Oak. Brought Tom and

Alison in on call.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrOnline search for roof contractor. Call and LM.

2/12/2016 TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrReceived insurance proposal, prepared for Tom, gathered signatures,

scanned and sent to broker. Made ""No Loss"" letter, sent via email.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrReceived email with additional insurance form. Filled out, gathered

signature, scanned and sent back to agent re Rancho Cucamonga.

TM Property Management 0.90 148.50
165.00/hrApproved invoices for Alhambra Gardens. Reviewed previous

invoices, started process payment on trench work.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrOnline search for roof contractor. Calls, LM.

2/13/2016 TM Property Management 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrOnline search for roof contractor. Entered into Outlook and onto cell

phone 12 contractors from BBB.
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2/13/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrGathered info for smoke detector installation.

TM Property Management 1.40 231.00
165.00/hrTravel to Alhambra, Arcadia, and back; at half pay.

TM Property Management 1.70 280.50
165.00/hrVisit to Alhambra Gardens. Reviewed work done on vacating unit. 

Discussed with potential tenant need for additional income
verification. Checked work on trench on back of property. Discussed
with handyman the importance of writing installation date on all
smoke alarms. Reviewed what could be done to remove rainwater
from courtyard. Checked balcony decking. Checked if work was
started on portico stucco. Reimbursed manager for purchases for
equipment. Gathered rent checks.  Took pictures of work needed
done at property.  Gathered laundry monies.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrVisit to Live Oak. Picked up mail.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCalls to roof contractors. LM with several.

2/14/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Alhambra Roofing and discussed earliest time to get

estimate, type of construction, size of job.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrMade copies and scans of rent checks. Delivered laundry coinage.

2/15/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from Stone Roofing re setting up time for estimator. Discussed

addresses and type of construction, size of jobs. Set up appointment.
Call to security to set up morning visit to check roof at Live Oak. Call
back to roof estimator re item needed to open roof door.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to Whitfield re balcony issue re type of covering, materials

needed.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrRead email from Oak Mountain pool cleaner, replied re appropriate

name to be used on invoices. Printed monthly invoice and approved
and turned into accounting. Call from pool cleaner re W-9 and lack of
line item for pump re-build which I had expected. Extensive search of
previous emails to determine if one had been missed. Nothing found. 
Forwarded his statement to him for him to review his automated
billing program, he said he would send W-9 tonight with revised bill.
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Spoke to Kristen re same.

2/15/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrChecked insurance emails to make sure all materials have been

turned in and filed.

TM Property Management 0.90 148.50
165.00/hrCall from potential tenant. Discussed needed items for income

verification. Email to same. Received email re items. Call from
potential tenant re difficulty to gather documents due to cash
payments. Asked for bank account info. Received email with
spreadsheet of banking info. Reviewed.

TM Property Management 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrCalls to multiple roofers and left messages, set up appointments with

two. Discussed other repair work.  Looked up repair materials on
Home Depot site to determine if minor repairs can be made for limited
monies.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrVoicemail from Hsu re guns. Call to security re same. LM with Hsu

and email re same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed minor roof leak and status with Tom.

2/16/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to security to prepare him for roof inspection.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from Dowd Roofing that they don't do balcony work. Suggested

other company. Searched for contact information.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCalled vendor to replace glass in fire extinguisher boxes.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from potential tenant re new roommate for additional credit

check. Requested income verification info be sent by text.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrPut in info from last several laundry revenue journal entries onto

spreadsheet.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCalls from handyman doing alarm installation.  Determined that the

wrong kind were delivered and that they were interconnected and
meant for free-standing single family homes, not apartments. Texts to
handyman. Requested he take them back and exchange for correct
type for apartments. Checked online for suitable replacements and
sent hyperlinks of others. Determined the kind needed isn't sold in the
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stores, only online and we initiated the replacement.

2/16/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived pictures from security re roof status at Live Oak, added to

pubdocs. Printed for file.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from roofing company that they don't work on balconies.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrText to handyman re drains and broken tile. Call to roofing and

balcony company to confirm appointment.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCalls from potential tenants and texts with income verification

documents. Made into pdfs and stored in files.

2/17/2016 TM Property Management 1.70 280.50
165.00/hrTravel time to Oak Mountain, Balboa, Live Oak, and back to TSC; at

half pay.

TM Property Management 2.10 346.50
165.00/hrMet with handyman at Oak Mountain property and had drainpipes

snaked to remove all clutter. Extensively broomed the three balconies
to remove dirt, leaves, trash and took pictures of small cracks.
Investigated if any noticeable water intrusion below. Noticed water
intrusion in outside patio area and took pictures. Discussed with
handyman about previously missing roof tiles and had him point out
one area where a tile is possibly missing. Discussed previous
landscape work, when flowers were planted. Checked to find where
the Burrtec greenwaste bin is at but could not find. Asked gatehouse
personnel if bins are allowed in the community or if we are to use the
bins that are along roads. Calls to roofing company to determine if
their estimator was going to arrive but was told he called in sick today
and he would need to reschedule. Discussed with handyman work
needed in apartment which is opening up.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrTook exterior street pictures of Balboa property.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrVisit to Live Oak property. Went onto roof to familiarize myself with

issues concerning roof. Call from gatehouse personnel at Oak
Mountain re Burrtec. Took pictures of roof area. Went through
property to find any additional water intrusion. Picked up mail.
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2/17/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved invoices for security services.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from worker re needed clean up of Apt. U. Asked for specific

proposal with line items.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from pool maintenance person re W-9. Saved in pubdocs and

printed for Kristen.

2/18/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Huron re substitute attorney and ex parte actions to stop

the U/D action at Fairview. Research on attorney, email to same to
get additional contact info.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrTexts to contractor re need to review three balconies instead of one.

Texted picture.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrMade files of takeover through U/D action re Fairview for Tom's Court

hearing tomorrow. Email to and from attorney.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived brush fire standard notice of upcoming inspections for

properties in Bradbury. Read. Discussed similar issue re golf course
property with Darren. Asked for contact info of vendor used at golf
course. Text to landscaper re same.  Took picture of notice to send to
landscaper at Oak Mountain.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Tom re reducing gas utilities at Live Oak. Gathered past

bills and entered amounts onto spreadsheet. Sent to security service
with instructions to locate appropriate meters.

2/20/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText from contractor, replied re set up of appointment. Call to

gatehouse to arrange entry at Oak Mountain.

2/21/2016 TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrTravel to and from Oak Mountain Road property; at half pay.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrMet with contractor re balconies. Took pictures and discussed

problems. Asked for two separate quotes re type of repairs.
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2/21/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText from potential tenant re unit for rent.

2/22/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from landscaper with info about wood removal and phone

number of neighbor who wishes to discuss planting on roadside.
Entered contact info. Called and LM with neighbor.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCopied brush fire removal info from letter from County re same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived insurance package for Oak Mountain and filed.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from roofer re difficulty sending email to me with estimate. Gave

him contact info and sent him email to reply to.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrEmail with water bill for 919 Fairview. Read through CC&R's to

determine who should pay. Call to submetering company. Call from
HOA re unpaid water bill and discussed who should pay.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCall from security re gas technician needing entrance to building.

Asked him to have technician point out needed meter for water
heater. Got info, call to Gas Company and shut down un-needed
meter.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall with neighbor re cutback of some vegetation which is seeding

her area. Also discussed brokers in the area.

2/23/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed roof repair estimate for Live Oak from Stone.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Huron re any other possible eviction.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from contractor re bid. Responded with need for more detail.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrOpen mail and reviewed for bills to pay.

2/24/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Warlin re getting a quote for an additional $500k of liability

insurance.
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2/24/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMail from Warlin re policy for 4116 Lynd being sent to the property

address. Call to Warlin to confirm changes to have it sent to our
address. Scanned policy into pubdocs.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from security guard with question for access to building. Checked

with Tom and granted permission.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived insurance info and placed into files.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrGathered invoices for payment.

2/25/2016 TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrCall to security service re setting up time to have someone check on

the occupancy of 4116 Lynd. Conference call re same when Walli
went to property to report on what he saw. Email to attorney and Tom
re same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from fire extinguisher vendor re bill. Checked and confirmed

payment made.

TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrCall from prospective tenant, gathered items sent to me and printed.

Confirmed deposits on spreadsheet and determined probable yearly
income suitable for apartment. Ran credit report. Texts to apartment
manager re same. Notified tenant re deposit, move in costs and
timing. Tenant emailed he has found another unit. Text to apartment
manager re same.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed bills to pay on Alhambra Gardens.

2/26/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrSearch through email and other records for invoices for work at

Alhambra Gardens. Call to vendor re need for invoices for any work
on the boiler.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived renewal documentation for insurance for 135 E. Live Oak,

reviewed same. Prepared for signature and check.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall with Warlin re liability insurance quotes for additional amounts.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDiscussion with Matthew re HACLA rents, researched and sent

another email requesting payments or additional forms.
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2/26/2016 TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrReviewed and approved numerous bills for many properties. Calls to

gas company, electric utility to confirm previous payments, account
status etc.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from contractor re inability to work on the balconies as discussed

due to retirement of key staff.

2/27/2016 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCall to SoCalGas re invoice at Oak Mountain. Made sure invoices will

go to the correct address, etc.

TM Property Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrEmails, calls and texts with potential applicants for two units at

Alhambra Gardens. Review of applications and other documents that
were sent to me re same.

2/28/2016 TM Property Management 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrEmails, calls and texts with potential applicants for two units at

Alhambra Gardens.

2/29/2016 TM Property Management 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrEmails, calls and texts with potential applicants for two units at

Alhambra Gardens. Gathered additional income verification
documents and put on spreadsheet to determine ability to pay. Texts
to potential tenant re need for additional info for co-applicant before I
can run a credit check.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls from handyman re window needing replacement, approved re

same. Discussed need for labeling new smoke alarms with the date
of installation in order to assist future management and tenants.
Discussed stucco work being done and need for electricity for
workers.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to manager re stucco work, electricity, status of potential tenants.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Huron re lease documents.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrFilled out application and filed or business license for Alhambra for

apartment building.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from roof estimator re bid, discussed all work to be performed,

skylight domes, air conditioning ducting issues, drainpipes, etc.
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2/29/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from HACLA re transfer of funds. Alerted Matthew and verified.

TM Property Management 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrEmails, calls and communication from potential tenants. Prepared

items for credit check. Discussed with manager re items to repair and
maintain in unit to be vacated.

SUBTOTAL: [ 58.00 9,547.50]

Receiver                                

2/1/2016 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrReview New Sparkle information, consider additional information to

request on subpoena.

2/3/2016 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrPrepare for trip to City of San Bernardino. 

TAS Receiver 1.00 375.00
375.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to San Bernardino for Business License

and return.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrMeet with Tim re items of interest in the mail.

2/5/2016 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrReview investor report extracted from database, emails to David

Jimenez re same.

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrMeet with City of SB re business license for hotel, meet with Aprel re

operations.

2/8/2016 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview revised data extraction report, still multiple entries. Telephone

call with David Jimenez re field to eliminate to winnow down.

2/9/2016 TAS Receiver 3.30 1,237.50
375.00/hrTeam meeting on agenda and game plan, assign tasks.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrEmail Robert Hsu re purchase of property.
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2/10/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrMeet with staff re real estate sales, emails, pending matters.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrReview and sign treasury management account documents; review

treasury and CD offerings, liquidity needs, select maturities.

2/11/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview corporate resolution document requested by Wells Fargo

investments re treasury management account, mark up, is not
germane to receivership.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re report.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrDirect Matt re bank record inventory.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrConfer re IT issues.

2/12/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrGive direction re cell tower.

2/15/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview lease purchase document, email Robert Hsu re purchase.

2/16/2016 TAS Receiver 0.80 300.00
375.00/hrMeet at warehouse with Yoko Stoner re Amkey Global inventory.

2/17/2016 TAS Receiver 1.60 600.00
375.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to  Arcadia, Monrovia and Carson and

return to Irvine.

TAS Receiver 1.80 675.00
375.00/hrMeet at site re IT issues and data extraction.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTour New Sparkle site.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview documents re Amkey Global warehouse, email Yoko re

questions re same.
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2/17/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrResearch New Sparkle more.

TAS Receiver 2.20 825.00
375.00/hrPrepare narrative for report, review account, add to report.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with auctioneer re possible liquidation.

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re physical issues at Oak Mountain.

2/18/2016 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrFinalize draft report and exhibits and send to Ted.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview emails re Unlawful Detainer trial, there suit against me,

Telephone call with Jeff re stay, etc.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position on Hills

Garden.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position operating

expenses.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrAdd more subsidiaries and affiliates to report.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrCalls and emails re password and Quickbooks issue.

2/19/2016 TAS Receiver 1.00 375.00
375.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to  Pasadena for Unlawful Detainer trial.

TAS Receiver 1.40 525.00
375.00/hrAttend Unlawful Detainer trial, settle.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time from Pasadena to Arcadia.

TAS Receiver 1.20 450.00
375.00/hrMeet at site review records.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David re data extraction project.
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2/19/2016 TAS Receiver 1.90 712.50
375.00/hrFinish report, reconcile accounting.

TAS Receiver 0.80 300.00
375.00/hrReview bank statement inventory and status of missing information.

2/21/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview investor YouTube confer with Alison re same.

2/22/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Kristen re treasury management, select maturities and

amounts. Telephone call with Mark Doucet at re same.

TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrReview extracted data from David Jimenez re victims and amount

invested, confer re results.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrConfer with Matt re banking records inventory, paperwork and

cashier's check copies re cars, direct re same. 

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrFollow up re Zhao eviction. Stipulation entered and check sent, direct

Tim re same and re water bill.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re firearm issues.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview new table re losses and investors confer re same, analyze

total.

2/23/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer re production request.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer re Dominican Republic counsel.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re database analysis.

2/24/2016 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview investor inquiries, Confer with Alison re misinformed investors

need for letter.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Darren re possible tenant for land.
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2/25/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted re filing report, SEC, etc.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer re weapons turnover.

2/26/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re property details, Lynd tenant and bills.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrFinalized report.

2/29/2016 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re data extracted by IT.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview and follow up re status of frozen accounts and additional

frozen accounts.

SUBTOTAL: [ 32.80 12,300.00]

Receivership Administration  

2/9/2016 DC Receivership Administration 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrDownload recently filed documents off Pacer for receiver's files and

for posting on receivership website.  

2/10/2016 DC Receivership Administration 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrPortion of time from staff meeting dedicated to answering Chen

questions.

2/26/2016 DC Receivership Administration 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived Receiver's 2nd Interim Report from counsel. Passed to

receiver for review and signature; obtained signature and scanned
and sent back to counsel.

2/9/2016 MRF Receivership Administration 0.40 30.00
75.00/hrPrepared documents and items for status meeting with Allen Matkins.

2/10/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrDiscussed with Tom and group case status. Given direction re

assisting Darren with finding brokers for the single family homes, golf
course and hotel. Request to gather all property profiles to send to a
potential broker re golf course with spreadsheet of important parcel
information. Discussed server status at Live Oak, domain registration,
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etc. Given direction to assist Tim Hsu with info re postal service.

2/11/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDownloaded several documents from PACER.

2/12/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrOpened mail and sorted bills, invoices, utilities, etc., gave the rest to

Alison for review.

2/23/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDownloaded PACER documents into pubdocs.

2/27/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER for new docs. Updated the status report into

pubdocs.

TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Fates re filings.

SUBTOTAL: [ 2.30 340.50]

Research files                        

2/10/2016 AJ Research files 2.00 380.00
190.00/hrResearch banking records, and look for payments to insiders, track

the deposits, etc.  

2/12/2016 AJ Research files 2.30 437.00
190.00/hrReview documents, banking files, search real property records, etc.

2/11/2016 MRF Research files 0.80 60.00
75.00/hrReviewed bank account matrix spread and went through bank

statements to inventory ones on hand.

2/12/2016 MRF Research files 2.70 202.50
75.00/hrWent through and organized bank statements received by account for

inputting to matrix to locate missing statements that need to be
requested.  Made files re same.

2/18/2016 MRF Research files 0.90 67.50
75.00/hrContinued sorting bank statements on-hand and updating

spreadsheet with funds turned over in preparation to request missing
documents and perform a forensic accounting.

2/19/2016 MRF Research files 1.60 120.00
75.00/hrContinued sorting bank statements and updating spreadsheet to

highlight missing documents and prepare for a forensic accounting.
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2/22/2016 MRF Research files 1.60 120.00
75.00/hrContinued sorting and organizing bank statements taken from Live

Oak offices.  Reviewed contents of files and updated spreadsheet re
same.

MRF Research files 0.40 30.00
75.00/hrDiscussed documents re purchase of Mercedes S550s with Thomas

Seaman and provided documents for recovery of vehicles.

2/23/2016 MRF Research files 0.20 15.00
75.00/hrScanned and forwarded Mercedes purchase documents to counsel.

2/24/2016 MRF Research files 1.10 82.50
75.00/hrContinued sorting bank statements and updating spreadsheet to

highlight missing documents and prepare for a forensic accounting.

2/25/2016 MRF Research files 4.20 315.00
75.00/hrContinued sorting bank statements and updating spreadsheet to

highlight missing documents and prepare for a forensic accounting.

2/26/2016 MRF Research files 5.80 435.00
75.00/hrContinued sorting bank statements and updating spreadsheet to

highlight missing documents and prepare for a forensic accounting. 
Discussed same with Thomas Seaman.

2/29/2016 MRF Research files 2.20 165.00
75.00/hrContinued sorting bank statements and updating spreadsheet to

highlight missing documents and prepare for a forensic accounting. 
Discussed bank statements and the extent of documents on hand
with Thomas Seaman re same.

SUBTOTAL: [ 25.80 2,429.50]

Sell Property/Liquidate Assets

2/8/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrRespond to emails and phone calls regarding potential sale of hotel.

2/17/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrSent email and had call with Justin Huchel regarding multiple

properties in LA and Bradbury we will eventually be selling.  Sent
some addresses.

2/22/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrCalled Jans Towing in Arcadia to check current penalties and status

of Mercedes. Received specific instructions regarding release of the
Mercedes. Scanned and sent vehicle info for certification.
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2/22/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrCalled Arcadia PD regarding Mercedes and discussed proper

paperwork to secure release to take to Jans Towing.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrEmailed David Zaro regarding contacting Chen's attorney to get

release of the vehicle to take to Arcadia PD.

2/23/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived email from David Zaro regarding additional information on

Mercedes. Located info and emailed.

2/25/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrReceived info on guns from USFIA. Began researching transfer laws

and made calls.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.90 144.00
160.00/hrStudied for firearm test and took practice exam in preparation for

transferring weapons into my name prior to selling.

2/26/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrPerformed research on pricing for guns, automobiles and handbags.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrSent additional email to David Zaro regarding obtaining cooperation

from Chen to sign release for automobile.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrSent serial numbers of guns to Bain Davis gun shop in San Gabriel;

scanned and emailed photos.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrMet with Receiver to update on guns. Gave serial numbers for

missing weapons and emailed FBI to track down ownership for
turnover.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrSent emails and information to potential brokers for hotel sale; had

two phone calls with brokers to answer initial questions.

2/29/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 112.00
160.00/hrResearched Atlas Group as potential seller of Hills Garden Hotel.

Sent list of questions to principal and left message. Read website info
and reviewed list of their transactions and ran reports on hotels
recently sold.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed email and website from Receiver for potential hotel broker;

had call.
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2/29/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReceived email from David Zaro regarding Mercedes.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReceived email from hotel manager regarding additional hotel broker.

Reviewed email, checked out website and current escrows.  Sent
response and additional questions.

TAS Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrRetrieve information on golf course and hotel for prospective buyer,

direct Darren re changes, forward to prospect.

2/17/2016 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed other properties for sale in Bradbury of similar size, price,

etc.

2/25/2016 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrDirection from Tom re getting information on selling the guns in our

possession and getting transfer of upcoming two firearm. Call to
security service, conference call with gun dealer, discussed with
Alison, checked internet for licensed firearms dealers. Got Alison the
contact info of security firm to check serial numbers.

SUBTOTAL: [ 8.50 1,493.50]

For professional services rendered $50,472.00278.90

Balance due $50,472.00
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Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA  92614

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen

July 09, 2016

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11175

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

3/9/2016 AJ Accounting & Reporting 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrReceived message from accounting firm re returns ready.

3/1/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.30 345.00
150.00/hrcut checks, working on accounting entries for Hills Garden.

3/2/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.60 240.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, paid several bills online.

3/3/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.00 300.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, entered Hills Gardens revenue by day.

3/4/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 4.60 690.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.  Working on bank recon and Accounts receivable
receipts for Hills Garden.

3/8/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.60 90.00
150.00/hrEntered Hills daily revenue transactions.

3/9/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.60 390.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.  Finished bank recon and Accounts receivable
receipts for Hills Garden.
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3/10/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.40 210.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

3/11/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 5.20 780.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, did USFIA bank recon, entered daily revenue
transactions for Hills.

3/15/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.80 270.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, entered Hills daily revenue.

3/16/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.60 90.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

3/18/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.20 180.00
150.00/hrCorrespondence with Heidi on several credit card transactions,

entered Hills daily revenue.

3/21/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.20 330.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, entered Hills daily revenue.

3/23/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.20 180.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

3/24/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 0.80 120.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, entered Hills daily revenue.

3/25/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 2.20 330.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out.

3/28/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.40 210.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, entered daily Hills revenue.

3/29/2016 KJ Accounting & Reporting 1.80 270.00
150.00/hrReviewed Accounts payable invoices, cut checks, had Tom review,

and mailed out, entered daily Hills revenue.

3/1/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrScheduled and prepared payment for notary re easement for Hills

Garden Hotel.
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

3/3/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.00 75.00
75.00/hrBegan inputting statement charges to Quickbooks for March rental

payments re Alhambra Apartments.

3/4/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 3.90 292.50
75.00/hrCompleted inputting March statement charges for Alhambra

Apartments.  Received payments in Quickbooks and deposited rent
checks received to date.  Reconciled housing authority payments
received in Quickbooks for tenants with subsidized rents.

3/9/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.10 82.50
75.00/hrInput the payroll for the periods ending 2/15 & 2/29/16 to

Quickbooks re Hills Garden Hotel.

3/11/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.10 82.50
75.00/hrReceived remaining rent payments for March, deposited, and

updated Quickbooks re Alhambra Gardens Apartments.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 30.00
75.00/hrCalculated amounts owed and processed payment to Thomas

Seaman Company for Fedex, court document filing, and network
solutions fees paid on behalf of USFIA entities.

3/30/2016 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrInput the Hills Garden Hotel payroll for the period ending 3/15/16 to

Quickbooks.

3/1/2016 TM Accounting & Reporting 1.00 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrAssistance with timekeeper and task reports for fee app for Tom.

Ran multiple reports, edits to timeslips for correct task, etc.

SUBTOTAL: [ 43.00 5,674.00]

Forensic Accounting              

3/1/2016 TAS Forensic Accounting 1.20 450.00
375.00/hrReview bank statement inventory worksheet, confer with Matt re

same, and re changes organization, etc, select USFIA account to
review, review statements, consider accounting for same,
Telephone call with David Zaro re scope of accounting.

SUBTOTAL: [ 1.20 450.00]
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

Investor Relations                  

3/1/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.80 152.00
190.00/hrReview victim correspondence, messages, etc.

3/2/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 114.00
190.00/hrReview messages from victims.

3/4/2016 AJ Investor Relations 1.10 209.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims, etc  Look up

info in USFIA database and email accounts.

3/8/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

3/9/2016 AJ Investor Relations 1.40 266.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.  Research

names, etc.

3/10/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.

3/11/2016 AJ Investor Relations 1.70 323.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.  Calls and email with

victims re case status, etc.

3/16/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.

3/17/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 114.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.  

3/21/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.  Calls with victims.

3/23/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

3/24/2016 AJ Investor Relations 1.50 285.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.  Return calls to victims,

translate emails to/ from Spanish and email to victims. 

3/28/2016 AJ Investor Relations 0.80 152.00
190.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

3/4/2016 TM Investor Relations 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrAdded chinese translation to web site update of 2nd report.

Re-made header picture to add to Constant Contact. Uploaded.
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3/6/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrWorked on altering the header picture for future emails to

subscribers.

3/7/2016 TM Investor Relations 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrFinished new header picture for emails, loaded recent update into

email, added hyperlinks, formatted, previewed and sent email to
subscribers.

3/10/2016 TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice, call to translation service, approved.

SUBTOTAL: [ 14.00 2,587.50]

Litigation & Support               

3/1/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrConfer with Tom re issues with hiring counsel. Call with Andrea. 

Forward emails to Tom re same. 

3/2/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from Andrea to law firm re conditions of engagement,

billing rates, etc.

3/3/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrReview emails with law firm in Dominican and Andrea re

engagement details.  Forward same to Tom.

3/4/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.50 95.00
190.00/hrReview emails from counsel in Dominican.  Call with Andre re

terms of engagement, etc.  Review additional emails.

3/7/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrReview emails from Andrea and Dominican counsel.  Confer with

Tom re same.

3/8/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrEmails with Andrea and new counsel re engagement for Dominican

matter.

3/9/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReview email regarding engagement with Dominican counsel, reply.

AJ Litigation & Support 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview emails from Andrea and Carolina re details of the

engagement letter.

3/11/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview emails re revisions to the engagement letter. Confer with

Tom re same.
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3/14/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.40 76.00
190.00/hrEmails regarding engagement letter, etc.

3/15/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrCall with Tom and Andrea.  Discuss engagement letter revisions.

Review email from Andrea to Carolina re same.

3/23/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrReview email from Andrea re engagement letter from Squire Patton.

3/29/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrReview emails from counsel re engagement letter.

3/31/2016 AJ Litigation & Support 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrReview emails with Andrea and Carolina re engagement letter.

AJ Litigation & Support 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrReview email from Andrea with question on retainer.  Call with Tom

to discuss and get approval.  Email to Andrea re same.

SUBTOTAL: [ 4.00 760.00]

Manage Business                  

3/1/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed payroll hours - approved and passed to Alison Juroe.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

3/2/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrForward pay stubs to manager.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills and receipts from assistant manager, discussed

with accounting.
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3/2/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

3/3/2016 DC Manage Business 1.20 192.00
160.00/hrReceived email from hotel manager regarding commercial dryer

being out.  Researched and got quotes on repair vs. replace.
Reviewed history of payments to repair company. Searched prices
online.  Approved purchase of used dryer (same model) at fraction
of cost of new with 180 day warranty.   Called vendor and sent
approval to manager; notified accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed and approved invoice from Magnusson; emailed Kristen

Janulewicz.

3/4/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills and expenses from Aprel Glass at hotel and

forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations.  Discussed with Sean Yarnell with Magnusson.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

3/7/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
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files; forwarded to accounting.

3/7/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

3/8/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations.  Discussed with Sean Yarnell with Magnusson.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrResponded to Merri from Immec Training regarding golf course

lease.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrResponded to Todd Stefan from Bird Marell's IT consultant

regarding RAID.

3/9/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports.

DC Manage Business 0.80 128.00
160.00/hrPerformed research related to STAR report for hotel (Smith Travel

Accommodations Report).  Request and review old reports. Scan
and pass to receiver to forward to potential buyer. Sing up for new
report (trial basis); discussed and reviewed options going forward.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived email from Kristen Janulewicz regarding PMS1 password

issues. Sent inquiry to Sean Yarnell and called; relayed response
to Kristen Janulewicz.

3/10/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrPrint and review bills sent by Heidi from hotel. Compare to prior

months; approve and notify accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day.
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

3/10/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports.

3/11/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills and expenses from Aprel Glass at hotel and

forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations.  Discussed with Sean Yarnell with Magnusson.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

3/13/2016 DC Manage Business 2.30 368.00
160.00/hrVisit to hotel to check on operation and upcoming reservations for

St. Patrick's Day. Reviewed potential maintenance issues; walked
property.  Travel time to and from  hotel billed at half

3/14/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

3/15/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

3/16/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.
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3/16/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed payroll numbers and hours; forwarded to Alison Juroe.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed deposit and checks from customers with accounts at

hotel; asked Aprel manager questions about terms with customers
who are billed.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrForwarded pay stubs to manager with instructions to distribute on

the 20th.

3/17/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed deposit and checks from customers with accounts at

hotel; asked Aprel manager questions about terms with customers
who are billed.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed eSTAR report for Hills Garden Hotel for March.

Compared results to last year and within current market. Contacted
STAR with additional questions.

DC Manage Business 1.60 256.00
160.00/hrResearch security cameras. Go to camera retailer in Irvine to

review IP, Cat5 and cable cameras and discuss length of
transmission issues.  

3/18/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills and expenses from Aprel Glass at hotel and

forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 
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3/18/2016 DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrLogged into Expedia website re hotel.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrForwarded vendor W-9 for hotel to Kristen Janulewicz. Saved to file.

3/20/2016 DC Manage Business 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrTravel time to and from hotel billed at half (total time 2 hours and

20 minutes).

3/21/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrCheck into Gas Company payment not being received and late

notice.

3/22/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReviewed bill from Magnusson and forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.70 112.00
160.00/hrHad conference call with TelePacific regarding phone service at

hotel, receivership details, and transfer of billing name. Sent copy
of preliminary injunction and order appointing receiver via email
and had follow up call. Explained to them that the hotel would
continue to operate as it had in the past and not to change billing or
name on bill at this time.  Transferred to legal department to
answer additional questions.

3/23/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
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accounting.

3/23/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

3/24/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed credit app and new W9 requirement.

DC Manage Business 0.70 112.00
160.00/hrHad call with Aprel regarding security company and camera issues

and reservation and tour group contracts.

DC Manage Business 1.40 224.00
160.00/hrPrinted off multiple contracts from Aprel and thoroughly reviewed

and commented.  Reviewed upcoming reservations from tour
groups.  Printed security camera bids and forwarded to potential
vendors.  Researched pricing for new system.

DC Manage Business 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrCompleted month to month rental agreement for land use of golf

course by training company.

3/25/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed bills and expenses from Aprel Glass at hotel and

forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager. 

Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to accounting.

3/27/2016 DC Manage Business 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrTravel time to and from hotel billed at half (total time 2 hours and

20 minutes).

Exhibit A, Page 82

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 91   Filed 08/01/16   Page 83 of 117   Page ID
 #:2402



Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 13Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

3/27/2016 DC Manage Business 1.50 240.00
160.00/hrReviewed status of old cameras and equipment.  Ran multiple

reports and reviewed hotel reports. Interacted with multiple
employees.

3/28/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

3/29/2016 DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and registration reports from Sean Yarnell at

Magnusson.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived application for new Star report to include additional

competitors.  Reviewed and instructed Aprel to complete. Informed
potential appraiser of new app.

3/30/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 1.20 192.00
160.00/hrCreated list of action items for multiple issues coming up at the

hotel with deadline dates.  Had conference call with Aprel to
discuss feasability and timeline.  Reached out to vendors to confirm
due dates based on action items.  Issues being dealt with include
security camera installation, cable runs, terminating relationship
with security guard company, moving manager's office downstairs
and converting upstairs back to storage, scheduling various tour
groups and potential elimination of assistant manager position.
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3/30/2016 DC Manage Business 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrSent email to Merri Terrel at Simmec Training regarding contract.

DC Manage Business 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrHad status update with Gerry Wayne Thompson at golf course

regarding schedule of training and other issues at the property.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived signed contract back for use of golf course by training

company. Gave copy to Receiver, scanned and saved to file.

3/31/2016 DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

previous day. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrReceived photos from caretaker at Quail Ranch of cell tower

placards. Contacted American Tower regarding lease payments.
Exchanged official paperwork via email; spoke with legal.  Had
follow up call to resolve outstanding payment issues and to get
payments resumed including backlog of 6 payments for cell tower
lease.

DC Manage Business 1.40 224.00
160.00/hrReceived paperwork and photos from cable installer at hotel.  Had

conference call regarding cable lengths and signal degradation of
signal.  Made multiple calls to hardware vendors to discuss power
options for security cameras. Had manager take photos of cameras
and send model numbers. Referred model numbers to vendors and
looked for compatible options for cameras and dvrs.  Made
appointment for new cabling to move manager office downstairs.
Confirmed appointment and notified manager. Instructed installer
on which rooms to use for new office and which peripherals to hook
up.  Conferenced in IT vendor to discuss iP settings and which
switch to use for networking; opted for wireless printing and
confirmed settings.

DC Manage Business 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrReceived W-9 form and address request and ACH application.

Discussed with Matthew Flahive and relayed info back to tower
company that payee and payment method should not be changed. 
Confirmed this by referencing order.

SUBTOTAL: [ 35.80 5,728.00]
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Project Management              

3/2/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview payroll for hotel and send to payroll processor.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview preliminary payroll with revisions.  Forward to Tom for final

approval.  Email Christine to proceed with final.  Forward to
Matthew, Kristen and Darren.  

3/3/2016 AJ Project Management 1.50 285.00
190.00/hrReview mail and correspondence. Look up info on various entities,

etc.

3/4/2016 AJ Project Management 1.30 247.00
190.00/hrReview mail and correspondence.  Look up various entities,

respond to notices, etc.  Scan and email a workers comp legal
notice to Tim Hsu.  

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview emails from Tom re meeting in Arcadia.  Discuss same an

confirm I will attend.

3/7/2016 AJ Project Management 1.70 323.00
190.00/hrReview subpoena records received from Tim Hsu.  Researched

other properties, and purchases, etc.

AJ Project Management 2.30 437.00
190.00/hrReview data from the UFSIA backoffice, analyze data, etc.  

Review emails and attempt to match up info.

3/8/2016 AJ Project Management 1.60 304.00
190.00/hrReview email from Ted with details from a victim with "evidence

and clues" about Chen.   Researched claims, etc.  Review other
similar messages and correspondence.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview message from Tim re courts ruling on Wellman.  Call with

Tim re same.

3/9/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrForward payroll to Kristen, inquire regarding garnishment payments.

AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrReceived and reviewed subpoena production.

3/10/2016 AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReview email from Ted re SEC document request.  Confer with

Tom.  Call with Ted re same.
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3/10/2016 AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrEmail to Darren payroll deadline date.

AJ Project Management 6.70 1,273.00
190.00/hrWork on searching for information requested by SEC. Search

known email accounts. EMail search criteria to David Jimenez. 
Scan items located. Follow up with David for items he located. 
Search will take more time. Confer with Tom re same.  Call with
Ted and advise re findings.  Scan and email multiple items to Ted.

3/11/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from David re exporting search results for SEC. 

Confer with Tom re same.

AJ Project Management 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrFollow up email from Ted.  Confer with Tom re items David found,

review same.  Work with Tom re emailing items to SEC for use in
motion.

3/14/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from Tim re status of Chen's Mercedes turnover.

3/16/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview hotel payroll and forward to payroll processor.  Request

invoice for payroll tax returns that are completed for Amkey Global.

AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReceived email from Christine with payroll, review and approve.

Email to Tom as well.  Received invoice and forward to Kristen and
request check for tax returns.   

3/17/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from Tom regarding details for meeting in Arcadia

tomorrow.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrFollow up with Kristen re check for tax returns.  Email to Tom to get

approval on check amount.

AJ Project Management 2.50 475.00
190.00/hrResearch and review files and emails, etc.  Organize files, etc. 

Prepare for visit to Arcadia office.  Make list of items to look for, etc.

3/18/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrCall with Tim re meeting in Arcadia.  Call to Wally re same.
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3/18/2016 AJ Project Management 1.10 209.00
190.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to and from Arcadia office.

AJ Project Management 8.20 1,558.00
190.00/hrOnsite at the Arcadia office. Meeting with former employee.

Meeting with AUSA and team.  Review files and folders. Meeting
with David from BRG.

3/21/2016 AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrReviewed bank account inventory and confer with Matthew re next

steps to take, items to add, etc.  

AJ Project Management 0.70 133.00
190.00/hrReview emails from Tim Hsu.  Confer with Darren re storage for

car.  Call with Tim to discuss various outstanding items.

AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrScan and email w-2 for Mo Chen to Ted.

AJ Project Management 0.50 95.00
190.00/hrPrepare and send email to Tim Hsu with additional properties

owned by Wei He entities. 

AJ Project Management 1.60 304.00
190.00/hrReview documents and files.  Analyze bank records, review against

inventory, etc.

3/22/2016 AJ Project Management 1.80 342.00
190.00/hrReview marketing videos that I located at the Arcadia office. 

Provide to Darren and request he save copies to server.  Make
copies of cases and prepare and fed ex to Justin Slaby per
subpoena request.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview emails re Chen vehicle in storage from Tim, Tom and

Darren. Confer with Darren re same. 

3/25/2016 AJ Project Management 0.30 57.00
190.00/hrMet with Tom to review re subpoena production worksheet, discuss

meeting last week, etc.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrContact Tim re blocked access to Chicago Title database. 

AJ Project Management 1.70 323.00
190.00/hrWork with Matthew to get the bank spreadsheet ready to send to

AUSA.  Work on updating property matrix as well and prepare for
sending.
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3/29/2016 AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview email from David Jiminez re pricing for processing and 

hosting the Chen data.

AJ Project Management 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrReview and forward payroll deadline for next period.  Send last

payroll to Matthew and Kristen for processing.

AJ Project Management 1.80 342.00
190.00/hrReview and process incoming mail and correspondence.

3/30/2016 AJ Project Management 1.30 247.00
190.00/hrMet with Tom to review documents re jewelry delivery, Yan Chen

and other entities, review Amauction payments, accounting, etc.
Telephone call with counsel re same

AJ Project Management 1.20 228.00
190.00/hrConference call with AUSA re subpoena. 

AJ Project Management 1.80 342.00
190.00/hrCall with security guard at Arcadia site re the person who made

delivery of stones wants to take them back.  Research the names
of the entities, the buyer and seller, etc.  Research Quickbooks
payments, and bank statements, etc.  Call to security at advise that
we will not release the stones, they can call Tom with questions.

3/31/2016 AJ Project Management 0.10 19.00
190.00/hrReview email from David to Richard.

3/10/2016 DC Project Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReceived detailed statement from ByDesign. Called and discussed

charges. Met with Receiver and Alison Juroe regarding counter
offer and data access; sent counter offer.

3/16/2016 DC Project Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrTook call from Ted Fates regarding status of RID rebuild

assistance and agreed to contact Todd Stefan regarding status of
further assistance; called Todd and emailed him information.

3/17/2016 DC Project Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrCompiled and sent additional documentation to Setec

Investigations regarding RAID and answered questions.

3/18/2016 DC Project Management 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrSend copy of fee app to Mike Bandemere and request copy of BRG

fee app and invoices. 

Exhibit A, Page 88

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 91   Filed 08/01/16   Page 89 of 117   Page ID
 #:2408



Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 19Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

3/18/2016 DC Project Management 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReviewed and responded to email from David Jimenez.

3/21/2016 DC Project Management 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReviewed Amex statement and charges; verified.

3/22/2016 DC Project Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrPer request of Alison Juroe, copied marketing videos for USFIA to

location on server.

3/24/2016 DC Project Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrPrinted and reviewed BRG invoices and fee app.

3/30/2016 DC Project Management 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReturned call to Lareta Tax service.

3/31/2016 DC Project Management 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrConfirm visit from unsecured creditor tomorrow at offices; inform

trustee.

3/8/2016 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrSeparated out the credit forms from the mail at Live Oak and

delivered to Alison.

3/10/2016 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDownloaded documents from PACER into Pubdocs.

SUBTOTAL: [ 48.20 9,081.00]

Property Management           

3/8/2016 DC Property Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReceived certified letter from SBA Steel regarding lease of cell

tower. Reviewed letter and had call regarding Tower removal.

DC Property Management 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrEmailed then called Jessica Almikies regarding missing payment

for cell tower.

DC Property Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrHad follow up conference call with Jessica Almikies regarding

status of payments, amount due and status of tower removal.

3/11/2016 DC Property Management 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrTook phone cal from Hector from SBA Steel (cell tower lessee).

Discussed purpose of site visit. Located Gary and relayed
information. Gave instruction to Hector and answered questions.
Had follow up call after site visit to discuss timeline of tower
removal. Confirmed rental payments would be received up until
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tower is removed.

3/14/2016 DC Property Management 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrHad call with training company to remind them about insurance cert

and got into specifics of land use at golf course during training
exercises, length of lease etc.

3/15/2016 DC Property Management 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived updated insurance cert from potential lessee of golf

course for training program (Merric). Scanned to file and asked
Receiver about short term lease rental.

3/1/2016 TAS Property Management 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re vacancies at Alhambra, confer re prospect,

direct re double security deposit and terms re same.

TAS Property Management 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re another Alhambra tenant prospect, approve

same.

3/2/2016 TAS Property Management 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrSign two new leases for Alhambra.

3/3/2016 TAS Property Management 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re Alhambra visit.

3/1/2016 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail from Tom re neighbor's interest in renting Oak Mountain

during renovation. Call and email to same to discuss.

TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrDiscussed potential tenants with Tom re Alhambra Gardens and

got direction. Verified employment via calls. Gathered tenant info,
ran credit reports. Calls to potential tenants. Text to manager re
same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from contractor and LM with additional contractor.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrTexts and calls with potential tenants to arrange certified funds and

leases.

3/2/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to new tenant re needed payment, leases, etc.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with neighbor to Oak Mountain re interest in buying property.

Informed Tom. Email to neighbor re same.
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3/2/2016 TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrWrote new lease for Apt. U., gathered signature from Tom,

prepared for delivery.

TM Property Management 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrWrote new lease for Apt. Y., gathered signature from Tom,

prepared for delivery.

TM Property Management 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrTravel time to Alhambra Gardens, and back home; at half pay.

TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrMet with new tenants for apartment U and signed leases, gathered

certified funds. Inspected apartment and gave direction for final
refurbishment items such as toilet handle, window and locks.
Inspected apartment Y and gave direction for final refurbishment
items such as paint, blinds in bedroom and locks.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrMet with tenants in unit M with handyman and reviewed needed

refurbishment of bathroom tub and shower, re-painting of
bathroom, needed cabinetry, caulking, woodwork, etc.

3/3/2016 TM Property Management 1.60 264.00
165.00/hrTravel time to Alhambra Gardens, 135 E. Live Oak, Arcadia Post

Office, Rancho Cucamonga vacant land, and back home; at half
pay.

TM Property Management 0.90 148.50
165.00/hrMet with new tenants for apartment Y and signed leases, gathered

certified funds.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrGathered mail items from Live Oak, call with Hsu re status of post

office request and status of guns.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall and email to Tom re status of turnover of keys re Fairview.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrVisit to Post Office and discussed with supervisor issue with mail

forwarding. Received forms for fill out.

TM Property Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrVisit to vacant land in Rancho Cucamonga, took pictures, walked

property  in checked for any posted notices or property
management issues needing attention.
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3/4/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoice for pool service. Email to contractor re bear

sighting.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices for security services. Email to contractor re

missing invoice for 2/21/2016.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from tenant who had moved out and discussed forwarding

address, good shape of the apartment. Approved refund of deposit.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to landscaper re cattail removal, bear sighting.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked with Tom re status of move out of Fairview tenant.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrApproved numerous invoices for pipe repair, electricity, gas at

Alhambra Gardens.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved utilities for Live Oak.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed insurance re Oak Mountain with Tom, email to Warlin re

same.

3/7/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from landscaper re need to alter address for future payments,

changed in Quickbooks, notified Kristen to change most recent
check. Texts to landscaper. Discussed fescue grass seeding for
March.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrFound mail items to send to former sub-tenant. Prepared mailing,

labels, etc. sent out with cover letter.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrQuestion from Darren re insurance info needed for tenant.

Researched, call to broker re same. Wrote out for the tenant.

3/8/2016 TM Property Management 1.60 264.00
165.00/hrTravel to Oak Mountain, Live Oak, Alhambra Gardens and back to

work; at half pay.

TM Property Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrInspected landscape work and took pictures of ornamental grasses

to discuss with neighbor re problem of seeds blowing onto their
property. Discussed with landscaper several dead bushes and
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trees which should be removed and approved. Inspected
balconies, verified that greenwaste bin has been delivered,
discussed with landscaper need for seed planting of fescue
grasses at beginning of April.

3/8/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrInpsection of 4116 Lynd Ave., picture of car with tire deflating,

electric meter off, notice on door, back yard, back door area.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrGathered mails delivered at Live Oak. Pictures of landscape needs

on low hanging tree branches.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrVisited Alhambra Gardens and picked up last rent checks.

Reviewed stucco work being performed and directed manager to
insist that area near hose bib be fixed with the other areas.
Inspected trench in back of property and verified that water is being
collected in trench and is not up against back wall. Direction to
manager that lights be left on in halway areas and stair area.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrPrepared 3-Day Notice for tenant. Scanned and copied rent checks

picked up.

3/10/2016 TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrReceived keys to Fairview condo. Calls to gas company, electric

company to begin service. Started service.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText from gardener re check. Replied. Email to Kristen re same.

TM Property Management 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrExtensive search for waterproofing contractors. Entered contact

info into Outlook and into phone. Calls to many.

TM Property Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrEntered insurance info onto master spreadsheet for tracking. Call

to Warlin re upcoming policy numbers.

3/11/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to HOA re changeover of control of 919 Fairview. Discussed

HOA payment, water bill, security.

TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrTexts with locksmith. Met locksmith at Fairview, directed locks

changes, took pictures of property, checked irrigation timers,
checked power at property.
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3/11/2016 TM Property Management 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrTravel to and from Live Oak, Fairview Ave., and back; at half pay.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrGathered mail at Live Oak.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from gardener re unsigned check. Discussed and gave

direction to Kristen to mail new one immediately.

3/14/2016 TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrTravel to 345 Oak Mountain to meet with contractor, and back; at

half pay.

TM Property Management 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrMet with waterproofing contractor and discussed work needed on

balconies, problems with downspouts, need for cricket, etc.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCalls to contractors re balconies.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from former tenant re deposit check, got revised new address.

Prepared letter and submitted for payment.

3/15/2016 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail from security re HOA. Call to HOA and explained situation.

Email from HOA and email to same re unpaid invoices.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDeposit return letter to former tenant (Unit Y).

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLM with contractors re balconies. Updates to Outlook contact info.

Several only work on commerical structures.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrSearch for electricians re security systems for Alhambra Gardens.

3/16/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from waterproofing contractor with verbal bid. Asked for faxed

copy.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from insurance inspector for 345 Oak Mountain, gave

directions, informed of wildlife issues. Call to gatehouse to give
permission for inspector to visit property.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrFinished business license application process and paid for license

renewal.
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

3/16/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall to HOA for info on landscaper. Called landscaper to service

back yard. Arranged for him to go by property for estimate.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrGathered numerous mail items sent to Live Oak which needed

forwarding. Looked up various addressees and sent on.

3/17/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to contractor re balconies.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from landscape maintenance re bid for Fairview. Accepted and

sent text re same.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrEmail from Chase re financial and rental items needed for loan.

Reviewed and checked Quickbooks for same and began creating
file to send to loan rep at Chase.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from insurance inspector re Oak Mountain. Answered

question, sent interior photos for his report.

3/18/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice re fire extinguisher case repairs. Approved.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReviewed Apartment House Property Statement for the Los

Angeles County Assessor.

3/22/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from tenant re problem with parking spot and need to change

spots.  Discussed need to have plants and items removed from
front of units A & B.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Huron re expiration of 60-day notice for 4116 Lynd

property.

3/23/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from handyman re items needing removal from walkway.

Discussed projects to be performed re Unit M.

3/25/2016 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail to Huron re next step re Lynd. Received email re same and

replied re moving forward with U/D.
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 26Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

3/28/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrFilled out renewal info form for insurance for Live Oak with request

for confirmation of additional insured cert. Sent to Travelers.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Darren re need for info re specific parcel at Quail Ranch

for potential buyer. Researched web sites starting with Assessor
Office, Zillow, RedFin, property info on profile. Made overhead
picture of prominent parcels and labeled. Gave to Darren with
comment.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail from Huron re items in mailbox and name of tenant. Sent

email with pictures of items found at Lynd. Problem with email
system due to slowdown with Network Solutions, had to send
multiple times.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to contractor re need for proposal re balcony work. LM with his

wife with contact info and address of property.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrLetter to Unit A re removal of items from walkway.  Email to

manager re same for delivery.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLetter to Unit B re removal of items from walkway.  Email to

manager re same for delivery.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrLetter to Unit A re removal of electrical cord. Text to manager re

which unit affected and which tenant. Search through lease files for
similar notices. Email to manager re same for delivery.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to apartment manager re spare parking spots.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from tenant re letter requesting removal of items from outside

unit on walkway and discussed need for safety. Also discussed
problem with dogs on the courtyard.

3/29/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrPrepared letter for all tenants re need to remove dog excrement

and items on walkways.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to contractor re balcony walkways with cracks at Alhambra

Gardens. Discussed setting up a time to both visit the property to
see what can be done that would work long-term on balconies.
Discussed finishing work of the stucco and need for invoice for
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

payment. Final inspection will be required by city.

3/29/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReview of pet waste stations for apartment building.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived insurance certs re cell phone towers, scanned and

entered onto tracking spreadsheet.

TM Property Management 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrReviewed and approved numerous invoices for security services at

Live Oak. Reviewed installation proposal to determine
appropriateness of charges. Prorated out the April charges to be
paid later. Approved other weekly bills.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices for utilities at Live Oak.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices for utilities at Oak Mountain.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrApproved invoices for utilities at Alhambra Gardens. Call to

Alhambra Utilities re missing bill.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved mortgage payment.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved insurance payment for Live Oak. Updated insurance

tracking spreadsheet. Asked Kristen to pay by phone.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails from title company, call from same. Forwarded some to

Darren for appraisal work.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from security person re items which were delivered to Live

Oak. Printed out for Tom. Email to Alison re same.

3/30/2016 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrDiscussion with Matthew re call from Republic Services re

overloaded trash bin. Call to security guard and discussed. Call to
Republic to let them know ours looked ok and they may be
confused with neighbors bin. Checked google map to look at
overhead picture, made a picture of property and labeled bins. Sent
picture with question to security guard to determine if he confused
bins.
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

3/30/2016 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from security guard re delivery driver who delivered items

yesterday and wants them back as he says he delivered to the
wrong address. He sent me a picture and email. Forwarded to
Alison, printed and gave to her for a decision. Call from Alison re
same.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived proposal for balcony work at Oak Mountain, reviewed

and discussed with Tom. Approved, scanned and faxed. Added
contact info.

3/31/2016 TM Property Management 1.70 280.50
165.00/hrSent out numerous checks on many projects. Made copies for files,

metered and mailed. Call from Alhambra Utilities re payment.
Informed that payment has been sent and requested notation to our
file, checked their address on file and let them know we did not
receive initial bill, only the past due notice. Gave check number.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrReviewed contractor bills and checked against proposals for work.

Approved.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from contractor re waterproofing project at Oak Mountain.

Arranged time to meet and deliver keys, initial starter check and
discuss project. Also discussed need for bid of balcony walkways
at Alhambra Gardens. Sent by fax a W-9 for fill out. Added vendor
in Quickbooks.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from tenant re need to begin fix work on apartment. Call to

Whitfield re getting a bid.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrUpdated insurance master spreadsheet with additional info on

Chen policies.

SUBTOTAL: [ 44.00 7,397.50]

Receiver                                

3/1/2016 TAS Receiver 0.90 NO CHARGE
375.00/hrPrepare fee application narrative, add.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReceive email from Ona, guard at Bradbury re party interested in

leasing Oak Mountain, confer with and direct Tim re same.
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3/1/2016 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrApprove Hills Garden payroll.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re tenant prospects.

3/2/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position.

3/4/2016 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re insurance details on Oak Mountain.

3/7/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re Dominical Republic counsel.

3/9/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Avi re interest in hotel.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Avi re interest in Hotel, review and forward

STAR report.

3/10/2016 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrConfer re misinformation being spread to investors.

TAS Receiver 0.50 NO CHARGE
375.00/hrFinalize fee application.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer re SEC document request.

3/11/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re search results needed.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview draft retainer agreement, note items needing revision or

deletion.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview bank statement inventory, direct re organizing.

3/15/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrEmail and confer re revised retainer agreement.

3/16/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrCommunications re Chen's car.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrLook for ground lease, confer with Darren re land lease for

temporary usage.
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3/22/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David re pending matters, investor

communications, accounting, Chen's home, car, other.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrGet briefed and give direction on Chen auto recovery.

3/25/2016 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re subpoena production worksheet, meeting.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and revise short term lease for land.

3/28/2016 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position for Hotel.

3/29/2016 TAS Receiver 0.60 NO CHARGE
375.00/hrRevise fee application.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview text from Wally (security) re delivery of jewelry to Live Oak,

review invoice and pictures, consider facts.

3/30/2016 TAS Receiver 1.30 487.50
375.00/hrConfer with Alison and review documents re jewelry delivery, Chen,

Yan Chen, review Amauction payments, accounting, etc,
Telephone call with counsel re same.

TAS Receiver 1.20 450.00
375.00/hrConference call with AUSA re subpoena.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer re confirming data extracted to bank records.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrConfer re delivery to Live Oak, intended for possible affiliate, have

Alison research same, QBs, etc, review information re same.

3/31/2016 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position. 

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview SEC comments to BRG fee app. Telephone call with Ted

Fates re same, Telephone call with BRG re same.
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3/31/2016 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re water intrusion at Oak Mountain approve work.

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrApprove retainer for DR counsel.

SUBTOTAL: [ 12.50 3,937.50]

Receivership Administration  

3/2/2016 CM Receivership Administration 0.60 36.00
60.00/hrFiled Accounts Payable checks and payment backup.

3/22/2016 DC Receivership Administration 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrDownload recently filed documents off Pacer for receiver's files and

for posting on receivership website.  

3/18/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Walli at Live Oak asking if anyone would attend the

meeting. Call to Tom and Alison, called back to Walli re same.

3/30/2016 TM Receivership Administration 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDownloaded PACER documents for files.

SUBTOTAL: [ 1.10 117.50]

Research files                        

3/2/2016 AJ Research files 2.00 380.00
190.00/hrReview files, records, documents, etc.  

3/15/2016 AJ Research files 1.70 323.00
190.00/hrReview files and banking records.  

3/22/2016 AJ Research files 1.60 304.00
190.00/hrReview and research files and records.

3/24/2016 AJ Research files 4.30 817.00
190.00/hrSearch files and collect the records related to property purchases,

deeds, bank wire transfers, etc.  Scan records showing same. 
Organize records, etc.

3/25/2016 AJ Research files 4.50 855.00
190.00/hrContinue to review property records, bank statements, etc.  Locate

wire for large purchase, believed to be Chens house in Bradbury. 
Scan and email details to Tim Hsu for issuance of subpoena to
Escrow co.
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3/28/2016 AJ Research files 0.20 38.00
190.00/hrDirection Matthew re payments to and bank information for

co-defendants.

3/1/2016 MRF Research files 1.10 82.50
75.00/hrReviewed 2012 bank statements and input information to

spreadsheet in preparation of a forensic accounting.

3/11/2016 MRF Research files 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrDiscussed review of bank statements on hand with Thomas

Seaman.

3/21/2016 MRF Research files 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrReceived directions from Alison Juroe re further steps to take in

building spreadsheet of bank accounts used by receivership
entities and files that need to be reviewed.

3/23/2016 MRF Research files 4.10 307.50
75.00/hrReviewed files with 2011 & 2012 accounting files for entity bank

statements to expand upon banking spreadsheet.  Inventoried
statements and updated spreadsheet with same.

3/24/2016 MRF Research files 6.10 457.50
75.00/hrContinued review of 2011 & 2012 accounting files for various entity

bank statements to expand upon banking spreadsheet.  Inventoried
statements and updated spreadsheet with same.

3/25/2016 MRF Research files 4.40 330.00
75.00/hrContinued review of 2010, 2011 & 2012 accounting files for Amkey

bank statements to expand upon banking spreadsheet.  Inventoried
statements and updated spreadsheet with same.

3/28/2016 MRF Research files 3.90 292.50
75.00/hrContinued review of 2010, 2011 & 2012 accounting files for Amkey

& additional entities to locate bank statements to expand upon
banking spreadsheet.  Inventoried statements and updated
spreadsheet with same.

MRF Research files 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrReceived directions from Alison Juroe and located payments to

and bank information for co-defendants.

3/29/2016 MRF Research files 0.90 67.50
75.00/hrContinued review of 2010, 2011 & 2012 accounting files for Ahome,

Apollo, Aborell & additional entities to locate bank statements to
expand upon banking spreadsheet.  Inventoried statements and
updated spreadsheet with same.

3/30/2016 MRF Research files 3.70 277.50
75.00/hrContinued review of 2010, 2011 & 2012 accounting files for L'BE

Group, Ahome, Apollo, Aborell & additional entities to locate bank
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statements to expand upon banking spreadsheet.  Inventoried
statements and updated spreadsheet with same.

3/31/2016 MRF Research files 2.80 210.00
75.00/hrContinued review of 2010, 2011 & 2012 accounting files for USFIA,

L'BE Group, Ahome, Apollo, Aborell & additional entities to locate
bank statements to expand upon banking spreadsheet.  Inventoried
statements and updated spreadsheet with same.

SUBTOTAL: [ 42.50 4,832.00]

Sell Property/Liquidate Assets

3/2/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrCreated custom property list for Receiver for potential buyer.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrLocated info on hotel from buyer documents taken from USFIA

office. Scanned and forwarded to Receiver to discuss with potential
buyer.

3/4/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.90 144.00
160.00/hrContacted several potential appraisers and brokers for sale of

hotel. Reviewed websites and past sale history. Had multiple phone
calls.

3/7/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrCreated master file for hotel sale; and complied additional broker

information; sent multiple emails with background info.

3/8/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrHad lengthy call with Jan's Towing regarding Chen's Mercedes;

emailed Receiver.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrSent email to David Zaro regarding status of Mercedes.

3/9/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrReceived and responded to email from David Zaro regarding

Mercedes.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrHad call with Justin Huchel of Hilton Hyland regarding home sales.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrHad call with Alexis Kim  regarding home sales.

3/17/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrReviewed voicemail forwarded by Tom Seaman regarding Quail

Hills land sale.  Returned call and answered questions.  Performed
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property research.

3/21/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrContact Ace Parking regarding storing vehicle in our parking lot for

30 days.  Requested and received parking form.

3/22/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.90 144.00
160.00/hrReceived word from counsel regarding vesting of title for Mercedes

from Steve Chen to Receiver.  Downloaded stipulation and order
from pacer.  Contacted Jan's towing to discuss options.  Explained
situation to receptionist and held for Susan Dunken.  While holding,
I scanned order and Stipulation as well as a copy of letter served
on the towing company by Allen Matkins and emailed to Susan
Dunken,  There were multiple calls and emails exchanged to make
sure all parties had necessary paperwork in front of them.  Spoke
with Susan Dunken and she informed me that the car was
auctioned on March 15th (they were served on the 8th). Susan
requested additional information which I sent and she advised that
she would speak to their attorney.

3/23/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 48.00
160.00/hrComposed email to Jans Towing and emailed more documents to

them regarding Mercedes - marked urgent.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReceived response from towing company; composed more detailed

response and copied Tim Hsu and follow up call with Tim Hsu
regarding next steps.

3/24/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrSent email to Doug Rugg re cars and vans.

3/28/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 176.00
160.00/hrReceived email from potential buyer of golf course property with

questions about particular parcel numbers. Researched parcel
numbers and sent reports to potential buyer; answered questions
and updated spreadsheet of potential buyers.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReview list of appraisers sent by Amber Hotel Group, send emails

regarding appraisal of hotel.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.00
160.00/hrMeet with Tim McDonnell regarding appraisal of golf course

property ask to get process started.

3/29/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrExchanged emails with Chuck LaPorte with Amber Hotel Group

regarding appraisal and eventual sale of hotel; had follow up call.
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3/29/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 96.00
160.00/hrHad conference calls with two potential appraisers for hotel and 1

appraiser for golf course.

3/30/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 64.00
160.00/hrReached out to multiple appraisal candidates for golf course

appraisal.  Composed and exchanged multiple emails to answer
questions regarding property.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived contact information for company who performed survey

of golf course property during last sale.  Emailed and left message.

3/31/2016 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 32.00
160.00/hrReceived response from appraiser regarding golf course land.

Relayed information to Tim and replied with answers to questions.

3/17/2016 TAS Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Avi re interest in hotel and other assets.

3/4/2016 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrQuestion to Tom re appraisals for sale properties. Relayed info to

Darren re same. Search online for same.

3/8/2016 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrSearched for possible appraisers for golf course.

3/25/2016 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLM and email to Premac re title insurance on properties.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall with Premac re properties to be sold and title issues and need

for legal docs dealing with the case. Discussed need for appraisal,
potential brokers for golf courses, etc. Call to Alison re registration
for title info. Filled out registration.

3/28/2016 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmails from title company with questions re parcels to sell and info

re appraiser for golf course and broker info.

3/29/2016 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Premac re title issues for properties to be sold eventually.

3/30/2016 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed golf course broker possiblity with Darren and appraisal

purposes.

SUBTOTAL: [ 11.00 1,834.50]
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         Hours          Amount

For professional services rendered $42,399.50257.30

Balance due $42,399.50
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp2.xls Summary By Timekeeper
Page 1 of 2

Thomas Seaman, Receiver Hours Rate Cost
Jan-16 15.0                  $375.00 $5,625.00
Feb-16 33.4                  $375.00 $12,525.00
Mar-16 12.7                  $375.00 $4,762.50
Total 61.1                  $375.00 $22,912.50

Alison Juroe, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
Jan-16 36.2                  $190.00 $6,878.00
Feb-16 52.9                  $190.00 $10,051.00
Mar-16 75.1                  $190.00 $14,269.00
Total 164.2                $190.00 $31,198.00

Timothy McDonnell, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
Jan-16 56.7                  $165.00 $9,355.50
Feb-16 73.5                  $165.00 $12,127.50
Mar-16 46.8                  $165.00 $7,722.00
Total 177.0                $165.00 $29,205.00

Darren Clevenger, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
Jan-16 23.0                  $160.00 $3,680.00
Feb-16 48.8                  $160.00 $7,808.00
Mar-16 49.0                  $160.00 $7,840.00
Total 120.8                $160.00 $19,328.00

Kristen Janulewicz, Accountant Hours Rate Cost
Jan-16 17.1                  $150.00 $2,565.00
Feb-16 36.3                  $150.00 $5,445.00
Mar-16 33.5                  $150.00 $5,025.00
Total 86.9                  $150.00 $13,035.00

January 1, 2016, through March 31, 2016

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for USFIA, Inc. et al
Second Interim Fee Application

Summary of Fees
Summary By Timekeeper
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp2.xls Summary By Timekeeper
Page 2 of 2

Various Adminstrative Assistants Hours Rate Cost
Jan-16 5.9                    $75.00 $442.50
Feb-16 34.0                  $74.00 $2,515.50
Mar-16 37.2                  $75.00 $2,781.00
Total 77.1                  $74.00 $5,739.00

Total Hours Rate Cost
Jan-16 153.9                $185.00 $28,546.00
Feb-16 278.9                $181.00 $50,472.00
Mar-16 254.3                $167.00 $42,399.50
Total, Receiver and Agent hours 687.1                $177.00 $121,417.50
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp2.xls Summary By Task
Page 2 of 3

Accounting and Reporting Hours Rate
Accounting and 

Reporting
Jan-16 22.7                $131 $2,985.00
Feb-16 47.5                $136 $6,438.50
Mar-16 42.0                $135 $5,674.00
Total Accounting and Reporting 112.2            $135 $15,097.50

Forensic Accounting Hours Rate Forensic Accounting
Jan-16 -                  $0 $0.00
Feb-16 -                  $0 $0.00
Mar-16 1.2                  $375 $450.00
Total Forensic Accounting 1.2                  $375 $450.00

Investor Relations Hours Rate Investor Relations 
Jan-16 10.4                $184 $1,916.00
Feb-16 13.4                $158 $2,114.50
Mar-16 14.0                $185 $2,587.50
Total Investor Relations 37.8              $175 $6,618.00

Litigation & Support Hours Rate Litigation & Support
Jan-16 -                  $0 $0.00
Feb-16 -                  $0 $0.00
Mar-16 4.0                  $190 $760.00
Total Litigation & Support 4.0                $190 $760.00

Manage Business Hours Rate Manage Business
Jan-16 21.8                $160 $3,488.00
Feb-16 20.5                $160 $3,280.00
Mar-16 35.8                $160 $5,728.00
Total Manage Business 78.1              $160 $12,496.00

Project Management Hours Rate Project Management
Jan-16 26.5                $188 $4,977.50
Feb-16 70.1                $179 $12,528.00
Mar-16 48.2                $188 $9,081.00
Total Project Management 144.8            $184 $26,586.50
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp2.xls Summary By Task
Page 3 of 3

Property Management Hours Rate Property Management

Jan-16 46.1                $165 $7,600.50

Feb-16 58.0                $165 $9,547.50

Mar-16 44.0                $168 $7,397.50
Total Property Management 148.1              $166 $24,545.50

Receiver Hours Rate Receiver
Jan-16 15.0                $375 $5,625.00
Feb-16 32.8                $375 $12,300.00
Mar-16 10.5                $375 $3,937.50
Total Receiver 58.3              $375 $21,862.50

Receivership Administration Hours Rate
Receivership 

Administration
Jan-16 7.4                  $161 $1,194.00
Feb-16 2.3                  $148 $340.50
Mar-16 1.1                  $107 $117.50
Total Receivership Administration 10.8              $153 $1,652.00

Research Files Hours Rate Research Files
Jan-16 4.0                  $190 $760.00
Feb-16 25.8                $94 $2,429.50
Mar-16 42.5                $114 $4,832.00
Total Research Files 72.3              $111 $8,021.50

Sell/Liquidate Assets Hours Rate Sell/Liquidate Assets
Jan-16 -                  $0 $0.00
Feb-16 8.5                  $176 $1,493.50
Mar-16 11.0                $167 $1,834.50
Total Sell Liquidate Assets 19.5              $171 $3,328.00

Total All Activities Hours Rate Total All Activities
Jan-16 153.9              $185 $28,546.00
Feb-16 278.9              $181 $50,472.00
Mar-16 254.3              $167 $42,399.50
Total All Activities 687.1            $177 $121,417.50
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