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Thomas A. Seaman 

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 

CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA 

WESTERN DIVISION 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION, 
 

Plaintiff, 
 

v. 
 
STEVE CHEN, USFIA, INC., 
ALLIANCE FINANCIAL 
GROUP, INC., AMAUCTION, INC., 
ABORELL MGMT I, LLC, ABORELL 
ADVISORS I, LLC, ABORELL 
REIT II, LLC, AHOME REAL 
ESTATE, LLC, ALLIANCE 
NGN, INC., APOLLO REIT I, INC., 
APOLLO REIT II, LLC, AMKEY, INC., 
US CHINA CONSULTATION 
ASSOCIATION, and QUAIL RANCH 
GOLF COURSE, LLC, 
 

Defendants. 
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RECEIVER'S SIXTH INTERIM FEE 
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Date: June 26, 2017 
Time: 9:00 a.m. 
Ctrm.: 850 
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Thomas A. Seaman ("Receiver"), the Court-appointed receiver for Defendants 

USFIA, Inc., Alliance Financial Group, Inc., Amauction, Inc., Aborell Mgmt I, LLC, 

Aborell Advisors I, LLC, Aborell REIT II, LLC, Ahome Real Estate, LLC, Alliance 

NGN, Inc., Apollo REIT I, Inc., Apollo REIT II, LLC, Amkey, Inc., US China 

Consultation Association, Quail Ranch Golf Course, LLC, and their subsidiaries and 

affiliates (collectively, "Receivership Entities"), hereby submits this sixth interim fee 

application.  This application covers the period from January 1, 2017, through 

March 31, 2017 ("Sixth Application Period"). 

During the Sixth Application Period, the Receiver and his staff spent 

1,140.3 hours executing the duties set forth in the Preliminary Injunction Order 

entered on October 6, 2015 ("PI Order").  As set forth in the Receiver's Seventh 

Interim Report ("Seventh Report"), the Receiver recovered $400,987 during the 

quarter and has recovered $30,042,577 in gross receipts for the receivership estate 

through March 31, 2017.  The Receiver seeks approval of $143,996 in fees incurred 

during the Sixth Application Period.  The fees were incurred at hourly rates ranging 

from $60 to $375 per hour.  The weighted average hourly rate was $126 per hour.  

The Receiver requests authority to pay 90 percent of this amount, or $129,596.40.  

The Receiver does not seek reimbursement of any expenses. 

I. SCOPE OF THE RECEIVER'S WORK 

As previously reported, the Receiver encountered highly volatile and 

multifaceted circumstances upon his ex parte appointment.  During the Sixth 

Application Period, the Receiver continued efforts to identify and marshal assets, 

account for receipts and disbursements of the Receivership Entities, and otherwise 

investigate potential sources of recovery.  The Receiver also preserved and managed 

real estate assets, including several single family properties, an apartment building, 

and a hotel in San Bernardino.  Significant progress towards liquidating real property 

assets was made during the quarter and several sale transactions have either already 
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closed or are expected to close soon.  Proceeds from real property sales are likely to 

exceed $8.5 million during the second quarter. 

The forensic accounting work declined as the basic accounting input is 

completed, while work to reconcile and analyze specific transactions continues.  

Forensic accounting fees comprised approximately 28% of the fees during the Sixth 

Application Period.  The Receiver also responded to the discovery requests of the 

parties. 

II. SUMMARY OF RECEIVER'S FEES 

Exhibit A provides a detailed listing of each time entry comprising the total 

fees for the Sixth Application Period of $143,996.  Exhibit B provides a summary by 

timekeeper and Exhibit C provides a summary by task.  The fees were incurred by 

month as follows: 

January 2017 $53,533.50 
February 2017 $40,409.50 
March 2017 $50,053.00 
Total $143,996.00 

During the Sixth Application Period, the gross cash receipts to the receivership 

estate were $400,987.  The gross receipts are broken down as follows: 

Real estate and Hotel revenue $392,336.10 

Interest Income $8,650.90 

For the Sixth Application Period, the hotel and real estate properties generated 

accrued revenue of $392,336.10 and the cost of managing the hotel and real estate 

properties were less than 6.5 percent of the revenue.  The average hourly rate was 

$165. 
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The following summarizes the charges listed in Exhibit A by category of fees: 

Task Hours Rate Amount 
Accounting and Reporting 84.2 $83 $7,027.50 
Forensic Accounting 527.8 $78 $41,067.00 
Investor Relations 58.0 $147 $8,541.50 
Manage Business 66.9 $165 $11,038.50 
Project Management 50.8 $195 $9,911.50 
Property Management 87.0 $165 $14,355.00 
Receiver 81.6 $375 $30,600.00 
Receivership Administration 88.6 $64 $5,714.00 
Sell Liquidate Assets 95.4 $165 $15,741.00 

Total All Activities 1,140.3 $126 $143,996.00 

In order to reduce fees, the Receiver delegates work to lower-priced 

employees of the Receiver at rates ranging from $60 to $200 per hour.  These 

employees worked 1,058.2 hours at an average hourly rate of $107, bringing the 

weighted average hourly rate to $126 per hour.  The Receiver has discounted his 

normal hourly rate from $400 to $375 for this case, which resulted in savings of 

$2,052.50 during the Sixth Application Period. 

Inception-to-date through March 31, 2017, the total fees for the Receiver are 

$1,150,319.  Gross receipts for the receivership estate through March 31, 2017, were 

$30,042,577.  As a percentage of gross receipts, the Receiver's total fees were 3.8%. 

III. SUMMARY OF TASKS PERFORMED 

Accounting and Reporting.  This category covers the cost of setting up and 

maintaining an accounting system to account for the receipts and disbursements of 

the receivership estate.  Tax reporting work is also included in this category.  For the 

Sixth Application Period, 84.2 hours were spent on accounting and reporting 

activities for a total of $7,027.50.  The average hourly rate was $83. 

Forensic Accounting.  The Receiver is in the process of conducting a forensic 

accounting of the receipts and disbursements of the Receivership Entities.  The 
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Receiver is using a Quickbooks model to conduct the accounting.  The Quickbooks 

model is a relational database that posts each receipt and disbursement to or from a 

particular bank account to an account established in a Chart of Accounts set up to 

collect costs by account category or asset type.  The database also assigns classes for 

each separate Receivership Entity and sub-classes comprised of money raising, 

money investing, and intercompany transfers and expenses.  The Quickbooks model 

has assisted the Receiver with identifying assets of the estate as well as reporting to 

the Court and the parties how the proceeds raised by entities were invested or spent. 

The accounting is voluminous and complex.  As the process has progressed, 

several additional accounts and entities have been identified and additional 

subpoenas have been required.  Production is ongoing and being incorporated, but 

will extend the time required to complete the accounting.  The additional work has 

identified additional recipients of transfers and assets.  The number of bank accounts 

used by the Receivership Entities that the Receiver is accounting for has grown to 

83 accounts.  Much of the back-up for deposits and checks is in Mandarin, which has 

slowed and complicated the process.  For some of the new accounts and entities that 

have been discovered, there is no back-up documentation.  Transactions valued at 

approximately $731 million have been entered into the Quickbooks model thus far.  

Given external receipts of approximately $204 million into the collective 

Receivership Entities, the velocity of money is high and funds turnover several times 

before leaving the enterprise.  Inter-enterprise transfers among the Receivership 

Entities are approximately $90,000,000. 

During the Sixth Application Period, fees incurred for forensic accounting 

work total $41,067 and represented 29% of fees incurred for the quarter.  Since the 

inception of the accounting, the work has consumed 3,407.9 hours at a cost of 

$368,756.50.  The weighted average hourly rate is $78.  The Receiver believes he is 

conducting the accounting in a cost-effective matter. 
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Investor Relations.  This category covers the cost of communicating with 

investors and includes creating and updating the receivership website, 

www.usfiareceiver.com, as well as responding to inquiries from investors and 

interested parties by telephone, mail, and emails sent via the www.usfiareceiver.com 

website.  For the Sixth Application Period, 58 hours were spent on these tasks for a 

total of $8,541.50.  The average hourly rate was $147. 

Manage Business.  This category relates primarily to managing the Hills 

Garden Hotel in San Bernardino, which took 66.9 hours at a cost of $11,038.50.  

Also included is time spent managing certain land holdings of the Receivership 

Entities.  The average hourly rate was $165. 

Project Management.  This category covers a variety of functions of managing 

the receivership estate and includes taking possession of bank accounts, identifying 

and marshalling assets, initiating subpoenas, investigating business operations and 

records, analyzing digital records, responding to subpoenas, managing and reviewing 

digital information, taking possession of real property assets, and a variety of matters 

required of the receivership estate.  In total, 50.8 hours were expended managing the 

affairs of the receivership estate for a total of $9,911.50, which equates to $195 per 

hour. 

Property Management.  This category covers the cost of managing the estate's 

real property assets.  During the Sixth Application Period, 87 hours were spent 

managing real estate for a total of $14,355, or $165 per hour. 

Receiver.  This category is only used by the Receiver and includes work to 

manage the myriad requirements of the receivership estate.  During this Sixth 

Application Period, identifying and marshalling assets, investigating the nature of the 

enterprise and its assets, reporting to the Court, dealing with Defendant Steve Chen 

and interested parties, gathering accounting information and beginning an accounting 

of the receipts and disbursements of the Receivership Entities were the primary focus 

of the Receiver's efforts.  The Receiver spent 81.6 hours on these tasks at a total cost 
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of $30,600.  In total the Receiver spent 82.1 hours, or approximately 16 percent of 

his time in the Sixth Application Period, on all tasks which included the Receiver, 

Forensic Accounting and Asset Sales categories at a total cost of $30,787.50. 

Receivership Administration.  This category consumed 88.6 hours for a total 

of $5,714 at an hourly rate of $64.  The work is primarily comprised of document 

preservation and organization and review of incoming mail, which provides 

invaluable clues to locating assets and other matters requiring the attention of the 

Receiver. 

Asset Sales.  This category includes work in preparing assets for sale, such as 

commissioning appraisals and retaining listing brokers, ordering title reports, leasing 

staging furniture and other work which enhances the value of the properties at sale.  

The hours worked were 95.4 for a total of $15,741, or $165 per hour. 

IV. STANDARDIZED FUND ACCOUNTING REPORT 

Attached hereto as Exhibit D is a Standardized Fund Accounting Report 

reflecting the receipts and disbursements for the Sixth Application Period. 

V. THE FEES AND COSTS ARE REASONABLE 

AND SHOULD BE ALLOWED 

"As a general rule, the expenses and fees of a receivership are a charge upon 

the property administered."  Gaskill v. Gordon, 27 F.3d 248, 251 (7th Cir. 1994).  

These expenses include the fees and expenses of this Receiver and his professionals, 

including Allen Matkins.  Decisions regarding the timing and amount of an award of 

fees and costs to the Receiver and his Professionals are committed to the sound 

discretion of the Court.  See SEC v. Elliot, 953 F.2d 1560, 1577 (11th Cir. 1992) 

(rev'd in part on other grounds, 998 F.2d 922 (11th Cir. 1993)). 

In allowing fees, a court should consider "the time, labor and skill required, 

but not necessarily that actually expended, in the proper performance of the duties 

imposed by the court upon the receiver, the fair value of such time, labor and skill 

measured by conservative business standards, the degree of activity, integrity and 
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dispatch with which the work is conducted and the result obtained."  United States v. 

Code Prods. Corp., 362 F. 2d 669, 673 (3d Cir. 1966) (internal quotation marks 

omitted).  In practical terms, receiver and professional compensation thus ultimately 

rests upon the result of an equitable, multi-factor balancing test involving the 

"economy of administration, the burden that the estate may be able to bear, the 

amount of time required, although not necessarily expended, and the overall value of 

the services to the estate."  In re Imperial 400 Nat'l, Inc., 432 F. 2d 232, 237 (3d Cir. 

1970).  Regardless of how this balancing test is formulated, no single factor is 

determinative and "a reasonable fee is based [upon] all circumstances surrounding 

the receivership."  SEC v. W.L. Moody & Co., Bankers (Unincorporated), 

374 F. Supp. 465, 480 (S.D. Tex. 1974). 

As a preliminary matter, the TRO and PI Order confer on the Receiver 

substantial duties and powers, including to conduct such investigation and discovery 

as is necessary to locate and account for all receivership assets, take such action as is 

necessary and appropriate to assume control over and preserve receivership assets, 

and employ attorneys and others to investigate and, where appropriate, institute, 

pursue, and prosecute all claims and causes of action of whatever kind and nature.  

See TRO, Part XI; PI Order, Part XI. 

The Receiver believes the rates and the total fees charged are reasonable in 

view of the challenges and circumstances encountered and respectfully requests an 

order approving the total fees submitted in the amount of $143,996 and ordering an 

interim payment of 90 percent of the fees incurred, or $129,596.40, from funds held 

by the Receiver.  Payment of the 10 percent holdback will be sought at the 

conclusion of the receivership. 

VI. CONCLUSION 

The Receiver, therefore, respectfully requests the Court enter an Order: 

1. Approving the Receiver's fees, on an interim basis, of $143,996; 
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Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA  92614

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen

May 15, 2017

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11182

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

1/3/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.60 195.00
75.00/hrMade the remaining December 2016 entries for sales and

automatic debits for the Hills Garden Hotel.  Ran reports and
forwarded to Darren Clevenger.

1/5/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.10 157.50
75.00/hrUpdated the Receiver's accounting with rental ACH payments and

bank debits.  Looked into payments that vendors had stated were
not received.  Printed cleared check images and forwarded re
same.

1/6/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.80 210.00
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed payments for the

receivership entities.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.70 127.50
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed payments for the Hills

Garden Hotel.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrMade the Quickbooks entries for the hotel's payroll for the period

ending 12/31/16.  Processed wage garnishment payment.

1/9/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.80 135.00
75.00/hrInput the sales revenue for the Hills Garden Hotel to Quickbooks

for the period 1/1 through 1/8.  Reviewed bank account and input

Exhibit A, Page 10
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 2Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

auto debits and merchant fees.

1/9/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.20 90.00
75.00/hrProcessed additional vendor payments for the receivership entities.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.60 120.00
75.00/hrProcessed additional vendor payments received for the Hills

garden Hotel.

1/11/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.40 180.00
75.00/hrInput auto debits drafted from bank account.  Paid additional

vendor bills and met with Thomas Seaman for approval of previous
accounts payable.  Received approval and gave Heidi instructions
for sending payments.

1/13/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.40 105.00
75.00/hrReceived info re annual tourism assessment tax due for the hotel

and reviewed validity.  Determined tax was applicable, completed
form, and processed payment.  Processed payment for hotel
manager's monthly reimbursement.  Made Quickbooks entries for
auto debits.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.70 52.50
75.00/hrReviewed bank account re missing vendor payment and forwarded

cleared check image.  Received approval from Thomas Seaman
and processed check for roof repairs at Alhambra Gardens.

1/16/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.60 120.00
75.00/hrInput the sales revenue to Quickbooks for the Hills Garden hotel for

1/9 through 1/15.  Reviewed bank account and entered the auto
debits for merchant fees, etc.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.10 157.50
75.00/hrEntered the January statement charges for the Alhambra

Apartment tenants.  Received payments in Quickbooks and
deposited checks.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.80 60.00
75.00/hrReceived vendor invoices from the Hills Garden Hotel that needed

immediate payment.  Received approval from Thomas Seaman
and sent payments.

1/17/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.10 82.50
75.00/hrReceived invoice and payment approval then processed check for

roof repairs at Alhambra Gardens.  Responded to inquiries from
Dominican counsel re payments sent.  Received notices re
chargebacks for the hotel and discussed applicability with Aprel.

1/18/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrProcessed final payment for roof repairs at Alhambra.  Received

info from HOA at Lynd Ave re sale documents and processed

Exhibit A, Page 11
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 3Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

payment.

1/20/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.80 60.00
75.00/hrReviewed invoices and processed payments for the receivership

entities.  

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 30.00
75.00/hrSaved copies of the Q4 2016 payroll tax returns and annual FUTA

returns for the Hills Garden Hotel.  Sent W2s re same.

1/23/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.90 67.50
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed checks for the

receivership entities for Thomas Seaman's review.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 37.50
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed checks for the Hills

Garden hotel for Thomas Seaman's review.

1/24/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.60 120.00
75.00/hrReceived funding request from hotel manager with vendor invoices.

Reviewed invoices and processed payments.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.50 112.50
75.00/hrInput the sales revenue to Quickbooks for the Hills Garden hotel for

1/16 through 1/23/17.  Review bank account and input auto debits
for merchant fees, etc.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrInput the payroll to Quickbooks for the Hills Garden hotel for the

period ending 1/15/17.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.10 82.50
75.00/hrRan the 2016 1099 report and reviewed eligible vendor.  Began

requesting W9s from vendors with none on file.

1/25/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.30 97.50
75.00/hrGave instructions/report to Tim McDonnell to contact vendors for

W9s that we do not have on file.  Communicated with additional
vendors to request W9s.  Input W9s received to system.

1/27/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.10 157.50
75.00/hrFollowed up with vendors to request W9s for 2016 tax purposes. 

Input W9s received to system and followed up with Tim re pending
vendors.  Sent instructions to Aprel re hotel vendors to request
W9s from.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.30 97.50
75.00/hrLooked up vendor payment details per Tim's request and

forwarded information.  Reviewed accounting information and

Exhibit A, Page 12
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 4Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

forwarded per Thomas Seaman's instructions.

1/30/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.90 142.50
75.00/hrGathered additional vendor W9s and input to system.  Follow up

calls with vendors re same.

1/31/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.60 195.00
75.00/hrFollowed up with remaining vendors, received W9s and input to

system.  Mapped accounts in Quickbooks, processed W9s, and
gave instructions to Bonnie for preparing mailings.

1/26/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 0.10 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrDirection on Chen fee app.

SUBTOTAL: [ 41.80 3,127.50]

Forensic Accounting              

1/4/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 2.40 480.00
200.00/hrReview accounting entries. Confer with Heidi re same.  Run reports

and review bank balances and turnover balances.  Identify
additional areas of focus. Make corrections to classes, and GL
accounts.  Review email from bank with records requested. 

1/11/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.20 240.00
200.00/hrReview entries, and confer with Heidi re same.  Provide instruction

and direction on next steps, etc. 

1/12/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.30 60.00
200.00/hrReview messages from Heidi. Confer with Tom re changes to

accounting.

1/13/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.20 240.00
200.00/hrReceived bank records from Citibank.  Download and review same.

1/16/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.10 220.00
200.00/hrReview progress, confer with Heidi re same. Run reports.

1/23/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 2.20 440.00
200.00/hrConfer with Heidi re entries, corrections, etc.  Review banking

records and determine additional work to be completed.  

1/27/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.50 100.00
200.00/hrConfer with Heidi re the status of Chenne accounts.  Review

entries and report on missing items.  Prepare and send email to
Tim Hsu to request the missing items.  

1/31/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 2.10 420.00
200.00/hrReview entries, and run reports. Confer with Heidi re status and

progress. Review next items to be completed, etc.  Run reports by

Exhibit A, Page 13
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Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 5Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

class, etc.

1/17/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 4.50 270.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430, 2010, 2011 debits.

1/25/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 4.50 270.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430, 2010, 2011 debits.

1/26/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 5.00 300.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430, 2010, 2011 debits.

1/27/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 6.00 360.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,  January - July 2011 debits.

1/30/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 6.00 360.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,  January - July 2011 debits.

1/3/2017 DC Forensic Accounting 1.40 231.00
165.00/hrMade clarifications on unlabeled bank turnover files re deposits,

checks written and received.

DC Forensic Accounting 1.40 231.00
165.00/hrMade clarifications on unlabeled bank turnover files re deposits,

checks written and received.

HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for Steamfont Investment Group BofA

8477.

1/4/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for Steamfont Investment Group BofA

8477.

1/5/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.00 420.00
70.00/hrFinish inputting data into QuickBooks for Steamfont Investment

Group BofA acct xx8477 and BofA acct xx1235. Start reconciling
BofA acct xx1235.

1/6/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.50 525.00
70.00/hrReconciliation for Steamfont Investment Group LLC BofA acct

xx8477 and 1235. Organize the requested bank statements list. 

1/10/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 5.00 350.00
70.00/hrComparing Arcadia Office QuickBooks with Forensic  Accounting

QuickBooks for Unspecified Expenses account.

1/11/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 5.50 385.00
70.00/hrComparing Arcadia Office QuickBooks with Forensic  Accounting

QuickBooks for Unspecified Expenses account.
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1/12/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrAdjust Product Sales account. Make the Classes match the bank

accounts for Investor Funds and Product Sales.

1/13/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrAdjust Product Sales account. And start adjusting Southern

California Edison Utility acct .

1/16/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrContinue adjusting Product Sales account. Print out bank

statements for Chenny Corporation for BofA acct xx6075 and
Citibank acct xx8430. Start inputting data for Chenne Corporation
Citibank acct xx 8430.

1/17/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx 8430.

1/18/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx 8430.

1/19/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx8430.

1/20/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.00 420.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx8430.

1/23/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx8430.

1/24/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx8430.

1/25/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.00 490.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx8430 and acct

xx9622.

1/26/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.00 420.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct  xx9622.

1/27/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct  xx9622 and BofA

acct xx6075.  Adjust the accounts for the Gas Company and make
them consistent. 

1/30/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct BofA acct xx6075. 
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1/31/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 4.50 315.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct BofA acct xx6075. 

1/4/2017 MRF Forensic Accounting 0.90 67.50
75.00/hrAssisted Tim McDonnell with reviewing forensic accounting and

backup documents to locate furniture purchases reimbursed by the
receivership entities for one of the receivership properties.  Located
documents and explained payment reconciliation.

1/12/2017 MRF Forensic Accounting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrResponded to question from Heidi re locating unknown transaction

and accounting for same.  Reviewed Quickbooks files and provided
information needed.

1/13/2017 MRF Forensic Accounting 1.40 105.00
75.00/hrReceived instructions from Alison Juroe re payment details for

Shiny Stones.  Gathered payables report and cancelled check
images, then sent to legal counsel for review.

1/12/2017 TAS Forensic Accounting 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re accounting input process.

1/3/2017 TM Forensic Accounting 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrMade and sent bank account information request.

1/11/2017 TM Forensic Accounting 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDirection from Alison re need to call bank re wire transfer.

Discussed with Heidi and gathered documentation in preparation of
the call.

SUBTOTAL: [ 187.40 14,745.50]

Investor Relations                  

1/11/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrReview emails and correspondence from investors.

1/26/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.50 100.00
200.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

1/31/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrReview messages and correspondence. Call with vendor inquiring

about claims process.

1/5/2017 HG Investor Relations 2.00 140.00
70.00/hrTranslation for Case documents for USFIA, Inc.
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1/6/2017 HG Investor Relations 0.50 35.00
70.00/hrContinue translating for Case Documents.

1/30/2017 TM Investor Relations 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Alison re need for export of contacts on email subscriber

list and spreadsheet of mass email list. Made both and sent to her
via email.

1/31/2017 TM Investor Relations 2.60 429.00
165.00/hrLoaded multiple pdfs onto case documents page of web site.

SUBTOTAL: [ 7.30 1,026.50]

Manage Business                  

1/1/2017 DC Manage Business 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrTravel time to and from hotel billed at half.

DC Manage Business 1.80 297.00
165.00/hrOnsite at hotel. Worked on security cameras and checked

reservations.  Walked outside to review damage to one external
camera.

1/2/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrReviewed year end numbers for hotel.  Entered into comparative

spreadsheet for prior 3 years and analyzed.

1/3/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
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accounting.

1/3/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrReviewed payroll, hours and overtime.  Sent to payroll company

and confirmed details with manager.  Reviewed tentative numbers
and spreadsheet corrections; approved.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReviewed December P&L.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDownload recently filed documents off Pacer for Receiver's files

and for posting on receivership website.  

1/4/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrReviewed change in conditions information for earthquake

insurance. Received workers comp audit results and had
conference call with broker to appeal decision.

1/5/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.
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1/5/2017 DC Manage Business 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReviewed transient lodging tax and deposits.

1/6/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

1/9/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/10/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.
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1/11/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/12/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/13/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

1/16/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 
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1/16/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/17/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/18/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrWorked on payroll for hotel.

1/19/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/20/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
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accounting.

1/20/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

1/23/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/24/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed and forwarded Magnuson invoice and STR report.

1/25/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
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accounting.

1/25/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/26/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed quote for remaining ice machine repair.  Since hotel had

no machines working I authorized repair but performed research
and made calls.  Notified.

1/27/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

1/30/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 
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1/30/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

1/31/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

SUBTOTAL: [ 24.40 4,026.00]

Project Management              

1/2/2017 AJ Project Management 1.00 200.00
200.00/hrConfer with Tom re reports. Review accounting and reconcile

account. Calls with Darren re same. Review bank statement sent
by Darren.

1/3/2017 AJ Project Management 0.50 100.00
200.00/hrCalls with Tom re details for disgorgement calculations.

AJ Project Management 4.60 920.00
200.00/hrReceive direction from Tom re investments made in USFIA and the

corresponding back office entries.  Run reports in Forensic
accounting Quickbooks, pull deposit info and locate the purchases
in back office database.  Prepare and email examples to Tom.

AJ Project Management 0.40 80.00
200.00/hrReview email from Tim Hsu re escrow company subpoena.  Look

up and provide the detail requested to issue the subpoena. 

1/4/2017 AJ Project Management 2.20 440.00
200.00/hrComplete revisions to the disgorgement chart. Email to Tom for

further direction.

AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview email from Richard Robinson. Email to David Jimenez at

BRG for updated forensic images chart.
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1/7/2017 AJ Project Management 2.50 500.00
200.00/hrMet with Tom re deposition preparation. Ran reports and pulled

information needed for same.  Review accounting entries, and
made corrections, etc.

1/16/2017 AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview email from Dominican counsel re update on matter.

1/23/2017 AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview emails from Richard Robinson and Tom re setting a call.

1/24/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrAccept conference call invitation re Dominican matter.

1/25/2017 AJ Project Management 0.70 140.00
200.00/hrConference call with Tom and attorneys re Dominican matter.

AJ Project Management 1.60 320.00
200.00/hrCall with Tom and DOJ related to subpoena response, status on

accounting, and other issues.

AJ Project Management 1.70 340.00
200.00/hrWork on finding items requested by Dominican counsel and DOJ.

1/27/2017 AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview message from David Jimenez re Ahome database reports,

translations, etc.

AJ Project Management 0.40 80.00
200.00/hrReview email from Ted and Tim re Chen houses stipulation. Confer

with Tom re same. Emails with group and title rep regarding
language for order.

1/30/2017 AJ Project Management 2.50 500.00
200.00/hrWork on gathering items and info for DOJ pursuant to their

subpoena.  Review documents and records collected. 

1/31/2017 AJ Project Management 1.50 300.00
200.00/hrWork on items needed by DOJ and counsel in Dominican. Email

some items to Richard Robinson. Review emails re meeting at site.
Review emails from David with info on Ahome.  

1/3/2017 DC Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReviewed IT invoices.
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1/7/2017 DC Project Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrAssisted Receiver with preparation for SEC.

1/25/2017 DC Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed and approved IT bills from OC Networking.

1/28/2017 DC Project Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrInstalled new version of Quickbooks on computer of Alison Juroe to

work with turnover files.

1/27/2017 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Tom re need for document re Preliminary Injunction.

SUBTOTAL: [ 22.00 4,347.50]

Property Management           

1/16/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

1/23/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

1/30/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

1/3/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived invoices for landscaping and approved.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived invoices for pool services and approved.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived move out notice, made into pdf, printed for files. Update

to tenant matrix. Text to handyman re getting invoice in same
package as rents. Text re recent work related to heating unit.

TM Property Management 2.40 396.00
165.00/hrSearched through receipts looking for additional expense reports re

Lynd re abandonment. Checked other similar reimbursements to
find correct payees.

Exhibit A, Page 26

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 27 of 125   Page ID
 #:7601



Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 18Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

1/3/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Alison re Chase mortgage.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail re roof repair bid. Forwarded to Tom.

1/4/2017 TM Property Management 2.50 412.50
165.00/hrResearch into receipts for advance payments.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from potential tenant re application. Asked them to send via

email.

1/5/2017 TM Property Management 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrEmail from tenant re roof leak, text to handyman for immediate

temporary repairs. Made overhead picture of roof area for roofer
and marked up the picture for better understanding of where units
are. Got approval for first roof repair from Tom, email to roofer to
begin with directions re starter check, etc. Call from handyman re
status of temporary repairs.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmail from potential tenant re unit CC. Visit from potential tenant

and gathered documents re potential contract with housing
authority.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrTexts to and from handyman re heater repair.

1/6/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived invoices for landscaping for several months, approved,

made envelope and sent.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived invoices for security at Live Oak, approved and turned in.

1/9/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice for security service, approved.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from security re roof leak.

1/10/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from fire extinguisher inspector re scheduling yearly

inspection. Email to onsite manager re same.
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1/10/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to roofer re start date.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrSearches for massage chair and any other easily determined items

in forensic accounting. Sent email with pictures, receipts, etc. to
Huron re getting notice to the tenant.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrScheduled exterminator for Alhambra Gardens.

1/11/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from exterminator and re-scheduled next appointment for

Alhambra Gardens.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrVoicemail from contractor re roof repair.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from potential tenant at Alhambra and rescheduled follow-up

call re decision of Receiver re tenancy.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Huron re abandonment notice.

1/12/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from prospective tenant.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from tenant re roof repairs. Text to handyman re same.

1/13/2017 TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Whitfield re start time on roof, made overhead picture for

him re other area to make estimate, sent to him. Arranged for
starter check for roof repair.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to tenant re roof repairs.

1/14/2017 TM Property Management 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrCalls and texts to handyman and roofer re visit to Alhambra roof.

Calls, texts and emails to tenants re opportunity to see any inside
damage. Visit to property with roofer and checked roof and inside
damage and discussed options, need for additional estimate for
roof over unit DD. Checked north side of property to check if dirt
needed removal. Also discussed Live Oak roof issue.
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1/14/2017 TM Property Management 0.90 148.50
165.00/hrTravel to and from Alhambra Gardens; at half pay.

1/16/2017 TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCalls, emails and texts with roofer re start time at Alhambra, made

overhead picture of Live Oak re leak. Call with security re same.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCalls with security guard re clean up at Live Oak re deadly

branches, trash, sprinkler, parking lot. Pictures re roof needs. Call
with roofer.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved landscape invoice.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMade copies and scans of rent checks and turned into Matthew.

1/17/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved security invoice and submitted.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrCall from roofing contractor and security guard re inspection today

and got Tom's approval to move forward, made request for starter
check.

1/18/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from roofer re final payment and authorization re Live Oak.

Received final invoice for Unit U work and submitted. Discussed
rain schedule and other items to check on.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from security re status of finished roof repairs and discussed

plastic bags over previously found minor leaks.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrSearch for contractor re dirt removal.

1/19/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice from water company for Fairview and checked if

our check went out.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Whitfield re continued leaking. Call with security to

arrange a trip on Saturday to check out other potential areas of
leaking.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from tenant re water coming through foundation of Alhambra

Gardens.
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1/19/2017 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCall from potential tenant and prepared info for Tom. Review of

Section 8 info.

1/20/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall with security re time to have roofing contractor open up the

ceiling to find additional leaks.

1/21/2017 TM Property Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrTravel to Lynd and Live Oak and back; at half pay.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrChecked out Lynd property and checked furniture for labels.

TM Property Management 2.70 445.50
165.00/hrVisit to Live Oak to meet with roof contractor and security re

continued leaks from roof. Had drywall removed to find source of
coninued leaks. Determined roof is ok but the drains have been
compromised and require re-work. Other drains in other areas on
roof are plugged and require snaking and re-work. Arranged with
contractor a Thursday appointment to re-do drains. Also reviewed
water leaks from A/C areas at other parts of roof. Also discussed
needed estimate for roof work at Alhambra and need for significant
dirt removal from backside of Alhambra.

1/23/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from security re status of leaks from recent rains and

discussed leaks in office areas, continued drips from drain area,
tree branch which came down, two drains not working from roof.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCall to exterminator to move back service by one week. Letter to

tenants and sent to onsite manager.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived pictures of flooding at Alhambra Gardens.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDownloaded recently filed PACER documents to pubdocs.

1/24/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from handyman re roof leak in unit NN. Approved minor

temporary issues.  Text to same. Another call re the old leak and
tenants wanting some touch up work done.
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1/24/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from prospective tenant.

1/25/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrText from onsite manager and arranged for repair service on

washing machine which is not rotating.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from prospective tenant.

1/26/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from prospective tenant re Section 8, move in date, discussed

need for property to be inspected.

TM Property Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrDiscussed with Matthew need for W-9's, sent requests to 7 different

vendors and received some and turned into Matthew.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall with insurance broker re assets with upcoming renewals,

discussed need for approval. Spoke with Tom re Oak Mountain re
same and got approval for renewal. Email to broker re same. Asked
for renewal quotes on 4 properties.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall with contractor re Live Oak and Alhambra roofing issues,

estimates and discussed need for approval and starter payment.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Huron re abandonment of Lynd. Emailed reply re same.

TM Property Management 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrMade presentation of roof leaks and estimates of roof problems at

Alhambra and Live Oak. Got approval for projects. Calls and emails
with contractor re previous payment, searched for payments
record, took picture and sent to contractor. Discussed drain issues
at Live Oak. Discussed need to get insid units which had roof
problems for correction work inside.

1/27/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail to Warlin re renewal of Oak Mountain insurance. Direction to

FedEx. Made envelope and approved invoice for Matthew to pay
out.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from tenant re loose plumbing in shower and cabinet doors not

latching. Sent text to handyman re same.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMade picture with direction for soil removal contractor describing

total amount of soil to be removed.

Exhibit A, Page 31

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 32 of 125   Page ID
 #:7606



Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 23Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

1/27/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from and to attorney re Lynd.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrQuestion from Matthew re ability to lower recycle of yard waste cost.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall with landscaper re check, had Matthew check on progress.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrVerified time to meet contractor re soil removal. Discussed ceiling

repairs, as well. Emails to both tenants re access.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail re upcoming insurance renewal re other properties.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails to tnents re getting permission to check their ceilings with a

contractor.

1/28/2017 TM Property Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrTravel to Alhambra Gardens, and back; at half pay.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrMade FedEx envelopes and deposit slips for Alhambra onsite

manager. Made overhead pictures for soil removal contractor.
Prepared for trip to Alhambra.

TM Property Management 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrMet with roofing and soil removal contractor re back side of

property and discussed problems with removing soil and getting
bobcat machine into the area, need for several dumpsters for soil,
gas lines, trrenching, etc. Went into units with water leak damage to
inspect ceiling.

1/30/2017 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail with additional info sent from insurance agent re Oak

Mountain, prepared for signature. Made FedEx package for quick
delivery of check and renewal papers. Spoke with Matthew re
same. Email from and to broker.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Warlin with update re Lynd policy and discussed Balboa

and that the renewal has been submitted for Oak Mountain.
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1/30/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from security re status of Live Oak drain repair/replacement

work and extensive amount of previous roof materials on the roof
that needed removal, Additional water was inside the roof materials
and came down requiring clean up. Gave direction for need for
pictures and approved any overtime if needed since the job was
going much longer than expected.

1/31/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrTexts from potential tenant at Alhambra Gardens, replied re same.

Call and LM to case worker at HACOLA.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText from Matthew re W-9 for Private Security. Call to Landfried re

same. Emailed the W-9 to Matthew.

SUBTOTAL: [ 30.70 5,065.50]

Receiver                                

1/2/2017 TAS Receiver 1.40 525.00
375.00/hrDevelop chart setting forth gross receipts and making adjustments

to arrive at disgorgement recommendation, review inputs for same
and adjust, direct Alison re details and completing.

1/3/2017 TAS Receiver 1.10 412.50
375.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to and from LA on train.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with counsel in advance of meeting with SEC.

TAS Receiver 5.50 2,062.50
375.00/hrMeet with SEC re accounting for penalties and disgorgement.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone calls with Alison re details for disgorgement calculations.

1/4/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConsider final disgorgement recommendation and forward to SEC

and counsel.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Eva re showing, encourage offer, discuss

possible price reduction.

1/5/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re Alhambra Gardens roof condition and need to

repair.
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1/6/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrPrint and review documents in preparation for meeting with SEC.

TAS Receiver 0.80 300.00
375.00/hrRead Oak Mountain appraisal. Telephone call with Eva Lin re price

reduction.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrWork on final judgment.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re Rancho Cucamonga listing. 

1/7/2017 TAS Receiver 5.40 2,025.00
375.00/hrMeet with Doug Miller of SEC re trial preparation, review with him

sources of information and accounting for disgorgement and civil
penalties, calculation of prejudgment interest.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrRetrieve and assemble documents to review before testimony.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrGive direction re forensic accounting re class and subclass

reconciliations.

1/9/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrRecalculate prejudgment interest calculations.

1/11/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Matt re bills and sign checks.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrPerform prejudgment interest calculation using new disgorgement

number but have it inclusive of interest.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re listing agreement, note changes needed, review

and execute.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re Alhambra repairs, also tenant approval.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview Live Oak appraisal, consider value.
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1/12/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview offer, make counter with court approval terms.

1/13/2017 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrCalls with Eva re offer and counter.

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrApprove repair invoice, sign check.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re counter off on Fairview.

1/16/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrFinalize listing agreement for Rancho Cucamonga.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and approve payments.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Matt re hotel bills.

1/17/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrConfer re Eva Lin re price reduction, execute authorization.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re roofing issues and approve work, deposit.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re roof repairs at Live Oak, Telephone call with

Walli re same.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer and give direction re multiple offers on Fairview.

1/18/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReviewing incoming offers, give direction on counters.

1/19/2017 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrConsider offers on Fairview, direct Tim re; follow up re status; direct

re acceptance of all cash buyer, direct Tim re counter offer
language, finalize.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrConfer with Darren re Quail Ranch offer, review terms and

qualifications, use, etc.
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1/19/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Darren re hotel marketing.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with and direct Tim re Section 8 tenant.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position for Hotel.

1/20/2017 TAS Receiver 1.10 412.50
375.00/hrReview incoming offer on Quail Ranch, review appraisal and

forensic accounting re basis, review comps, Telephone call with
Howard re acceptance and counter offer terms and conditions and
timing, overbid.

1/23/2017 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrEmails with Richard Robinson re conference call re subpoena

production.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position for Hotel.

1/24/2017 TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrTelephone calls with Eva Lin re offers, counter offers, docusign, etc.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and approve disclosures.

1/25/2017 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrFinalize LOI on Quail Ranch forward to counsel.

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrConfer with Matt re Hills Garden bills to pay.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrMeet with Matt re payroll tax returns, execute same.

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrConference call with Dominican counsel.

TAS Receiver 1.60 600.00
375.00/hrConference call with AUSA re subpoena production, status of

receivership.

Exhibit A, Page 36

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 37 of 125   Page ID
 #:7611



Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 28Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

1/25/2017 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrSend emails to AUSA re subpoena production.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrDocusign more disclosures for escrow, waiver of contingencies.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrFinalize LOI. Telephone call with counsel re same, forward LOI for

contract preparation.

TAS Receiver 1.10 412.50
375.00/hrSeveral calls with Eva re multiple counter offers, engender bidding

war, direct Eva re same, docusign counters.

1/26/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Eva Lin, bidding war working, new bidder

surfaces with above asking offer, direct re acceptance.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re escrow changes and renting premises prior to

sale.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re roof repairs needed at Live Oak and Alhambra

Gardens.

TAS Receiver 2.80 1,050.00
375.00/hrConsider forensic accounting issues, prepare outline and

introduction, subject areas, forward to counsel. 

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re title issues.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrDirect Tim re insurance needs.

1/27/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer re stipulation re turnover of residences, title, order, etc.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrDirect Tim re Fairview sales motion and contract details.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer re lease to accommodate buyer.

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrDirect Matt to retrieve information from accounting. 
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1/27/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrDirect staff re staging and payment.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrConfer re sales motion, direct re documents needed and have

forwarded, contract review and documents for motion.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer re turnover of Chen houses.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrRequest accounting information from Matt, review and forward to

propounding party.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrExecute lease.

1/31/2017 TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrReview and edit motion for Fairview condo, add facts re offers and

price, forward to counsel to revise.

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrRead draft purchase agreement for Quail Ranch, revisions re

same, forward to broker to forward to buyer.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re information for sale motions.

SUBTOTAL: [ 42.30 15,862.50]

Receivership Administration  

1/31/2017 BC Receivership Administration 0.70 42.00
60.00/hrAssisted Matt in processing mailings of 2016 1099's

1/9/2017 HG Receivership Administration 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrOrganize and label the files for Aborell MGMT, Inc.'s BofA acct

xx3688. Pull out the wires and place them with the bank statements.

1/10/2017 HG Receivership Administration 3.00 210.00
70.00/hrContinue organizing and label the files for Aborell MGMT, Inc.'s

BofA acct xx3688. 

1/11/2017 HG Receivership Administration 1.20 84.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for Hills Garden

Hotel..
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1/12/2017 HG Receivership Administration 1.30 91.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for USFIA, Inc.

1/20/2017 HG Receivership Administration 2.00 140.00
70.00/hrOrganize files for USFIA, Inc. when the server is down.

1/25/2017 HG Receivership Administration 0.80 56.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for USFIA, Inc.

HG Receivership Administration 0.30 21.00
70.00/hrFile the documents for Steamfont Investment Group  BofA acct

xx1235 and 8477.

1/26/2017 HG Receivership Administration 0.80 56.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for USFIA, Inc.

HG Receivership Administration 0.90 63.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for Hills Garden

Hotel, LLC.

SUBTOTAL: [ 19.00 1,323.00]

Sell Property/Liquidate Assets

1/3/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrSPoke with Howard Hamlin; gave info on schedule and contact info

for caretaker

1/19/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrDiscuss offer on Quail Ranch and review; reach out to broker for

hotel and review status of responses to emails.  Discuss with
Receiver.

1/24/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrSent GLC appraisal info to accounting.

1/3/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived and printed appraisal for Oak Mountain.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived corrected invoices for recent appraisals and submitted.

Checked with Matt if any previous invoice submitted.

1/5/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrDirection from Tom re preparing new broker listing agreement for

Rancho Cucamonga raw land. Found previous document and
prepared.
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1/6/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrFinished broker listing agreement and sent to Hamlin via email. 

Emails from Tom re same, call with Hamlin re need for initial listing
price.

1/9/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from broker re needed repairs to Balboa.

1/10/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Hamlin and discussed potential pricing of Rancho

Cucamonga property, discussed values according to housing
developer, mitigation land pricing, etc. Asked for email to Tom re
same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrReceived broker opinion of value on Balboa and repair estimates

and reviewed.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived appraisal for Live Oak and reviewed.

1/11/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrReceived offer on Fairview, reviewed, call to broker re interest in

property after the Christmas time period. Discussed potential
counter offer and brought to Tom. Received direction for counter
offer.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrPrinted recent appraisal on Live Oak for Tom and discussed

potential repair work at Balboa.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrEdit to listing agreement for Rancho Cucamonga, had Tom sign

and sent to broker.

1/12/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall with Hamlin re property. Email from title company re start of

prelim. Email to Hamlin to cancel as Prelim already made.

1/13/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrCall with Hamlin re title and documents. Cut appraisal into several

documents to be small enough to send via email and sent prelims
and appraisals, with other docs to him.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrCall with Kim re counter offer, prepared and sent to her. Received

her document, made changes, call to Tom and gathered signature.
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1/13/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrDiscussed Alhambra, Balboa and Lynd with Kim re repairs, etc.

1/16/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrRan title report information and gathered documents re question

from broker re easement at Rancho Cucamonga. Made 8 profile
reports with documents.

1/17/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrCounter offer received from broker, discussed need for HOA docs

and made request for Matt to cut check for same. Discussed
another offer that is to come tomorrow. Discussed difference in
terms, etc.

1/18/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrRead through counter offer re offer re Fairview. Saved document

and prepared for Tom with an email re status of additional offer to
come in today. Call with Tom and sent counter direction to broker.
Received additional offer from another buyer and informed Tom re
specifics. Sent to Tom.

1/19/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmails from Kim with counter offers for recent offers, reviewed, call

from Kim, email to Tom re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 2.00 330.00
165.00/hrMultiple calls, texts, emails and signing of purchase agreement with

addendums and other items with broker for Fairview.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed letter of intent for Quail Ranch. Email from

broker re item, followup email letting me know he found the
documentation.

1/20/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReviewed offer on Quail Ranch and call to Hamlin re same. Call to

Tom re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with Kim re staging and disclosures.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from title with easement plotting, email to Hamlin re same.

1/23/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrDisclosures from broker re Fairview.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived additional disclosure hazard report from broker and

printed for review.
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1/23/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived revised titles for items to post to web site from Heidi and

discussed with her possible alternatives which would make sense
to Chinese readers.

1/24/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 2.20 363.00
165.00/hrFilled out disclosures for Fairview. Call to Tom re same and sent to

broker. Signed NHD report and sent to broker.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail re repair requests at Fairview.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Hamlin re other title report that was received.

1/25/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrEmails, calls and discussion re Fairview sale with broker and Tom.

Sent info to broker and discussed possibility of renting to
prospective buyer due to need to move out of home and attempts
to get short escrow. Email to broker re need for pdf of full sale
agreement to send to attorneys re Motion to Sell Real Estate.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmails, calls and discussion re Quail Ranch sale. Direction re title

company and need to plot easements.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrRequest for Fairview full document for attorneys.

1/26/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Hamlin re title for Quail Ranch, sent him the prelim,

email from Hamlin re need to have easements plotted. Gave go
ahead. Email from Premac re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived escrow instructions for Fairview. Reviewed.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from broker re potential renting to prospective buyer. Looked

on Zillow for rent estimates and presented to Tom. Discussed with
Tom.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall with title company and emails re easement plotting and need

for immediate work due to short contingency period. Discussion
with Tom re title companies direction re providing insurance with
opposition to sale or without oppositiion.
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1/27/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Matthew re staging invoice for Oak Mountain. Call to

broker re potential proration. Call from broker re same and that
prorated amount to come on Monday. Also discussed escrow and
timing, back-up offer.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCalls to and from broker re Fairview, emails with direction re lease

to be drawn up for potential buyer. Had Tom docusign final
documents.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrGathered copy of listing agreement and sent to attorney re Fairview.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrMade large pdf of total sales agreement for attorney to include in

sale motion. Email from Tom to add other items related to property.
Looked up U/D action and included many items. Explained U/D,
sent grant deeds, etc.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDirection from Tom re sending appraisal to attorney, sent in several

parts due to large sizes.

1/30/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Fates with questions re appraisal, comparable pricing for

other units nearby of Fairview, reason for lowering the price from
original offer amount. Discussed price paid by defendants, etc.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrEmail from broker re Fairview Motion to Sell.  Read through and

gave my thoughts on same. Checked through previous emails to
broker re overbid process largely eliminated, initial visit to property,
etc. Sent via email.

1/31/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Fates re comments on motion to approve sale of

Fairview. Call to Tom, replied in email to Fates. Calls from Tom re
other particulars of the history of Fairview and sales efforts.

SUBTOTAL: [ 24.30 4,009.50]

For professional services rendered $53,533.50399.20

Balance due $53,533.50
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Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA  92614

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen

May 15, 2017

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11182

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

2/10/2017 AJ Accounting & Reporting 3.50 700.00
200.00/hrReconcile bank accounts for quarterly report.

2/3/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.70 202.50
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed payments for the

receivership entities.  Met with Thomas Seaman for approval and
gave Heidi instructions for sending payments.

2/6/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.30 97.50
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed payments for the Hills

Garden Hotel.  Met with Thomas Seaman for approval and gave
Heidi instructions for sending payments.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.30 97.50
75.00/hrInput remaining sales data and expenses for January into

Quickbooks for the Hills Garden Hotel and ran reports.  Input the
sales to Quickbooks for 2/1 through 2/5.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrInput the payroll for the period ending 1/31/17 into Quickbooks for

the Hills Garden Hotel.

2/7/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.80 60.00
75.00/hrSpoke with Darren Clevenger re missing cell tower payments and

forwarded details requesting turnover from bank.  Received info for
property insurance payment on Quail Ranch and processed
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payment.

2/13/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrReceived info re gas bill due for Alhambra apartments and

processed payment.  Reviewed notice from loan officer re
Alhambra apartments and reviewed information being requested.

2/14/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.60 195.00
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed payments for the

receivership entities.  Met with Thomas Seaman for approval and
gave Heidi instructions for sending payments.

2/15/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.80 60.00
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed payments for the Hills

Garden Hotel.  Met with Thomas Seaman for approval and gave
Heidi instructions for sending payments.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.90 142.50
75.00/hrInput the Alhambra tenant statement charges for February into

Quickbooks.  Deposited payments received and made the
accompanying accounting entries.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.20 90.00
75.00/hrInput the sales revenue for the hotel for 2/6 through 2/14/15 into

Quickbooks.  Reviewed the bank account and made the
Quickbooks entries for merchant fee auto debits.  Spoke with Aprel
re cash deposit discrepancy.  

2/17/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 22.50
75.00/hrPrinted financial statements per Thomas Seaman's instructions and

deposited payment received.

2/21/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.20 90.00
75.00/hrProcessed accounts payable for the Hills Garden Hotel.  Met with

Thomas Seaman for approval of same.

2/27/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.80 135.00
75.00/hrReviewed and processed accounts payable for the receivership

entities/properties.  Met with Thomas Seaman for approval of same.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.40 105.00
75.00/hrReviewed and processed accounts payable for the Hills Garden

Hotel.  Met with Thomas Seaman for approval of same.

2/28/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrLooked into vendor payment discrepancy and forwarded details of

cleared check.  Placed call re same.  Met with Thomas Seaman re
approval of vendor payment.
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

2/8/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 0.30 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrStarted preparation of new fee app template spreadsheet.

2/9/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 1.10 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrRan Timeslips reports and downloaded slips for report for Tom,

made report and prepared template spreadsheet for next fee
application.

2/14/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 0.20 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrChecked Timeslips re grammar, spelling, etc.

2/20/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 0.40 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrDiscussed reports to be included in latest report to Court with Tom

and re-ran reports to make easier to post to website.

TM Accounting & Reporting 2.10 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrChecked timeslips for grammar, punctuation, clarity.

2/21/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 2.00 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrAdded financial information onto fee app. Finished timeslips checks.

2/22/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 2.00 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrRan reports, corrected a couple of slips, checked with Tom re

tasks, corrected task name on several slips. Re-ran reports and
entered onto spreadsheet. Entered financial info and timeslip info
onto fee app narrative.

2/23/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 2.50 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrFinished edits to narrative with timeslip info.

SUBTOTAL: [ 33.20 2,132.50]

Forensic Accounting              

2/2/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.10 220.00
200.00/hrReview bank records received from Bank. Confer with Heidi re

same. Review entries, answer questions, etc.

2/6/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.70 140.00
200.00/hrConfer with Heidi re accounting questions. Review progress in

Quickbooks.

2/8/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 2.20 440.00
200.00/hrReview account matrix and entries in Quickbooks to date.  Search

files for missing items, etc.  Email to Tim Hsu re additional
subpoena needed.  Confer with Heidi re progress and next steps.

2/9/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrRun reports and review progress on account entry. Confer with

Heidi re same.
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

2/15/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.40 280.00
200.00/hrRun reports and check progress. Review account entries with

Heidi. Provide direction re items without backup.  Review reports
from Heidi with missing items.

2/17/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrConfer with Tom and Heidi re Scotia bank entries.

2/20/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.30 260.00
200.00/hrReview status and confer with Heidi re progress.  Re-class

payments to Ammine. Direction to Bonnie re edits to deposits for
same. 

2/21/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrConfer with Heidi re bank entries, account and classification

questions.

2/22/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.50 100.00
200.00/hrReview entries. Direct Bonnie re corrections to Ammine deposits.

Confer with Heidi re expenses.

2/28/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 2.80 560.00
200.00/hrReview progress and confer with Heidi re same.  Run reports and

identify issues and revisions needed.  Review Scotia bank records
with Heidi.  Email to counsel re additional records needed from
bank.

2/1/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 5.50 330.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,  August - Oct  2011 debits.

2/2/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 5.40 324.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,  Oct - Dec 2011 debits.

2/3/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 5.50 330.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,  Dec  2011; Jan, Feb 2012 debits.

2/6/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 6.00 360.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,   March - May  2012 debits.

2/7/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 6.00 360.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,  June - October 2012.

2/8/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 6.00 360.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,  November 2012 - June 2013.
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2/13/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 3.40 204.00
60.00/hrEntered Chenne  Account 8430,  October 2013 - April 2014.

2/20/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 0.80 48.00
60.00/hrEntered deposits into Scotia Bank account for Amauction 2013,

2014, 2015.

2/22/2017 BC Forensic Accounting 0.30 18.00
60.00/hrcorrected Deposit account entries.

2/1/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 2.50 175.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct BofA acct xx6075. 

2/2/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.00 420.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct BofA acct xx6075. 

2/3/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.70 469.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct BofA acct xx6075. 

2/6/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.10 427.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct BofA acct xx6075. 

2/7/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 3.70 259.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation Citi acct xx8430 and organize

the statements for this account.

2/8/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.70 539.00
70.00/hrInput data for Chenne Corporation CitiBank acct xx8430 and

started reconciliation for this account.

2/9/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.60 462.00
70.00/hrReconcile Citibank accct xx8430 for Chenne Corporation.

2/10/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 5.70 399.00
70.00/hrContinue reconciling Citibank accct xx8430 for Chenne Corporation.

2/13/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.40 518.00
70.00/hrInput data for Citibank acct xx8430  and continue reconciling

Citibank accct xx8430 for Chenne Corporation after filling in
missing checks and withdrawals.

2/14/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrContinue reconciling Citibank accct xx8430 for Chenne Corporation

after filling in missing checks and withdrawals. Reconcile Citibank
acct xx9622 for Chenne Corporation.

2/15/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.50 455.00
70.00/hrFinish reconciling Citibank acct xx9622 for Chenne

Corporation.Check the accuracy for Citibank acct xx9622 and acct
xx8430 (not finished). Prepare the list of requesting Citibank to
provide the copies of the check and withdrawals for Citibank acct
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xx9622 and acct xx8430.  Print statements for Scotiabank account.

2/16/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrContinue printing bank statements for Scotiabank acct xx0053.

Input deposit data into Quickbooks.

2/17/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrContinue locating the deposit data for Scotiabank acct xx0053.

Input disbursement data into Quickbooks.

2/20/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrMatch the check numbers to the excel sheet and input

disbursement data into Quickbooks  for Scotiabank acct xx0053.

2/21/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.20 504.00
70.00/hrMatch the check numbers to the excel sheet and input

disbursement data into Quickbooks  for Scotiabank acct xx0053.

2/22/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrMatch the check numbers to the excel sheet and input

disbursement data into Quickbooks  for Scotiabank acct xx0053.

2/23/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.60 532.00
70.00/hrMatch the check numbers to the excel sheet and input

disbursement data into Quickbooks  for Scotiabank acct xx0053.

2/24/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 3.40 238.00
70.00/hrMatch the check numbers to the excel sheet and input

disbursement data into Quickbooks  for Scotiabank acct xx0053.

2/27/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 4.50 315.00
70.00/hrInput disbursement data into Quickbooks for Scotiabank acct

xx0053 and calculate  tax and fee for June, 2014.

2/28/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrReconcile Scotiabank acct xx0523.

2/17/2017 TAS Forensic Accounting 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer re ScotiaBank bank statement input.

SUBTOTAL: [ 179.70 13,681.00]

Investor Relations                  

2/1/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrReview and reply to investor messages

2/6/2017 AJ Investor Relations 1.10 220.00
200.00/hrReview notice Tim sent out to email subscribers re sale motion.

Review emails from investors re same.
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2/7/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.40 80.00
200.00/hrReview messages from victims.

2/20/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview messages from victims.

2/24/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrReview messages and emails from investors in response to latest

web site postings. 

2/27/2017 AJ Investor Relations 1.80 360.00
200.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims, attorney, etc. 

Respond to investors.

2/6/2017 HG Investor Relations 1.30 91.00
70.00/hrTranslate "Motion to sell Fairview Condominimum" from English to

Chinese.

2/23/2017 HG Investor Relations 0.40 28.00
70.00/hrTranslation for "Motion For Authority to Sell Personal Property"

from English to Chinese.

2/24/2017 HG Investor Relations 1.40 98.00
70.00/hrTranslation for "Receiver's Sixth Interim Report and

Recommendations" from English to Chinese.

2/1/2017 TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrMade change to Case Documents page and saved.

2/6/2017 TM Investor Relations 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrPosted update to web site re Sale Motion for Fairview. Made

translation worksheet for Heidi and gave direction. Received
translation and posted. Made email for subscribers, verified again
with Heidi and sent out. Sent email to group re same.

2/17/2017 TM Investor Relations 2.20 363.00
165.00/hrWorked on adding Constant Contact to website.

2/23/2017 TM Investor Relations 1.70 280.50
165.00/hrEmail from attorneys re items to post to website.  Downloaded

items, checked PACER for other documents. Wrote narrative and
posted to website. Gave translation page to Heidi for translation.
Received translation, entered into narrative area of website,
posted. Checked links, made email for subscribers with both
languages added. Checked links, sent out.
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2/24/2017 TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived email of yesterday's update, email to group re same.

TM Investor Relations 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrReceived report to post to website. Prepared narrative, saved pdf

for upload.  Prepared translation worksheet for Heidi.  Built links for
both English and Chinese version of site, published. Prepared
email for subscribers and sent out.

TM Investor Relations 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrMade new contact and subscriber sign-up page for website.

TM Investor Relations 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrGathered items for upcoming website update.

2/26/2017 TM Investor Relations 2.20 363.00
165.00/hrUpdates to web site, created Chinese email sign up page, separate

English sign up page, changes to format on Home page, added
links and checked links. Published and backed up.

SUBTOTAL: [ 18.60 2,939.00]

Manage Business                  

2/1/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/2/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.
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2/3/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrForwarded pay stubs to manager and payroll invoice to Matthew

Flahive.

2/6/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/7/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed compliance document from insurance company

forwarded by broker; had call with broker.  Emailed hotel manager
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with instruction to comply with terms of letter and relayed info back
to broker.

2/8/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/9/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/10/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

2/13/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.
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2/13/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/14/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/15/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrReviewed payroll numbers and checked calculations for overtime

and double time calculations. Made changes and forwarded to
payroll service.  Received payroll report and sent snapshot to
Receiver for approval.  Received approval and gave go ahead to
payroll company.

2/16/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.
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2/16/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/17/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

2/20/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.
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2/20/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/21/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/22/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/23/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/24/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
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accounting.

2/24/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

2/27/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

2/28/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived notice that internet bill was late for hotel.  Met with

Matthew Flahive and searched emails for prior payment
confirmations.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReviewed invoice from Magnuson and forwarded.
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2/28/2017 DC Manage Business 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrSent reminder regarding payroll for hotel.

SUBTOTAL: [ 19.20 3,168.00]

Project Management              

2/3/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview messages from DOJ and Tom re access to Arcadia office.

2/7/2017 AJ Project Management 1.80 360.00
200.00/hrReceived and saved records from BOFA from subpoena. Reviewed

records.

AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrConfer with Tim and Matthew re sweep of funds from frozen

account.

2/16/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview emails re next call with Dominican counsel.

2/21/2017 AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview messages from counsel re Dominican hearing, conference

call. Confer with Tom re same.

AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrConfer with Tom re Ammine. Review emails re Ammine

representative in DR.

2/22/2017 AJ Project Management 0.30 60.00
200.00/hrReview mail and correspondence.

2/23/2017 AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview emails from counsel re rescheduling conference call.   

AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview email from Tim Hsu re secured property tax bill.

2/28/2017 AJ Project Management 0.30 60.00
200.00/hrCall with Tom and Andrea re game plan going forward  in advance

of conference call.

AJ Project Management 0.80 160.00
200.00/hrConference call with Dominican counsel re executor appeal, BHD

Leon bank records and funds, declaration, next steps.
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2/20/2017 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER for recent filings.

SUBTOTAL: [ 4.40 876.50]

Property Management           

2/6/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

2/13/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

DC Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrHad call with caretaker regarding insurance visit.  Reviewed photos

and discussed timeline.

2/20/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrHad call with caretaker about wreck out at property and timeline of

cleanup; reviewed pictures.

2/27/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

2/1/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrMade scans of numerous invoices for payment at Alhambra

Gardens.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from Whitfield re finish at Live Oak repairs of drains. Discussed

that he worked on 4 drains instead of simply the 3. Discussed that
there were 8 layers of roof material built up around the drains and
that there may be additional dripping for some time and he will
come by on Monday to check on status to determine if there is
more dripping after a rain. Discussed Alhambra Gardens roof
repairs to be done and need ot schedule the abatement inspection.

TM Property Management 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrApproved 16 invoices for repairs at Alhambra Gardens. Made

scans, added memo, printed off for each of the unit files. Made
FedEx.
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2/1/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from security at Live Oak re monitoring roof leaks and when

the contractor will return to look at the drywall and if current repairs
are holding. Discussed replacement of ceiling tiles and the drains
near the A/C.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to landscaper re last check for Oak Mountain.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived W-9 from Fairview Royal Garden and gave to Matthew.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice for Balboa pool maintenance and approved.

2/2/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived invoice for roof work at Live Oak and reviewed. Call from

contractor re number of roof layers that were unknown at time of
bid.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived proposal for soil removal at Alhambra Gardens.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrChecked on status of check for handyman and texted him and

directions to check unit CC for repair and maintenance work now
that tenant has moved out. Call from him and discussed unit A, M,
CC.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices for Oak Mountain and Balboa.

2/3/2017 TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrEmail from tenant re gas leak, replied re same. Call to SoCalGas to

schedule immediate visit. Text to onsite manager, tenant,
handyman to open unit. Call with handyman re needed minor fix
and need for new vent pipe from heater as it is clogged. Direction
to make corrections.

TM Property Management 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrCall with Whitfield re status of roof repairs, status of payment, need

for another visit after rainfall to determine if other water is coming
down. Calls with security re same. Calls with Matthew re check.

2/6/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with handyman re painting, latch repairs and other items to

prepare the unit into rentable condition.
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2/6/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived landscaping invoice for Oak Mountain and approved.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMade FedEx to send keys to broker re Fairview. Labeled numerous

copies of keys.

2/7/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived renewal papers for insurance for Quail Ranch, printed

and reviewed, prepared for signature.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from security re continued roof leak, downloaded photos, call

from contractor re him visiting the property tomorrow.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved security invoices.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrCall from Warlin re renewal, got info on money saved this year and

directed Matthew to cut check immediately, gathered Tom's
signature, made Fed Ex package and sent.

2/8/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from insurance broker re rejection of terrorism coverage for

new policy for Quail Ranch. Sent email with formal rejection of the
additional coverage.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls with Whitfield re his visit to Live Oak and attempt to find

additional leaks. Got report on additional torchdown work
performed at no additional cost and discussed another visit to the
property after the roof has dried out.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCall with Whitfield re soil removal project at Alhambra Gardens, text

to same. Wrote up letter for tenants re project.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrNew phone number sent to me by onsite manager. Entered into

Outlook and onto phone.

2/9/2017 TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrReceived insurance renewal papers re Rancho Cucamonga and

prepared for signature. Gathered check, made copies, scan and
sent via FedEx.

2/10/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from Warlin re additional papers needing signature for Quail

Ranch and Rancho Cucamonga. Gathered signtures, made scans
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and sent to broker. Call to same.

2/10/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrRead through Section 8 info documents.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived rents from Alhambra.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrLetter to tenants re soil removal. Added picture.

2/12/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls from tenant re broken spring on garage door. Calls and texts

for handyman to fix.

2/13/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMade copies of rent checks for tracking and gave to Matthew.

Processed petty cash reimbursement, filed various items related to
vendors for pest control.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrProcessed legal billls related to abandonment/eviction issues

related to 4116 Lynd.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices for Balboa and Lynd.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from insurance inspector re Quail Ranch and set up time for

him to visit the property. Email to Darren re same. Call to inspector
to confirm time.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMade scan and copy of supplemental tax bill for hotel, approved for

payment and checked website of tax collector to change address of
recipient.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved utilities invoices for several properties.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrMade packages for Live Oak mail.

2/14/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from tenant re garage spring and damage to window.  Call to

handyman re same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed need for annual profit and loss report for Alhambra

Gardens for yearly submission to lender. Prepared rent roll and
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other materials for email to lender.

2/14/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrFinished letter to tenants re soil removal, sent pdf to onsite

manager for delivery.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrApproved numerous invoices for security and soil removal. Filed

away invoices, vendor proposals re work done at Live Oak and
Alhambra Gardens.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText from potential tenant re Section 8, replied re same.

2/15/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved invoices.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived and filed annual report from HOA for Fairview.

2/16/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived security invoice and approved.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText from potential tenant re need to get papers back re HACOLA.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail re need for plumber at Fairview, approved.

2/17/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from tenant re need for additional garage space.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from insurance inspector re size of Quail Hills building.

Reviewed appraisal and relayed info. Discussed other matters.

2/18/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls from tenant re clogged drain. Sent text to handyman and fixed.

2/20/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Alhambra tenant in unit M re problem with doors. Text to

handyman to investigate.

2/21/2017 TM Property Management 2.00 330.00
165.00/hrFilled out Section Housing information for new tenant. Call to case

worker re inspection. Call to handyman doing minor work to install
items needed for inspection.
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2/21/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to security guard re status of roof leaks and repairs at Live Oak.

2/22/2017 TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrTravel to Alhambra Gardens and Live Oak and back; at half pay.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrChecked on repair work at unit CC and checked items for Section 8

inspection. Met with new tenant and signed application, took to
HACOLA for drop off.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrChecked on roof repair at Live Oak.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice for landscaping at Fairview and approved.

TM Property Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrCall from handyman re need for electicity and gas re unit CC at

Alhambra. Call to SCE and set up. Text to handyman. Call to
SoCalGas to setup. Text to handyman re same.

2/23/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from tenant at Alhambra re neighbor with dog and very loud.

Replied re letter to be sent.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Hsu with tax info re parcels. Saved and printed for

Matthew. Received other tax bills from Alison for checking against
master list.

2/24/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived water bill for Fairview, approved. Email to water provider

re high bill.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrTexts to handyman re cabinetry, counter which needs to be re-set,

upcoming inspection. Talked with him on phone re sink and
previous items.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrEmail to association re Utica property. Email crash and gathered

past documents.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrLooked up upcoming insurance items.

2/25/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails from broker re water heater problem at Fairview. Approved

work.
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2/25/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail to association re Utica property proposing payment of

assessments and change of billing address.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to onsite manager re requests for different garage stalls at

Alhambra. Texts to and from same.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved mortgage payment for Alhambra. Gathered items to send

to Chase re annual request.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved insurance invoice for cars.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived insurance information for Live Oak, scanned and updated

tracking spreadsheet. Insurance for Quail Ranch
telecommunications, as well.

2/26/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from tenant re ceiling material coming down. Email to

Whitfield re same. Call with same and email to tenant re cleaning.

2/27/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrText from new tenant re unit CC, texts to handyman re numerous

repairs. Call to same and discussed needed stove and finalized
other items.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from person interested in Alhambra Gardens for purchase.

Replied re same.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from Whitfield re status of ceiling in unit NN, need for caulking,

applying of acoustic and paint. Also discussed when the bobcat
machine would be used for the trenching work, the decking work,
and the roof at Live Oak. Call to handyman with instructions re
same and discussed other items needing work.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrFound info to send to HACOLA re owner services request. Sent to

them with message. Text to handyman re ID needed for tomorrow's
inspection.
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2/27/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved landscaping invoices for Alhambra and Live Oak.

2/28/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from inspector for unit CC. Call to handyman to verify he is in

place to receive the inspector.  Calculated move-in costs. Text to
new tenant re amount of move-in costs. Received word that unit
passed inspection, text to tenant.

TM Property Management 0.90 148.50
165.00/hrEdits to new lease for tenant, read through HACOLA forms.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoice for security and Fairview plumber.

SUBTOTAL: [ 25.80 4,257.00]

Receiver                                

2/1/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re sale motions, Fairview, personal

property vehicles, liens showing up on Quail Ranch, underlying
documents from title problem, Telephone call with Tim re same.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrConfer re title issues on Quail Ranch.

2/2/2017 TAS Receiver 1.20 450.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Doug Miller at SEC re need for amount

recovered and estimate of recoveries; work on same.

2/3/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and execute declaration re Fairview sale. Telephone call

with Ted re same.

TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrContinue forecast of future recoveries, reconcile recoveries to date,

finish and forward to SEC.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position. 

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrConfer with Darren re PSA terms.
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2/4/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrDirect Tim re lease on Fairview.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrExecute lease.

2/6/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Eva Lin re physical inspection issues.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Howard Hamlin re contract and sale issues.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrEmails and calls with Howard re purchase and sale agreement.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position. 

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position. 

2/7/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted fates re personal property sale motion, get

revised proposal from Tranzon, etc.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrDeal with PSA on Quail Ranch.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrExecute insurance renewal.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrExecute Fairview escrow documents.

2/8/2017 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrReview red line changes to PSA, calls and emails with counsel and

Howard re same.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrDeal with buyer's request for repair, consider reports and bids.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrDeal with cell tower lease issues.

2/9/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrEmail SEC re questions on cash being held.

2/10/2017 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrWork through PSA changes and title issues with counsel and

Howard.
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2/10/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrDeal with additional disclosure issues.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign Oak Mountain escrow documents.

2/13/2017 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview and edit motion for approval to sell personal property.

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrReview Rancho Cucamonga land sale brochure, questions for

Howard re same, review accounting re price paid, review appraisal
give go ahead on price and package.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Eva Lin re ecrow extension, execute same.

2/14/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position. 

2/15/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Matt Hills Garden supplemental property tax bill, value.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrExecute deeds before notary.

2/17/2017 TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrReview draft financials reconcile accrual to cash, prepare SFAR.

TAS Receiver 2.90 1,087.50
375.00/hrWrite narrative for Sixth status report and accounting.

2/20/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrFinalize report send to Ted.

2/21/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re DR call and issues re Amine.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview Hotel LOI and consider terms.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position.

2/22/2017 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrReview Ted's red line comments, update accounting, return for

completion and circulation.
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2/22/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 NO CHARGE
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re edits and revisions to billings.

2/26/2017 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrConsider DR matters, review pleadings filed, consider change in

course of action, Telephone call with counsel re same.

2/27/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview broker commission agreement forward to Howard and

counsel, Telephone call with Tim re same, review PSA, execute,
return documents.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview incoming offer on Rancho Cucamonga land, consider

appraisal and price paid, consider counter offer, Telephone call
with Howard re same, make counter offer.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position. 

2/28/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Matt re bills to pay.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Andrea re game plan going forward in advance

of conference call.

TAS Receiver 0.80 300.00
375.00/hrConference call with Dominican counsel re executor appeal, BHD

Leon bank records and funds, declaration, next steps.

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Eva Lin re status of Oak Mountain buyer

contingency removal deadline, discuss back-up offers, direct re
giving notice to perform, follow up re same; follow up buyer
removed contingencies.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrFollow up with counsel re status of Deodar turnover, update broker,

discuss market conditions.

SUBTOTAL: [ 21.60 7,950.00]
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Receivership Administration  

2/21/2017 BC Receivership Administration 5.00 300.00
60.00/hrOpened and sorted mail.

2/22/2017 BC Receivership Administration 6.00 360.00
60.00/hrOpened and sorted mail.

2/23/2017 BC Receivership Administration 6.50 390.00
60.00/hrOpened and organized mail into categories. Entered creditors

billing on spreadsheet and filed bills in Creditor file.

2/24/2017 BC Receivership Administration 2.50 150.00
60.00/hrSorted bank statements for Chen entities.

2/27/2017 BC Receivership Administration 0.70 42.00
60.00/hrFiled Checks/Statements. Made files. 

2/28/2017 BC Receivership Administration 1.30 78.00
60.00/hrPrepare and mailed checks from USFIA to vendors.

BC Receivership Administration 0.60 36.00
60.00/hrPrepare and mailed checks from Hills Garden Hotel to vendors.

BC Receivership Administration 3.20 192.00
60.00/hrMade copies of funds transfer request from Amauction for Ammine,

SRL.

2/3/2017 HG Receivership Administration 1.20 84.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for USFIA, Inc

entities.

2/6/2017 HG Receivership Administration 0.60 42.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for Hills Garden

Hotel, LLC.

2/7/2017 HG Receivership Administration 0.80 56.00
70.00/hrFile the documents on top of the cabinet for different entities. 

2/15/2017 HG Receivership Administration 1.20 84.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for USFIA, Inc.

entities.

HG Receivership Administration 0.30 21.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for Hills Garden

Hotel, LLC.

2/21/2017 HG Receivership Administration 0.80 56.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for Hills Garden

Hotel, LLC..
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SUBTOTAL: [ 30.70 1,891.00]

Sell Property/Liquidate Assets

2/2/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrHad call with hotel broker and answered numerous questions

related to PSA and timing.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReviewed activity for sales and NDAs received by broker and

discussed activity.

2/3/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDiscussed revised buyer visits with broker and informed hotel

manager. Briefly discussed PSA with Receiver.

2/7/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrSent email to Receiver regarding PSA for hotel.

2/8/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrRetrieve and review cell tower lease for Quail Ranch from

American Tower Corporation.  Contacted American Tower. 
Reviewed appraisal and offer for Quail Ranch property with regard
to lease.  Forward information to Receiver regarding past buyout
offer.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrRequested loss runs for broker for potential hotel buyers;

forwarded.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrSent updated P&L to broker for hotel.

2/9/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrGathered documents related to Sprinter vans and Airstream in

preparation for motion for sale.  Responded to emailed questions
from counsel as well as called.  Contacted car broker to confirm
terms of sale.

2/13/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrHad call with former owner of hotel and discussed procedure for

bidding on hotel.  Answered questions and took notes to relay to
hotel broker.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrHad call with counsel and sent draft PSA to review. Answered

questions regarding due date of PSA to give to broker, Potential
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buyer tour dates and deadline for best and final offers.

2/17/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrHad call with potential hotel buyer.  Arranged visit to hotel by

foreign buyer over the weekend. Made calls to broker and hotel
manager to arrange. Sent email to representative of potential buyer
and had call.

2/21/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReview LOI for hotel; respond to broker and forward to Receiver.

2/28/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived email from broker regarding hotel PSA; emailed counsel.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrAnswered questions regarding liquor license and union employees

at hotel for PSA.

2/1/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived prorated invoice, checked against original bill and

approved.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from escrow re need for documents.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrCall from broker re need for gas to be turned on again at property

for the inspection. Call to gas company and set up. Email to Lin re
need for password for lockbox so the gas company can check on
all gas appliances. On hold with gas company. Received email
from broker, call to gas company to give lockbox info. Email to Lin
re furnace, received reply.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Tom re liens on Quail Ranch and need to talk with

Premac re same. Called and LM with Premac re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Premac re liens and asked him to relay it to Receiver's

attorney re liens not previously satisfied 20 years ago.

2/2/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall and LM with Pollock re liens on Quail Ranch. Email from same,

email to Darren and Alison re previous title report.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrFilled out escrow documents for Tom for Fairview.

2/3/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCalls, texts and emails re Tom's signature for Fairview declaration

for filing. Received with direction to post to web site.
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2/3/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice for prorated staging final check at Oak Mountain,

approved.

2/4/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrRead through lease from broker and email and text to Tom re lease

for Fairview.

2/5/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrTexts to and from broker and Tom re docusigned lease.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrFound keys, garage door opener for Fairview.

2/6/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Lin re prorated staging invoice, checked on status and

texted that it has gone out.

2/7/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEdits to escrow documents for Tom to sign. Added HOA info.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrAdditions to property disclosures and sent to broker re Oak

Mountain, reviewed pictures re items at property.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrSearches of forensic accounting for companies that may be able to

provide documents re satisfaction of liens for Quail Ranch. Sent
email with reports re law firm and engineering firm that were
involved with the transaction.

2/8/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrMade Outlook calendar reminder for opposition deadline in

Fairview sale confirmation matter.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Pollock re liens at Quail Ranch and replied.

2/9/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Pollock with draft purchase and sale agreement for Tom

to review. Saved, sent to Tom.  Sent to Hamlin.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived email with easements plotted, saved in pubdocs and

printed in color for file.

2/10/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from broker re Oak Mountain disclosures, checked that they

were sent on Feb. 7 and sent her scan of same with direction.
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2/10/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Pollock re language re removal of liens. Email to

Pollock re satisfaction of liens and whether FATCO has
documentation. Other emails and replies re liens, antennae, etc.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall with broker for Oak Mountain and gave correct address for

escrow documents. Email from escrow agent.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall to broker for Fairview and discussed additional disclosures re

earthquake preparedness, etc. Filled out disclosures for Tom's
signature. Email to Alison re need for documents for escrow re
Operating Agreement, LLC info, etc. and she delivered binder with
such information. Looked through to find items.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Fates re 21-day deadline for opposition re Fairview.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Premac re status of sale of Quail Ranch. Replied re

start of escrow.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrQuestion to Tom re escrow documents for Oak Mountain and

Fairview. Prepared for signatures.

2/13/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Premac re removing several exceptions from title report

for Quail Ranch, forwarded to Hamlin and Pollock. Email to Fates
re time needed to transfer title with FATCO.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrQuestion from Tom re appraisal for Rancho Cucamonga.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReviewed State of California Secretary of State documents re

Ahome Real Estate LLC. Searched for items needed for escrow.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail to escrow for Fairview re taxpayer ID to be used for sale.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from appraiser for Alhambra Gardens. Approved invoice.

Email to same.

2/14/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail to Fates re ability to close on time with new title company re

Quail Ranch. Discussed with Tom as well.
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2/14/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrSearch for documentation requested by escrow for Fairview, sent

some to escrow and other information as substitute.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived escrow docs and reviewed re Oak Mountain.

2/15/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrAssisted with notarization of three documents for sale of Fairview

and Oak Mountain.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmails related to Quail Ranch sale, lien removal, title insurance

requirements, etc.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails related to Fairview sale.

2/16/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrReviewed signatures for Fairview escrow papers. Gathered

additional signature, copies, scan, FedEx to escrow.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmails to and from broker re HOA for Oak Mountain. Call to HOA,

gathered info, emailed to broker. Put HOA info on escrow docs for
same.

2/17/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmails re HOA at Oak Mountain, Fairview transaction, checked that

invoices submitted for landscaping, etc.

2/21/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from broker for Oak Mountain re need for signature on escrow

document re performance of buyer. Call to Tom re same and got
signature. Text to broker re same.

2/22/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Fates re need for 2 certified copies of Order to Confirm

Sale of Fairview.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails re Quail Ranch sale re need for Chicago Title to handle

transaction. Replied re same.

2/23/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmails re Quail Ranch transaction from attorneys and title

company.  Email to Fates re same, call from same.
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2/24/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrPrepared additional escrow documents for Fairview, Oak Mountain,

Quail.

2/25/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to Tom re signing PSA for Quail Ranch.

2/27/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCall from Fates re items for Quail Ranch sale motion, discussed

commissions, previous purchase dates, leases for the property, cell
phone towers, etc. Searched for documents. Call to Tom re
commission and additional agreement.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Fates with sale motion, reviewed and sent email of

needed changes.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmail from Fairview escrow re vesting. Email to Fates re same.

Looked for previous email to escrow re name of Receiver.

2/28/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from broker re if confirming order has come yet.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Premac with closing requirements for Fairview,

reviewed and forwarded to Ted Fates.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrGot signature for amended seller's vesting instruction, scanned,

copied, sent to escrow via USPS. Review of other escrow
instructions and emails.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Fates re Oak Mountain motion and declaration.

Gathered info and sent to him.

SUBTOTAL: [ 21.30 3,514.50]

For professional services rendered $40,409.50354.50

Balance due $40,409.50
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Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA  92614

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen

May 15, 2017

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11182

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

3/13/2017 AJ Accounting & Reporting 2.20 440.00
200.00/hrWork on account reconciliations.

3/7/2017 DC Accounting & Reporting 0.20 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrPrint 5th fee app for Receiver review. Obtained signature from

Receiver, scanned and emailed to counsel.

3/8/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.10 157.50
75.00/hrInput the sales data for 2/15 through 2/28/17 to close the February

books.  Entered the auto debits from the bank account and made
the closing entries.  Printed financial statements and forwarded to
Darren Clevenger.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 37.50
75.00/hrEntered the Hotel's payroll for the period ending 2/15/17 into

Quickbooks.

3/9/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.90 142.50
75.00/hrProcessed accounts payable for the receivership entities, received

approval from Thomas Seaman and gave instructions re sending
checks.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.50 112.50
75.00/hrProcessed accounts payable for the Hills Garden Hotel, received

approval from Thomas Seaman and gave instructions re sending
checks.
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3/9/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.70 52.50
75.00/hrProcessed form 1096 for the receivership entities and sent to the

IRS.

3/13/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.20 165.00
75.00/hrInput the March statement charges for the Alhambra Apartment

tenants.  Received monthly rental payments in Quickbooks and
deposited checks.

3/14/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.50 112.50
75.00/hrInput the sales for the Hills Garden Hotel for 3/1 through 3/13/17 to

Quickbooks.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 45.00
75.00/hrInput the payroll for the period ending 2/28/17 into Quickbooks for

the Hills Garden Hotel.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.70 52.50
75.00/hrProcessed immediate payments needed for various properties and

real estate sales expenses.  Met with Thomas Seaman for approval
and sent payments.

3/17/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 30.00
75.00/hrDeposited payment received from American Tower and spoke with

office re timing of next payment.

3/20/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.80 135.00
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed accounts payable for the

receivership entities.  Met with Thomas Seaman re approval of
same.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.40 105.00
75.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed accounts payable for the

Hills Garden Hotel.  Met with Thomas Seaman re approval of same.

3/30/2017 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.90 142.50
75.00/hrInput the Hills Garden Hotel sales revenue to Quickbooks for 3/14

through 3/29 along with any auto debits to the bank account. 
Prepared various reports for the hotel and forwarded to Darren
Clevenger for providing re sale of business.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 37.50
75.00/hrInput the Hills Garden Hotel payroll for the period ending 3/15/17

into Quickbooks.

3/1/2017 TM Accounting & Reporting 0.10 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrEmail from Tom, sent additional email with exhibits to fee app.

SUBTOTAL: [ 20.20 1,767.50]
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Forensic Accounting              

3/2/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrConfer with Heidi re Scotia bank entries, and month end balance.

3/6/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrReview bank records received and save, confer with Heidi re same

and give direction. 

3/8/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.50 300.00
200.00/hrReview entries and confer with Heidi. Answer questions and

provide direction.  Run reports, and review progress, etc.

3/10/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.70 140.00
200.00/hrReview account entries and bank account lists and missing items,

etc Confer with Heidi re same.

3/13/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.50 300.00
200.00/hrRun financials, and drill down into general ledger accounts and

check for consistency, revisions needed, etc.

3/15/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.40 80.00
200.00/hrConfer with Heidi re entries, answer questions etc.

3/16/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.10 220.00
200.00/hrReview progress and identify areas that need clean up.  Met with

Heidi to review and provide direction re same.

3/17/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.70 140.00
200.00/hrWork on review and updates. Confer with Heidi re same.

3/21/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.40 80.00
200.00/hrMet with Heidi to review and discuss corrections and revisions to

entries. Look up details on distributor car prizes and give direction
re category.

3/22/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.80 160.00
200.00/hrDirection to Heidi re Scotia bank entry, etc.

3/23/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.50 300.00
200.00/hrRun reports, confer with Heidi re status and progress. Look for

items that need to be revised.

3/24/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.30 60.00
200.00/hrReview email from Dominican counsel related to additional check

images needed.  Confer with Heidi re same and give direction on
entering.  Save files to pub docs.

3/28/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.40 80.00
200.00/hrConfer with Heidi re entries, answer questions and provide

direction.
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3/30/2017 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrConfer with Heidi re Scotia bank. Review checks, and provide

direction.  Run reports and review status.

3/1/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.70 539.00
70.00/hrReconcile Scotiabank acct xx0523.

3/2/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrReconcile Scotiabank acct xx0523.

3/3/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.60 532.00
70.00/hrReconcile Scotiabank acct xx0523.

3/6/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrReconcile Scotiabank acct xx0523.

3/7/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrFinish reconciliation for  Scotiabank acct xx0523. Start filling

deposit data into Chenne Corporation Citibank  acct xx9622.

3/8/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 4.00 280.00
70.00/hrOrganize the deposit checks and start inputting them into

Quickbooks for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx9622.

3/9/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.50 525.00
70.00/hrFinish input the deposit check images for Citibank acct 9622. Print 

the deposit check images from subpoena and start inputting them
into Quickbooks for Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx8430.

3/10/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput the requested deposit checks images into Quickbooks for

Chenne Corporation Citibank acct xx8430.

3/13/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.00 490.00
70.00/hrContinue inputting deposited checks into Quickbooks for Chenne

Corporation Citibanks acct xx8430. Delete not cleared transactions
for this account and Scotiabank acct xx0053.  Update
CashvsTurnoverCurrent chart according to balance sheet. 
Update the chart for Missing Bank Statements for Forensic
Accounting record. 

3/15/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 5.50 385.00
70.00/hrOrganized checks for Chenne Corporation Citibank xx8430.

Matched part of the "Classes" with the company bank names and
fixed the problems. Matching the account of Payment to Affililates
with the account of Payment from Affiliates and fixed the problems.  

3/16/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.50 455.00
70.00/hrFix the problems to make the two accounts of "Payment from

Affiliates" and "Payment to Affiliates' balanced with Alison's help.
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3/17/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrMatch the "Class" with the account's bank and correct the errors

found. 

3/20/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.60 532.00
70.00/hrOrganize the accounts and make each account consistent.

3/21/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 4.00 280.00
70.00/hrOrganize the accounts and make each account consistent.

3/23/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrOrganize the accounts and make each account consistent.

3/24/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrOrganize the accounts and make each account consistent. Start

inputting checks into Excel  for Ammine SRL Scotiabank  xx0053 

3/27/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.00 420.00
70.00/hr Start inputting checks into Excel  for Ammine SRL Scotiabank 

xx0053. . 

3/28/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 6.50 455.00
70.00/hrInput checks into Excel  and Quickbooks for Ammine SRL

Scotiabank  xx0053. 

3/29/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 7.30 511.00
70.00/hrInput checks into Excel for Ammine SRL Scotiabank  xx0053. 

3/30/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput checks into Excel  and Quickbooks for Ammine SRL

Scotiabank  xx0053. 

3/31/2017 HG Forensic Accounting 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrInput checks into Quickbooks for Ammine SRL Scotiabank  xx0053. 

3/10/2017 MRF Forensic Accounting 0.80 60.00
75.00/hrReceived instructions from Darren Clevenger and pulled available

information re purchase of sprinter vans and other autos purchased
by receivership.

3/7/2017 TM Forensic Accounting 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrHelped Heidi re potential spellings of names that appeard in pdfs.

SUBTOTAL: [ 160.70 12,640.50]
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Investor Relations                  

3/2/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.40 80.00
200.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

3/8/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.70 140.00
200.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

3/9/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.90 180.00
200.00/hrReview mail and correspondence, deal with notices, etc.

3/13/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.

3/17/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.70 140.00
200.00/hrReview emails and messages from victims, respond to same re

case status.

3/20/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview email from USFIA victim.

AJ Investor Relations 0.70 140.00
200.00/hrReview website update posted and review correspondence

received from victims.

3/21/2017 AJ Investor Relations 2.20 440.00
200.00/hrReview and respond to investor inquires.

3/22/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrReview correspondence, calls with victims re case status.

3/23/2017 AJ Investor Relations 1.40 280.00
200.00/hrReview messages and correspondence.  Respond to email and

calls with others.

3/24/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from victims.

3/28/2017 AJ Investor Relations 0.50 100.00
200.00/hrReview messages from victims, vendor, etc.

3/3/2017 HG Investor Relations 0.40 28.00
70.00/hrTranslate "Motion to Sell Quail Ranch Property" from English to

Chinese.

3/8/2017 HG Investor Relations 4.00 280.00
70.00/hrTranslate the "Fifth Interim Fee Application of the Receiver; Fee

Applications of Receiver's Attorneys and Consultants" from English
to Chinese.
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3/9/2017 HG Investor Relations 0.50 35.00
70.00/hrTranslate the "Fifth Interim Fee Application of the Receiver; Fee

Applications of Receiver's Attorneys and Consultants " from English
to Chinese.

3/20/2017 HG Investor Relations 0.40 28.00
70.00/hrTranslate "Motion to Sell Oak Mountain Road Property" from

English to Chinese.

3/21/2017 HG Investor Relations 4.00 280.00
70.00/hrTranslate "Amended Motion for Approval of Sale of Fairview

Condominium; Overbids Request" from English to Chinese.  

3/22/2017 HG Investor Relations 1.60 112.00
70.00/hrTranslate "Amended Motion for Approval of Sale of Fairview

Condominium; Overbids Request" from English to Chinese.  

3/5/2017 TM Investor Relations 2.50 412.50
165.00/hrDownloaded PACER documents. Made changes to website to

improve navigation, email sign-up page, proper spacing of page
items.

3/8/2017 TM Investor Relations 2.20 363.00
165.00/hrReceived fee app to post to website. Saved documents, made

narrative, made translation worksheet for Heidi. Edited some format
problems. Uploaded several documents. Updated Case documents
page. Checked through list of documents for any unposted.

3/9/2017 TM Investor Relations 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrUpdated the website with the Chinese translation material, built and

checked links. Published several different times with minor edits.
Checked links. Prepared email to subscribers, built links and sent
out. Made back-up.

3/20/2017 TM Investor Relations 2.20 363.00
165.00/hrReceived email from Holman re Oak Mountain motion and

declaration to post to website. Posted in English. Made Chinese
translation Word document for Heidi to provide translation. 
Received Chinese translation and posted. Made changes to top of
Chinese home page to move the case inception articles to the
bottom and did so.  Updated Case Documents page. Sent emails to
subscribers. Email to group re same.

3/21/2017 TM Investor Relations 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrDownloaded PACER documents in case. Printed items and gave to

Tom re need to post case update re consent agreements.

TM Investor Relations 2.20 363.00
165.00/hrReceived email re amended Fairview motion to post to website.

Downloaded items and prepared to post to website. Updated
previous post of Oak Mountain sale to add the publication notice.
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Added items to Case Documents page. Made translation page for
Heidi, discussed with her some items.

3/22/2017 TM Investor Relations 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrUpdates to website adding narrative for Amended Fairview Sale

Motion and added notices published in paper in Chinese.

SUBTOTAL: [ 32.10 4,576.00]

Manage Business                  

3/1/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrReviewed payroll, reviewed and double checked figures.  Emailed

and contacted hotel manager with questions. Contacted payroll
company with changes. Reviewed adjustments and final numbers,
obtained approval from Receiver and gave payroll company the go
ahead.

3/2/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/3/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.
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3/3/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

3/6/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/7/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/8/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.
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3/9/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrHad power outage at hotel.  Contacted manager to discuss action;

followed up after power restored. Logged into remote computer to
check.

3/10/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

3/12/2017 DC Manage Business 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrDrive time to hotel billed at half.

DC Manage Business 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrDrive time to back from billed at half.

DC Manage Business 1.40 231.00
165.00/hrWent to hotel  to review as sale is quickly approaching. Verified

items on insurance check list.

3/13/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.
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3/13/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/14/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/15/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed commercial umbrella endorsement sent by broker (for

hotel). Saved to file.

DC Manage Business 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReviewed recent STR report for hotel.

3/16/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.
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3/16/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrReviewed initial payroll numbers and overtime hours.  Compared to

last year for same period. Asked manager specific questions to
verify accuracy. Sent to Payroll for initial figures; received initial
figures and met with Receiver to approve. Received approval and
gave go ahead to process.  Once processed sent necessary
documents to accounting and stubs to hotel.

3/17/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

3/20/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
files; forwarded to accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/21/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.
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3/21/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/22/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/23/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/24/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

3/27/2017 DC Manage Business 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel from weekend (and Friday). Scanned and saved to Receiver's
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files; forwarded to accounting.

3/27/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived and reviewed weekly report from Magnuson. 

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/28/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/29/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/30/2017 DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel  Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
accounting.

DC Manage Business 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrViewed hotel activity on remote cameras several times throughout

the day due to increased issues with homelessness.

3/31/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed revenue and deposit worksheet from night manager for

hotel. Scanned and saved to Receiver's files; forwarded to
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accounting.

3/31/2017 DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed PMS1 and roomkey reports.

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLogged into PMS1 and ran reports for prior week and upcoming

reservations. 

DC Manage Business 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed fax and photos from Caretaker; scanned and saved to

file.

SUBTOTAL: [ 23.30 3,844.50]

Project Management              

3/2/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReceived mail from Arcadia office from Tim.

AJ Project Management 0.60 120.00
200.00/hrGave instruction to Bonnie organizing documents and setting up

case files.

AJ Project Management 0.30 60.00
200.00/hrReview files and email wire evidence to Dominican counsel.

AJ Project Management 2.80 560.00
200.00/hrWork on review of banking records, etc.  Prepare and email items

requested by the DOJ pursuant to subpoena. 

3/3/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview email from David Jimenez re meeting in Arcadia. Confirm

date.

3/7/2017 AJ Project Management 1.30 260.00
200.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to and from Arcadia office.

AJ Project Management 6.80 1,360.00
200.00/hrOnsite at the Arcadia office.  Review files and records. Met with

DOJ. Review, count and photograph assets.   

3/8/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview meeting request and accept same.  Confer with Tom re

same.
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3/9/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrSet up meeting with Epic to discuss claims processing.

3/10/2017 AJ Project Management 1.70 340.00
200.00/hrReview documents, emails, and files.  Gather records and

documents re Ammine and USFIA connection.  Prepare and send
by email to Dominican counsel.  

3/21/2017 AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrConfer with Darren re selling vehicles, keys, etc.  Forward security

guards contact info to Darren. 

AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrCall with State Board of Equalization re filing a claim. Provided info

needed.

AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrCall with Darren to confirm number of vehicles.

3/22/2017 AJ Project Management 1.40 280.00
200.00/hrMeeting with Epic re claims administration and processing.

3/23/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview email from Richard Robinson re records.

AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrCall with Walli re Arcadia issues.

AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview email from Tim re moving Lynd.

3/24/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview access request from DOJ.

3/27/2017 AJ Project Management 0.30 60.00
200.00/hrConfer with Bonnie re mail and correspondence received, bills and

vendors to be added to creditors list, etc.

3/28/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview email from Tim Hsu re Chen turnover of two properties.

AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview emails from counsel re Dominican assets and setting up a

call.

AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrConfer with Tom re Balboa property. Email to Tim Hsu re same.

AJ Project Management 1.50 300.00
200.00/hrRun property profile searches to view property owner on additional

addresses found on mail from site.
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3/29/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrReview email from Ted re Dominican call.

AJ Project Management 0.20 40.00
200.00/hrReview emails from counsel re Dominican action.

3/30/2017 AJ Project Management 0.10 20.00
200.00/hrAccept conference call meeting.

DC Project Management 2.30 379.50
165.00/hrWorked on RFE documentation for investors. Trace investor funds

through various PDC and lawyer trust accounts.  Compared bank
statement activity to entries made in multiple Quickbooks files.  Had
call with M Thomassen office to discuss deadlines and missing info.

3/8/2017 TM Project Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrMade demand request of Bank of America re monies in Ahome

account.

3/9/2017 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER system for new filings.

3/10/2017 TM Project Management 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrCall from Bank of America requesting revised turnover request

instructions. Made new request and sent by fax. Gathered confirm
and made into pdf. Numerous attempts at faxing. Several error
messages re same.

3/11/2017 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrSent fax to legal order processing of B of A. Scanned confirmation.

3/13/2017 TM Project Management 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrMade pdfs of several documents related to previous sale of 4116

Lynd from property files found at Live Oak.

3/16/2017 TM Project Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrDownloaded PACER documents in case and searched for Oak

Mountain filing.

3/17/2017 TM Project Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrDiscussed with Heidi missing bank records.

SUBTOTAL: [ 24.40 4,687.50]

Property Management           

3/6/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

Exhibit A, Page 93

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 94 of 125   Page ID
 #:7668



Thomas Seaman, Receiver for Chen 18Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

3/9/2017 DC Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrHad call with caretaker to discuss sale timing and recent expenses.

Confirmed I had copy of receipts and submitted to Matthew Flahive
for payment to caretaker.

3/13/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

3/20/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

3/27/2017 DC Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed weekly report from Quail Ranch property manager and

photos.

3/1/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked HACOLA site for report re yesterday's inspection.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrArranged security deposit return.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrVoicemail to case manager for new tenant re need for finalization.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls from Whitfield re Friday work on soil removal and need to

notify tenants. Also discussed need to enter unit U for ceiling test.

3/2/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from tenant in NN re water leak, damage to ceiling. Call to

handyman re work to be done on ceiling and leak.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from management association re Utica bill.

TM Property Management 2.00 330.00
165.00/hrEmail to and from onsite manager re Alhambra business license.

Calls and emails to and from HACOLA re business license.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrAttempted email re previous request for payment of unpaid rent,

returned undeliverable.
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3/2/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved invoices.

3/3/2017 TM Property Management 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrCalls and voicemails re HACOLA and need for lease authorization

and lease info. Emails back and forth re business license. Email to
onsite manager re need for picture of license to put in file. Call to
Alhambra City Hall and got new business license sent to me and
sent to HACOLA. Got approval to draw up lease, did so and sent to
them for approval. Received approval and printed three copies.
Prepared to meet tenant tomorrow for signing.

3/4/2017 TM Property Management 2.50 412.50
165.00/hrGathered items for trip to Alhambra, met new tenant signed lease,

checked new unit for repair completion, picked up invoices, took
photos of soil removal progress, decking repair requirement.
Checked Lynd for personal property, loaded computer monitors
and laptops in car, took photos of personal property. Unloaded at
office.

TM Property Management 1.30 214.50
165.00/hrTravel time to Alhambra, Lynd and back to work; at half pay.

3/6/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Whitfield re update on soil removal, asbestos report came

back negative, direction of power washing north wall of Alhambra
Gardens, need for 2 coats of paint on lower area. Discussed how to
address previous water leak damage in ceilings.  Discussed need
to create rain to check for leaks on Live Oak roof.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrDownloaded photos of properties and work performed. Studied to

show where work done and where potential water leaks are.

3/7/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved invoice for A/C maintenance at Fairview.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrPrepared rent checks for turnover, made copies and scans.

TM Property Management 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrGathered information for request from Chase Bank re Alhambra

Gardens mortgage. Prepared letter, adjusted rent roll, made pdfs,
sent to Chase.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrMade scans of leases for files.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrGave new tenant info and deposit and rent to Matt to enter into

Quickbooks for Alhambra Gardens.
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3/8/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrApproved invoices for soil removal, landscaping and pool work.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrLetter to tenants re upcoming roof work and sent to onsite

manager. Call from contractor re increase in area and agreed to
only do the work initially contracted.

3/9/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved invoice for Oak Mountain.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived insurance package for Quail Ranch and scanned.

Searched previous packages to determine info for tracking
spreadsheet.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived business license in mail, scanned and copied.

3/10/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrText to onsite manager and handyman re potential roof leaks in

units FF, GG, HH. Received text reply re same. Call to handyman
and confirmed no know leak in FF or GG. Also gave authorization
for ceiling painting and repair in units U, NN, DD and garage repair
in parking spot 12 or 14.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from tenant in unit Y re potential move out and a potential new

tenant for the unit.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved roof invoice and gave to Matthew with comment.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails from landscaper for Balboa re broken valve. Authorized

replacement.

3/11/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReviewed insurance information that was received, scanned,

placed in correct file and updated tracking spreadsheet.

3/13/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrUpdated insurance tracking spreadsheet re Oak Mountain policy

and scanned policy.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrGathered Section 8 documents for Matthew to enter into

Quickbooks.
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3/14/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall to Whitfield re roof repair work and additional work for units FF,

GG, HH. Dicussed that he already did FF at his cost as it had to be
pulled out in laying down the newer roof over CC, DD and EE.
Talked about when the repair work for the decking would begin and
the approximate cost. Discussed the status of the soil removal work
and and block wall has been put up and gates re-installed.

3/15/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from tenant re clogged pipe. Text to handyman re same.

Email to tenant.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrGathered signatures on lease for unit CC from Tom. Made copies

and scan.

3/16/2017 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrPrepared FedEx and copies of lease for HACOLA. Cover letter.

TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCalls to SCE and SoCalGas to verify that service started in name of

new tenant and closing bills will be sent.

3/19/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to handyman re blinds and garage work for unit P.

3/20/2017 TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice for Live Oak insurance premium, approved and

gave to Matthew for a payment. Made scan and updated insurance
tracking spreadsheet and entered the new policy number.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived notice of inspection for unit H at Alhambra Gardens.

3/21/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from friend of tenant in unit E re water in ceiling. Call and text

to handyman to investigate immediately. Follow up calls with
handyman re overflow from unit R above.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrReviewed account for Lot 14 Utica of Steamfont per request of

Matthew. Made spreadsheet of charges to be paid, gave
documentation to Matthew for payment.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Walli re Thursday appointment to move 4116 Lynd.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCalls, texts and emails from tenant in unit E re ceiling leak from unit

R; from tenants in EE and DD re roof leaks. Sent handyman and
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onsite manager to units to assist.

3/22/2017 TM Property Management 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrCalls, texts and emails with handyman re Unit E ceiling leak from

unit R; from tenants in EE and DD re roof leaks.  Downloaded and
saved pictures. Calls and texts to Whitfield re roof leaks and need
for him to give assessment of how to clean and repair. He repaired
a bad seam and called me about the damage and how he would
clean it up after the leak has stopped.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to and from Kim re tomorrow's clean out of Lynd.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrPrepared items for Lynd move out.

3/23/2017 TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrMade inventory prep materials and gathered several monitors to be

moved to Live Oak. Made labels for boxes re different rooms to be
unloaded from Lynd.

TM Property Management 1.80 297.00
165.00/hrTravel to and from 4116 Lynd, Live Oak, Alhambra Gardens; at half

pay.

TM Property Management 3.50 577.50
165.00/hrTook inventory and boxed up all of previous tenant's personal

property and moved to Live Oak.

TM Property Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrConducted inspections of repair work at Alhambra Gardens. 

Checked roof above CC, DD, EE, FF, HH. Checked inside EE re
same and authorized re-painting of EE ceiling due to repeated
water leaks over the years and re-texturing of damaged area from
previous poorly done ceiling repair in center of living room.
Inspected cupboards and found no damage due to recent leaks.  
Discussed with tenant the need to remove herself during morning
of painting if paint smell bothers her but that we will install fans and
open windows to remove paint smell quickly. Checked inside FF re
same and authorized re-painting of EE ceiling due to repeated
water leaks over the years.  Also discussed floor board which
needs replacement and discussed very old carpet in bedrooms
which are heavily worn and other minor repairs. Inspected unit G
for problem with no hot water to shower and authorized handyman
first repair stems to determine if that was problem and if not to
replace pipe leading from sink to shower. Inspected unit E to
inspect damage to bathroom ceiling re water leak in unit R above.
Checked that the wall has been opened and cleared of damaged
material, authorized new drywall above shower and painting of
repaired area. Inspected unit P re kitchen blinds which are broken
and missing blinds, leaking water pipe beneath sink, broken plaster
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in bedroom requiring fix, non-functional wall plug in bedroom,
non-functional spring on garage door, leak from unit NN which
leaks into unit P garage unit below, broken toilet handle, discussed
with handyman and approved. Discussed with resident of unit A the
water leak from unit M above in the bathroom, broken blinds which
need to be replaced and a non-functional shower water mixer or
stem and approved work to be done. Inspected laundry room, area
of previous soil removal. Discussed with handyman unit DD ceiling
damage. Discussed also the sequence of repairs to be done.

3/23/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed with landscaper need to trim the 7 trees at Live Oak and

ok'd the work to be done.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with tenant in DD re need for hotel as previous two spots of

previous water damage should be corrected as well. Authorized a
rent credit to find a low cost hotel.

3/24/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived email with water bill for Fairview and approved.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmail from DD tenant re problem with ceiling and need for hotel

until work completed. Reviewed pictures re same. Email to tenant
re affordable hotels in area, dates of expected completion of ceiling
drywall work.

3/25/2017 TM Property Management 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrText to contractor re drywall work in unit DD. Call from same re

completion of installation of drywall and scheduled the painting of
the drywall for Tuesday.  Also discussed other units which will have
work done.  Call from tenant in DD re not able to move back in due
to fumes of the drywall. Researched hotel costs in area. Calls to
contractor and tenant.

TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalls from unit CC tenant re items requiring minor repair re living

room window stuck, potential problem with mixer on shower/tub.

3/27/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrVoicemail from tenant in unit H re needed repairs. Added contact

info.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to unit DD re paint job tomorrow.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to unit H tenant and discussed ceiling hole which requires

drywall and other repair request. Text from tenant re same.
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3/28/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from contractor re need to open DD for ceiling painting. Text to

onsite manager. Text to Whitfield re same. Notified when finished
with ceilings work. Text to unit DD resident.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrApproved invoice for monthly association fee for Rancho

Cucamonga lot.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrResearched property tax payment situation for 4050 Lynd, gave

invoice to Matthew for payment.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived numerous invoices for security and approved and turned

in for payment.

3/29/2017 TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrApproved invoices and discussed with Tom re same.

TM Property Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmail to handyman re prioritization of repair projects at Alhambra

Gardens.

3/30/2017 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived invoice for sprinkler replacement, approved and turned in

for payment.

TM Property Management 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrFinished spreadsheet of repair projects for Alhambra Gardens and

sent to handyman by email and text.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText from tenant re repairs and replied re status.

3/31/2017 TM Property Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with handyman re status of repairs at Alhambra Gardens.

Direction to visit tenant at CC re same. Added repairs to list.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrText to Whitfield re Live Oak visit.

SUBTOTAL: [ 30.50 5,032.50]

Receiver                                

3/1/2017 TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Alan Reay re offers to purchase, 14 received,

discuss process for best and final, timing of same and due
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diligence and closing, follow up with counsel re contract, review
offer summary.

3/1/2017 TAS Receiver 2.40 NO CHARGE
375.00/hrPrepare narrative for fee application forward to counsel, review

comments and direct to proceed.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview draft declaration re Quail Ranch sale. Telephone call with

Howard re same, add language re land.

3/7/2017 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to Arcadia for meetings with USA and IT

consultant.

TAS Receiver 4.10 1,537.50
375.00/hrMeet at site re back office, mail, other.

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrTravel time at 50% of time to Arcadia to Irvine.

3/8/2017 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with counsel re cell tower lease, it has a right of first

refusal, review lease and offer re buy out or lease term extension,
consider how to handle, Telephone call with Howard and direct re
same.

3/9/2017 TAS Receiver 1.10 412.50
375.00/hrReview draft sale motion, add language re sales and marketing,

other information, made edits. Telephone call with Eva Lin re same
and data needed, incorporate same. Telephone call with Ted re
finalizing motion.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Howard re cell tower issue progress, right of

first refusal, etc.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrBrief Ted on how we are handling Quail Ranch right of first refusal

and cell tower lease.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrRead email re Judge's order re Fairview, consider next steps.

3/13/2017 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted re need to give right of first refusal to buyer.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re Fairview sale issue, Telephone call with Ted re

getting Chen to stipulate to waiving requirements.
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3/13/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview amended judgment and consent, execute and return.

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrRespond to counsel's questions re Rancho Cucamonga purchase

and sale agreement.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Howard re right of first refusal, direct Ted to

give notice of same.

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrExecute revised consent.

3/15/2017 TAS Receiver 1.10 412.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Alan Reay re offers received, go over various

terms and conditions, select best bid, consider changes request
overbid parameters; consider same. Telephone call with counsel re
same, develop response. Telephone call with Alan Reay re same,
direct Ted re contract changes.

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer re Fairview closing, process.

3/16/2017 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone calls with Ted Fates and Tim re status of Oak Mountain

papers, change due to recent court ruling, direst re publishing, new
closing dates. Telephone call with Eva Lin re same.

3/17/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and consider list of offers and prices and terms.

3/20/2017 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrReview and comment on draft PSA.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrCalls and emails re Oak Mountain sale and motion for approval,

publication, etc.

3/21/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with potential overbidder on Quail Ranch, has a

contingent buyer, provide deadline and terms.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position. 
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3/21/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrExecute PSA.

3/27/2017 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview RFEs, direct Darren re same, forward same.

3/28/2017 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re Balboa property.

3/29/2017 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted re Oak Mountain sale, email Eva re same.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrMeet with Tim re listing agreement, prices, commissions, terms, for

Alhambra Gardens, direct re revisions, review same and execute
agreements.

TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrConfer with Tim re Lynd listing, suggested listing price, analyze

comparable sales and listings, develop price, review draft listing,
revise same, execute same.

3/31/2017 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrConfer re Hills Garden declaration, revise and execute.

SUBTOTAL: [ 20.50 6,787.50]

Receivership Administration  

3/1/2017 BC Receivership Administration 3.20 192.00
60.00/hrOrganized paperwork and created folders. Scanned documents to

Chen files. Open mail and sorted.

3/2/2017 BC Receivership Administration 5.00 300.00
60.00/hrOrganized paperwork and created folders. Scanned documents to

Chen files. Open mail and sorted. Input data into Chen Master
Creditor list.

3/6/2017 BC Receivership Administration 2.70 162.00
60.00/hrOpen mail and sorted. Input data into Chen Master Creditor list.

3/8/2017 BC Receivership Administration 3.00 180.00
60.00/hrOpen mail and sorted. Input data into Chen Master Creditor list.

Scanned Ammine documents into Pubdocs.  Prepared Fedex for
Ammine, going to Dominican Rep.
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3/14/2017 BC Receivership Administration 0.50 30.00
60.00/hrOpen mail and sorted. Input data into Chen Master Creditor list. 

3/21/2017 BC Receivership Administration 0.70 42.00
60.00/hrPrepared and mailed checks to vendors for USFIA and Hills

Garden Hotel.

3/28/2017 BC Receivership Administration 5.20 312.00
60.00/hrEntered data into Bank Account Matrix spread sheet.

3/29/2017 BC Receivership Administration 2.00 120.00
60.00/hrEntered data into Bank Account Matrix spread sheet.

3/1/2017 HG Receivership Administration 0.30 21.00
70.00/hrTranslate a report on Singapore wiring remittance statistics for

Alison for Chen entities from Chinese to English.

3/14/2017 HG Receivership Administration 8.00 560.00
70.00/hrOrganized the statements and deposits and checks for Chenne

Corporation Citibank acct 6732 and 8430; Scotiabank acct 0053
and file them. 

3/15/2017 HG Receivership Administration 1.00 70.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for USFIA, Inc.'s

entities.

HG Receivership Administration 0.90 63.00
70.00/hrCopied A/P checks and prepared mailing them for Hills Garden

Hotel, LLC.

3/22/2017 HG Receivership Administration 6.40 448.00
70.00/hrOrganize the accounts and make each account consistent.

SUBTOTAL: [ 38.90 2,500.00]

Sell Property/Liquidate Assets

3/1/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrHad conference call with broker for hotel and discussed offers and

next steps.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived offers. Reviewed and saved to file and notified Receiver.

3/6/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrWorked on PSA for hotel.
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3/7/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.90 148.50
165.00/hrWorked with broker, counsel and title company on PSA issues.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrTracked down cell tower lease for Quail Ranch sale.  Reviewed

review documents request from Allen Matkins regarding sale, copy
document and pass to Tim - meet with Tim to explain cell tower
lease as well as buyout provision and relay important dates and
forward email and other written communication regarding buyout.

3/9/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrPrinted initial copy and most recent copy of lease buyout for cell

tower. Met with Receiver regarding lease buyout.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCalled appraiser to ask questions about cell tower lease valuation.

3/10/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.80 297.00
165.00/hrMet with Alison Juroe regarding missing vehicles for USFIA.

Performed research into missing vehicles.  Contacted Mercedes
tracking company regarding vehicles. Sent order appointing
receiver in order to access the tracking records of the cars. 
Tracking accounts not turned on. Sent VINs to broker to get
information on recent registrations. Called Land Rover and BMW
support to inquire about tracking options for missing vehicles. No
options available since tracking not on.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrContacted Ted Fates regarding recent order signed by judge

regarding property sales; inquired as to its impact on other sales
and next steps.

3/14/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrHad call with broker regarding offers. Met with Tim regarding

requested documents.

3/15/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrWorked on information requests regarding hotel sale.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReviewed highest and best offers sent by Alan Reay.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrHad conference call with Alan Reay and Receiver to discuss

highest and best offers.

3/16/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrWorked on documents for hotel sale with Maxwell Shapiro. Worked

with Broker and counsel regarding timeline and publication in lieu
of signed stipulation. Met with Tim McDonnell for publication and
hearing deadlines. Wrote timeline and distributed to interested
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parties.

3/17/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrDownloaded all offers on hotel and reviewed.  Save to Receiver's

files. Passed summary to Receiver. Had call with broker.

3/20/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrMade additional edits to PSA based on Receiver, counsel and

broker's agreement for delivery to winning bidder.  Went through
multiple revisions.

3/21/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrReceived new PSA page for hotel PSA; Reviewed, made edits

based on Receiver direction, had Receiver sign then scanned and
sent back to broker.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrHad call with broker to discuss hotel turnover.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived instruction from Receiver regarding hotel true-up items at

close of sale.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrMet with Matthew Flahive regarding true-up items for hotel.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCalled Ted Fates to discuss motion. Had meeting with Tim

McDonnell and Receiver to regarding publication.

3/23/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrRespond to Ted Fates regarding hotel commission.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrRead and respond to emails from Ted Fates and Alan Reay

regarding initial listing of hotel.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrSent email to Doug Rugg regarding order to sell autos.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrHad call with Doug Rugg regarding logistics of picking up cars and

transferring to Orange County.

3/27/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrRespond to email from Ted Fates.
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3/27/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed overbid procedure with Receiver; relayed to broker.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrRead and responded to multiple emails from broker and counsel

regarding PSA and insertion of disclosures and overbid procedures.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with Alan Reay regarding PSA and overbid procedures.

3/28/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrWorked with broker and counsel regarding disclosures. Had call

with Max Shapiro and Alan Reay.  Sent email to Ted Fates.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrHad status call with car broker to approve maintenance and detail

work, determine pricing, sales strategy and timing.

3/30/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCall with Tim Hsu regarding order denying sale stipulation. Went

over new timeline and filing dates and sale procedures.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDiscussed revised publication date with Tim and reviewed

publication document contents for dates and amounts; revised.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrHad call with Alan Reay to discuss adjusted timeline and extension

for bids to match publication.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrResearched cell tower easement documentation and history. Left

voicemail for Angela from Crown Castle. Contacted title company.

3/31/2017 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrLogged in and searched for easement documentation. Emailed

hotel manager and had call with Corwn Castle.  Received
easement from Crown Castle and forwarded to broker and Maxwell
Shapiro.

3/1/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Fates re Fairview motion being off calendar. Email to

escrow and title re any other items needed from me.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Fates re Quail Ranch declaration; gave to Tom for

signature.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Premac re properties requring update of title work.

Replied with details on status of each property.
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3/2/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Premac with updates to title reports for Oak Mountain

and Hill Garden.

3/3/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived items from escrow re Fairview re estimated closing

proceeds and other amendments. Email to Matthew re Fairview
HOA payments. Received reply that all paid. Sent to escrow and
received reply re monies received.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 2.00 330.00
165.00/hrEmail from attorneys with Quail Ranch motion for sale to post to

website. Prepared, posted, made translation page for Heidi and
gave to her. Got translation and posted to website. Sent out emails
to subscribers. Email to group. Fixed previous posted to have
correct title to post. Discussed translation error on previous post
and fixed.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails from broker re Lynd. Replied re waiting on organizing

personal items.

3/6/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from attorney with questions related to the Seller's Affidavit re

Quail Ranch. Discussed and reviewed with him the information we
put on the form. Sent him what I filled out for Fairview transaction.
Filled out info for Fairview and prepared for signature.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.90 148.50
165.00/hrCall with broker re Alhambra Gardens and discussed how it will be

marketed. Discussed physical condition and what type of buyer will
pursue this as it is a smaller property than institution buyer
requirements. Talked about roof condition and how much more of
the units require work to kitchens and baths. Discussed retrofit
requirements for the parking areas which will require significant
work. Discussed issues re settling, common to the area of
properties of that age.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER to downloaded any order confirming sale but

found none, email from and to broker re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrSent revised preliminary title to Darren re Hill Garden. Discussed

with him re which title company is to be used.

3/7/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDiscussed with Darren the issues surrounding title insurance on the

properties to be sold. Covered the PSA's and need for flexibility,
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title company issues, opinions of our attorneys.

3/7/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER for confirming order of sale of Fairview but none

found.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrEmail from attorney with escrow documents to fill out for Quail

Ranch escrow.

3/8/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 2.50 412.50
165.00/hrReviewed Owner's Affidavit re parcel numbers listed. Reviewed

master list of properties and prepared new spreadsheet with parcel
numbers, email to attorney's re same. Call with Fates re how best
to handle. Email to Dzida and call with same. Discussed with Tom.
Numerous calls and emails to and from attorneys and broker re cell
phone tower, extension or buyout proposal, legal description of
property. Discussed with Darren and confirmed proposal. Sent
numerous documents to attorneys and brokers, made pdf of items
sent from broker to buyer. Calls with Matthew in our office re
payments made by lessee and reported back to attorneys.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed need for inventory of Lynd and Oak Mountain property

and need to remove items to Live Oak for sale of personal property.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from broker re Fairview order. Email to Fates and to broker.

Checked PACER for order.

3/9/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrLooked through escrow documentation re Owner's Affidavit. Email

to broker for Oak Mountain re status of furniture, received reply re
same. Call to escrow agent re Owner's Affidavit and discussed the
requirements for title insurance as laid out by Premac. Call to Fates
re update of filing for Oak Mountain. Sent email summarizing info
with contact info for Premac and myself.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Hamlin, replied re same. Email to attorneys re Quail

Ranch and call with Fates re same. Discussed which lease was
given to the appraiser with Darren.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails from Premac and escrow re Oak Mountain.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrEmails to and from Fates, Pollock re lease of cell tower,

assignment.  Replied to same and searched our files for
assignments. Email from Fates re need for assignment and notice
info, email to Clevenger re same. Reply from Clevenger with info,
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sent email with request to American Tower.

3/10/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmail from escrow re affidavit for Oak Mountain. Added needed

comments of declaration before Tom's signature. Call from escrow
and discussed timeline of sale and other documents needed,
owners affidavit.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to American Tower re getting the Assignment of Lease.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEdits to escrow documents re Oak Mountain. Received email from

escrow with revised grant deed and instruction. Discussed with
escrow.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail from American Tower re sublease, received letter explaining

sublease. Sent to Fates with comment. Email from Fates
requesting more info. Sent email requesting sublease,
correspondence with landlord, notice requirements.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Fates re denied order for Fairview sale, discussed with

Darren and Alison re other transactions and needs for additional
appraisals, etc.

3/13/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed with Tom the procedure to deal with decline of order to

confirm sale.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrFilled out escrow documents sent by escrow re requirements of title

company. Ran QuickBooks reports to determine all work done on
Oak Mountain, edited pdf re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrLooked up listing info for Tom re Rancho Cucamonga property,

received questions for Fates and prepared response re same.

3/14/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrQuestions from Darren re items needed to close sale on hotel.

Printed example of Owner's Declaration.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails to and from broker re status of Fairview.

3/15/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.80 132.00
165.00/hrCalls and texts from Kim re closing time for Fairview. Discussed

with Tom and Alexis re waive rent for last half of March and what
could be done in the event of no stipulation. Email to Tom re
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escrow instruction, asked him to forward to escrow. Email to Kim re
same.

3/15/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDiscussed broker needs with Tom, email to Chu re same.

Discussed with Alexis.

3/16/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrDiscussed need for info of appropriate newspaper of general

circulation accepted by Federal courts. Found list for San
Bernardino County, saved list and printed out.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived emails from escrow with instruction. Reviewed and

replied asking for rent to be forwarded to receiver. Received, got
Tom's approval and stamped. Sent to escrow..

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrEmails from Lin re hearing date. Call from Tom re same. Call to

Fates re Oak Mountain filing and discussed with Janine. Call from
Tom re same. Direction to publish notice in LA Times re Oak
Mountain and Fairview. Call to Fates re need for hearing dates,
overbid date, narrative for notice, etc.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrCalls with Fates re notice requirements. Calls to Lin and Kim re

contact info. Sent to Fates. Looked up info re legal notices in LA
Times.

3/17/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.70 280.50
165.00/hrCalls and emails with Fates re Tom's declarations for Oak

Mountain and Fairview. Received narrative of notice, checked
potential publishing dates for LA Times. Discussed with Fates and
arranged publishing for one day each. Gathered receipt and
submitted for Tom. Arranged for signature on declaration for
Fairview and returned to Fates. Returned Oak Mtn. after signature.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmail from Fates re publishing notice for Quail Ranch, researched

potential substitutes to LA Times. Downloaded pdf of Riverside
County newspapers of general circulation.  Checked a few of the
papers. Email to Press Enterprise with narrative to get a pricing
quote for a four day publication over four weeks.

3/20/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived email from The Press-Enterprise re costs to publish

notice for Quail Ranch. Email to Fates re same. Received revised
declaration and motion for Tom to sign. Call to Tom and left
message.
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3/20/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrCall from Kim re status of Fairview escrow and discussed what can

be done to keep the buyer involved. Also discussed the cleaning
out of 4116 Lynd and upcoming Balboa property. Call to Fates and
discussed the Fairview escrow. Received email from Kim re buyer
requires clarity.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrDiscussed Quail Ranch motion and declaration with Fates and

gave one change idea. Gathered signature from Tom, made scan
of declaration signature page and sent to Fates.

3/21/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrPrinted email from broker for Fairview re buyer's needs to stay in

the deal for Tom to review.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived dates of sale for hotel and made narrative of sale notice

for publication.

3/22/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrDiscussed with Darren the sales process of the automobiles and

the personal property.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Chu re listing agreement, email to him with vesting info.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Fates re potential stipulation re sale procedures.

Replied re same.

3/23/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Tom and Fates re sale notice procedures re Quail

Ranch, Oak Mountain, Fairview, etc.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrApproved broker to move forward with the cleaning of Lynd and

asked for listing agreement re same.

3/24/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEntered information onto hotel overbid notice.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrPurchased additional week of sale notice publication for Oak

Mountain and Fairview from LA Times. Call to Times to advance
the publication date to appropriate date as previously given to
counsel. Turned in publication expenses to accountant re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrSent in info to be published to Press-Enterprise for Quail Ranch.

Searched through materials to verify not a duplicate order and
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checked emails with Fates re publication issues.

3/24/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReviewed info sent to me from broker for Alhambra Gardens.

3/27/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail with LA Times proof of publication re Oak Mountain and

Fairview.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrReceived email from Press-Enterprise re order for Quail Ranch

publication of sale notice. Filled out and made pdf. Sent to
Press-Enterprise. Turned in receipt info for expense.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from broker with cleaning invoice for 4116 Lynd. Approved

and turned in.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.80 297.00
165.00/hrEdits to Addendum for listing agreement and agreement. Made into

pdf.

3/28/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrFinalized edits to listing agreement for Alhambra. Printed out.

Researched apartment rent values around Alhambra to evaluate
how much renovation work needed to approach those values.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrEdits to Lynd listing agreement and addendum and prepared for

signature.

3/29/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail to Fates re question of how much notice publication needs to

be purchased for Fairview and Oak Mountain. Read through
previous order re proposed sale and discussed with Tom and Fates
on the phone.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrReview of state guidelines re earthquake retrofitting. Checked LA

County and Alhambra re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrEmails to and from Chu re Alhambra initial sales price. Discussed

with Tom and edits to listing agreement and addendum. Gathered
signatures, scanned and sent by email to broker.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrCalls and emails to Kim re Lynd initial sales price and comparable

properties. Presented agreement to Tom for review, made edits per
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Tom, gathered signatures and sent by email to broker.

3/30/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrEmail from Hsu re denial of stipulated waiver. Call from him re

same and discussed with Darren. Sent him narrative and
suggestions for publication dates. Calls and email to SBSun re
same. Arranged for Monday publishing dates and sent legal notice
to The Sun. Arranged for payment. Call from Fates and Hsu re
needed change to deadline date. Email to SBSUN re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrArranged for payment of weeks three and four of sale notice

publication for Oak Mountain and Fairview in the LA Times.

3/31/2017 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Tim Hsu with needed changes to declaration for Tom re

Hills Garden. Read through document and submitted suggestions
to Hsu. Discussed with Tom and authorized Hsu to file document.
Confirmed notice publication has been purchased. Discussed court
confirmation process.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrAdded info re court confirmation and overbid process to listing

agreements and sent to Kim and Chu re Lynd and Alhambra
Gardens.

SUBTOTAL: [ 49.80 8,217.00]

For professional services rendered $50,053.00400.40

Balance due $50,053.00

Exhibit A, Page 114

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 115 of 125   Page ID
 #:7689



EXHIBIT B 

 

Exhibit B, Page 115

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 116 of 125   Page ID
 #:7690



Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6.xls Summary By Timekeeper
Page 1 of 2

Thomas Seaman, Receiver Hours Rate Cost
Jan-17 42.6                 $375.00 $15,975.00
Feb-17 21.4                 $375.00 $8,025.00
Mar-17 18.1                 $375.00 $6,787.50
Total 82.1               $375.00 $30,787.50

Alison Juroe, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
Jan-17 33.2                 $200.00 $6,640.00
Feb-17 23.5                 $200.00 $4,700.00
Mar-17 40.7                 $200.00 $8,140.00
Total 97.4               $200.00 $19,480.00

Timothy McDonnell, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
Jan-17 57.6                 $165.00 $9,504.00
Feb-17 51.9                 $165.00 $8,563.50
Mar-17 78.6                 $165.00 $12,969.00
Total 188.1             $165.00 $31,036.50

Darren Clevenger, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
Jan-17 30.1                 $165.00 $4,966.50
Feb-17 25.3                 $165.00 $4,174.50
Mar-17 42.8                 $165.00 $7,062.00
Total 98.2               $165.00 $16,203.00

January 1, 2017, through March 31, 2017

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for USFIA, Inc. et al
Sixth Interim Fee Application

Summary of Fees
Summary By Timekeeper
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6.xls Summary By Timekeeper
Page 2 of 2

Various Adminstrative Assistants Hours Rate Cost
Jan-17 235.6               $70.00 $16,448.00
Feb-17 221.4               $68.00 $14,946.50
Mar-17 217.5               $69.00 $15,094.50
Total 674.5             $69.00 $46,489.00

Total Hours Rate Cost
Jan-17 399.1               $134.00 $53,533.50
Feb-17 343.5               $118.00 $40,409.50
Mar-17 397.7               $126.00 $50,053.00
Total, Receiver and Agent hours 1,140.3          $126.00 $143,996.00
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6.xls Summary By Task
Page 2 of 3

Accounting and Reporting Hours Rate
Accounting and 

Reporting
Jan-17 41.7                $75 $3,127.50
Feb-17 22.6                $94 $2,132.50
Mar-17 19.9                $89 $1,767.50
Total Accounting and Reporting 84.2              $83 $7,027.50

Forensic Accounting Hours Rate Forensic Accounting
Jan-17 187.4              $79 $14,745.50
Feb-17 179.7              $76 $13,681.00
Mar-17 160.7              $79 $12,640.50
Total Forensic Accounting 527.8              $78 $41,067.00

Investor Relations Hours Rate Investor Relations 
Jan-17 7.3                  $141 $1,026.50
Feb-17 18.6                $158 $2,939.00
Mar-17 32.1                $143 $4,576.00
Total Investor Relations 58.0              $147 $8,541.50

Manage Business Hours Rate Manage Business
Jan-17 24.4                $165 $4,026.00
Feb-17 19.2                $165 $3,168.00
Mar-17 23.3                $165 $3,844.50
Total Manage Business 66.9              $165 $11,038.50

Project Management Hours Rate Project Management
Jan-17 22.0                $198 $4,347.50
Feb-17 4.4                  $199 $876.50
Mar-17 24.4                $192 $4,687.50
Total Project Management 50.8              $195 $9,911.50

Property Management Hours Rate Property Management

Jan-17 30.7                $165 $5,065.50

Feb-17 25.8                $165 $4,257.00

Mar-17 30.5                $165 $5,032.50

Total Property Management 87.0                $165 $14,355.00
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6.xls Summary By Task
Page 3 of 3

Receiver Hours Rate Receiver
Jan-17 42.3                $375 $15,862.50
Feb-17 21.2                $375 $7,950.00
Mar-17 18.1                $375 $6,787.50
Total Receiver 81.6              $375 $30,600.00

Receivership Administration Hours Rate
Receivership 

Administration
Jan-17 19.0                $70 $1,323.00
Feb-17 30.7                $62 $1,891.00
Mar-17 38.9                $64 $2,500.00
Total Receivership Administration 88.6              $64 $5,714.00

Sell/Liquidate Assets Hours Rate Sell/Liquidate Assets
Jan-17 24.3                $165 $4,009.50
Feb-17 21.3                $165 $3,514.50
Mar-17 49.8                $165 $8,217.00
Total Sell Liquidate Assets 95.4              $165 $15,741.00

Total All Activities Hours Rate Total All Activities
Jan-17 399.1              $134 $53,533.50
Feb-17 343.5              $118 $40,409.50
Mar-17 397.7              $126 $50,053.00
Total All Activities 1,140.3         $126 $143,996.00

Exhibit C, Page 121

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 122 of 125   Page ID
 #:7696



 

EXHIBIT D 

 

Exhibit D, Page 122

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 123 of 125   Page ID
 #:7697



Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 124 of 125   Page ID
 #:7698



Exhibit D, Page 124

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 249   Filed 05/26/17   Page 125 of 125   Page ID
 #:7699


	Receiver's Sixth Interim Fee Application
	Exhibit A - Detailed Descriptions of Work Performed
	Exhibit B - Summary of Fees by Timekeeper
	Exhibit C - Summary by Task
	Exhibit D - Standardized Fund Accounting Report




