
1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

 

848594.01/SD  
 

LAW OFFICES 

Allen Matkins Leck Gamble 
Mallory & Natsis LLP 

ALLEN MATKINS LECK GAMBLE
   MALLORY & NATSIS LLP 
DAVID R. ZARO (BAR NO. 124334) 
TIM C. HSU (BAR NO. 279208) 
865 South Figueroa Street, Suite 2800 
Los Angeles, California 90017-2543 
Phone:  (213) 622-5555 
Fax:  (213) 620-8816 
E-Mail:  dzaro@allenmatkins.com 

thsu@allenmatkins.com 
 
EDWARD G. FATES (BAR NO. 227809) 
501 West Broadway, 15th Floor 
San Diego, California 92101-3541 
Phone:  (619) 233-1155 
Fax:  (619) 233-1158 
E-Mail:  tfates@allenmatkins.com 
 
Attorneys for Receiver 
Thomas A. Seaman 
 
 

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 

CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA 

WESTERN DIVISION 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION, 
 

Plaintiff, 
 

v. 
 
STEVE CHEN, USFIA, INC., 
ALLIANCE FINANCIAL 
GROUP, INC., AMAUCTION, INC., 
ABORELL MGMT I, LLC, ABORELL 
ADVISORS I, LLC, ABORELL 
REIT II, LLC, AHOME REAL 
ESTATE, LLC, ALLIANCE 
NGN, INC., APOLLO REIT I, INC., 
APOLLO REIT II, LLC, AMKEY, INC., 
US CHINA CONSULTATION 
ASSOCIATION, and QUAIL RANCH 
GOLF COURSE, LLC, 
 

Defendants. 
 

Case No. 2:15-cv-07425 RGK PLA
 
FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION OF 
SQUIRE PATTON BOGGS US LLP, 
LOCAL COUNSEL IN THE 
DOMINICAN REPUBLIC TO THE 
RECEIVER, FOR PAYMENT OF 
FEES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF 
EXPENSES 
 
Date: January 9, 2017 
Time: 9:00 a.m. 
Ctrm: 850 
Judge: Hon. R. Gary Klausner 
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Mallory & Natsis LLP 

Squire Patton Boggs, US LLP ("SPB"), local counsel to Thomas A. Seaman 

("Receiver") in the Dominican Republic, the Court-appointed permanent receiver for 

Defendants USFIA, Inc., Alliance Financial Group, Inc., Amauction, Inc., Aborell 

Mgmt I, LLC, Aborell Advisors I, LLC, Aborell REIT II, LLC, Ahome Real 

Estate, LLC, Alliance NGN, Inc., Apollo REIT I, Inc., Apollo REIT II, LLC, 

Amkey, Inc., US China Consultation Association, Quail Ranch Golf Course, LLC, 

and their subsidiaries and affiliates (collectively, "Receivership Entities"), hereby 

submits this first interim application for approval and payment of fees and 

reimbursement of expenses ("Application").  This Application covers the period from 

April 11, 2016, through October 31, 2016 ("First Application Period"), and seeks 

approval of $47,357.75 in fees and $4,926.92 in expenses, and an order authorizing 

the Receiver to pay the approved fees and expenses incurred. 

I. INTRODUCTION 

The Receivership Entities, which appear to have been operating in the 

Dominican Republic by investing in real property with various mining activities, 

such as the extraction of amber, managing several bank accounts with continuous 

money flow and maintaining registries of the operating companies in public records.  

All these actions appear to be linked to the scheme at the heart of the action filed by 

the Securities and Exchange Commission ("Commission").  The Receiver was 

appointed on a permanent basis on October 6, 2015. 

The appointment orders confer broad duties, responsibilities, and powers on 

the Receiver that are designed to allow him to secure, preserve, and protect the assets 

of the Receivership Entities, investigate and recover sums transferred to third parties, 

conduct a forensic accounting and analysis of the Receivership Entities' financial 

transactions, review and analyze investor claims, and maximize the amount 

ultimately available for distribution to investors.  The appointment orders also 

authorize the Receiver to engage counsel to assist him in the performance of his 

duties.  The Receiver, after learning that the Receivership Entities transferred 
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substantial sums to entities located in the Dominican Republic, engaged SPB's Santo 

Domingo Office to assist in having this Court's orders and the Receiver's 

appointment recognized by the Dominican Republic courts and investigating 

potential assets of the Receivership Entities located in the Dominican Republic. 

This Application seeks interim approval and payment of $47,357.75 in fees for 

a total of 319.70 hours worked.  The work performed is described task-by-task in 

Exhibit A and is broken down into the following categories: 

Matter Hours 

Investigation of Local Representation and Subsidiaries 
(Potential Regulatory Registries)

147.32

Processing Local Recognition of Preliminary Order and 
Enforcing Same 

31.18

Asset Investigation: Bank Accounts 88.40

Asset Investigation: Real Estate Property 43.90
Appeal filed by Ammine for Annulment of Exequatur which 
Recognizes Preliminary Order in the Dominican Republic 

8.90

TOTAL 319.70

II. SUMMARY OF TASKS PERFORMED AND COSTS INCURRED 

A. Categories and Descriptions of Work 

1. Investigation of Local Representation and Subsidiaries 

SPB assisted the Receiver in investigating all established entities related to the 

Receivership Entities in the Dominican Republic.  For this, SPB conducted due 

diligence which involved the Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo 

Domingo, which serves as a registry for all entities domiciled in Santo Domingo and 

who have access to other Chambers around the country.  In doing so, SPB identified 

three Dominican established entities: Ammine, S. R. L., Amn, S. R. L. and Natural 

Gem, S. R. L. ("Dominican Entities"). 

Through these investigations, SPB obtained incorporation documents, and 

information on main domiciles, shareholders, and administrators.  We coordinated, 
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with a private investigator and a public notary, a visit to the domiciles and obtained a 

declaration from the public notary addressing that the domicile was a residence. 

SPB's investigation also identified Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam and Yan Chen, 

who are believed to be managing some of the financial operations, including bank 

accounts in the Dominican Republic.  In accordance with the information provided 

by the private investigator and a credit report obtained, we confirmed that the 

domicile of the Dominican Receivership Entities is the same address in records for 

the residence of Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam.  Mrs. Alvarez has a number of online 

public profiles and regularly shares pictures of large portions of land, trips around the 

country, and amber gems. 

SPB also found information on employees registered under Ammine, and 

accordingly we requested details at the Ministry of Labor of the official employees 

list filed by the entity.  Through this work, SPB discovered that 17 employees were 

operating in an undiscovered facility located in the outskirts of Santo Domingo. 

After identifying all entities related to the amber and larimar stones mining 

business, we researched the regulations applicable to amber and larimar mining 

operations in the Dominican Republic and if any of the Dominican Entities were 

authorized to carry out said operations.  We found no registries in favor of the 

Dominican Entities and that a number of unregulated entities/people carried out 

amber mining extractions and exportations without strict regulations, specifically in 

the area of Hato Mayor, where we have carried out a few onsite investigations. 

Finally, SPB discovered that certain proceedings for liquidation of the 

Dominican Entities had been requested to the Chamber of Commerce and Production 

of Santo Domingo.  SPB also identified the accountant carrying out the operation of 

liquidation and discovered that he was not authorized by the Dominican Accountant 

Bar Association.  The Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo Domingo was 

notified of this information, along with a certification from the Dominican 
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Accountant Bar Association, in order to suspend the liquidation proceedings. The 

corresponding actions, further along this application, were taken. 

2. Processing Local Recognition of Preliminary Order and Enforcing Same 

SPB prepared and filed a motion to obtain local recognition and enforcement 

of the Preliminary Injunction Order in the Dominican Republic ("Exequatur 

Motion") by the corresponding Dominican court, which was granted.  Subsequently, 

we proceeded to enforce the decision by: 

 Notifying the Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo 

Domingo, by requesting the designation of the Receiver as Permanent 

administrator and an opposition to the dissolution process started by the 

administrator/shareholders of the Dominican Entities; 

 Notifying all major banks of the Exequatur and the obligation to 

designate the Receiver as administrator; and 

 Receiving responses from several banks, including the Bank of Nova 

Scotia, which provided all bank statements in full depth and access to 

the account. 

 Notifying the local general manager in records for the Dominican 

Entities, Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam. 

3. Asset Investigation: Bank Accounts 

All notifications previously mentioned to the bank institutions helped SPB 

identify the numerous transfers from foreign accounts and the constant payments and 

withdrawals carried out by the local administrators/shareholders.  This confirmed 

how big the operation was in the Dominican Republic.  Also, we contacted the 

Superintendent of Securities to obtain assistance in the enforcement of the decision. 

4. Asset Investigation: Real Estate Property 

Our Investigations began with an offering by the Receiver of several property 

sale agreements.  We identified the following information: 
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Seller  Name of 
Parcel 

Portion of 
Land 

Approx. 
Value in 

Accordance 
with 

Contract1
 

Approx. 
Transfer 
Taxes in 

Accordance 
with 

Contract's 
Value1

 

Daisis Peña 
Núñez & Patria 
Núñez 

42-A-C 98  32,826.49 mt2  $86,956.52  $2,608.70 

Manfredy de los 
Santos Zapata 

151 DC. 39/10  94,320 mt2  $16,304.34  $489.13 

Manfredy de los 
Santos Zapata 

151-A DC. 
39/10 

544,181.00 mt2  $94,059.80  $2,821.80 

Sigfrido de los 
Santos Zapata 

151-004.1187 
DC. 39/10 

240,564.20 mt2  $41,577.17  $1,247.31 

Amado de los 
Santos Zapata 

151-004.1189 
DC 39/10 

199,263.60 mt2  $34,442.73  $1,033.28 

None of the properties have been duly transferred in favor of Ammine, the 

purchasing entity, for public records for these properties remain registered in favor of 

the previous owners.  This may mean they were intentionally hiding the sales from 

the public records.  SPB, after consulting with the Receiver, hired a land surveyor, 

who traveled to the properties with one of SPB's associates and discovered a number 

of mining operations handled by independent parties who had allegedly leased the 

mines and/or mining rights.  Maps were prepared with said travel to the land and an 

identification of more than 1 million square feet of land on the Hato Mayor province, 

northeast of the country. 

Furthermore, we identified a publication on a national newspaper where 

Natural Gem informed of lost title deed of a property.  A land surveyor identified the 

property in the outskirts of the city and identified a house residence in the same.  

Further investigation of this land is ongoing. 

                                           
1 Amounts in US dollars. 
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5. Appeal for Annulment of Exequatur which Recognizes Preliminary 

Order 

SPB received a notice of a claim to annul the exequatur order which was 

issued by Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam, one of the Dominican Entities' shareholder and 

administrator.  She is currently challenging the validity of the Preliminary Injunction 

Order, alleging that no preliminary decisions from abroad may be enforced in the 

country against Ammine, in accordance to Dominican Law 544-2014 of International 

Private Law.  SPB, in consultation with the Receiver, is taking appropriate steps to 

respond to the claim. 

B. Summary of Expenses Requested for Reimbursement 

SPB requests the Court approve reimbursement of $4,926.92 in out-of-pocket 

costs.2  The majority of expenses incurred relate to private investigator fees, travel 

reimbursement, request of certifications messenger/filing fees and others.  See 

attached invoices for more details.   

III. THE FEES AND COSTS ARE REASONABLE 

AND SHOULD BE ALLOWED 

"As a general rule, the expenses and fees of a receivership are a charge upon 

the property administered."  Gaskill v. Gordon, 27 F.3d 248, 251 (7th Cir. 1994).  

These expenses include the fees and expenses of this Receiver and his professionals, 

including SPB.  Decisions regarding the timing and amount of an award of fees and 

costs to the Receiver and his Professionals are committed to the sound discretion of 

the Court.  See SEC v. Elliot, 953 F.2d 1560, 1577 (11th Cir. 1992) (rev'd in part on 

other grounds, 998 F.2d 922 (11th Cir. 1993)). 

In allowing fees, a court should consider "the time, labor and skill required, 

but not necessarily that actually expended, in the proper performance of the duties 

                                           
2 Of this amount, $3,080.77 was paid in advance by the Receiver for specific 

expenses.  Therefore, SPB seeks an order approving those payments and 
authorizing the Receiver to reimburse the remaining $1,846.15 in costs. 
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imposed by the court upon the receiver [], the fair value of such time, labor and skill 

measured by conservative business standards, the degree of activity, integrity and 

dispatch with which the work is conducted and the result obtained."  United States v. 

Code Prods. Corp., 362 F. 2d 669, 673 (3d Cir. 1966) (internal quotation marks 

omitted).  In practical terms, receiver and professional compensation thus ultimately 

rests upon the result of an equitable, multi-factor balancing test involving the 

"economy of administration, the burden that the estate may be able to bear, the 

amount of time required, although not necessarily expended, and the overall value of 

the services to the estate."  In re Imperial 400 Nat'l, Inc., 432 F. 2d 232, 237 (3d Cir. 

1970).  Regardless of how this balancing test is formulated, no single factor is 

determinative and "a reasonable fee is based [upon] all circumstances surrounding 

the receivership."  SEC v. W.L. Moody & Co., Bankers (Unincorporated), 374 F. 

Supp. 465, 480 (S.D. Tex. 1974). 

As a preliminary matter, the TRO and Preliminary Injunction Order confer on 

the Receiver substantial duties and powers, including to conduct such investigation 

and discovery as is necessary to locate and account for all receivership assets, take 

such action as is necessary and appropriate to assume control over and preserve 

receivership assets, and employ attorneys and others to investigate and, where 

appropriate, institute, pursue, and prosecute all claims and causes of action of 

whatever kind and nature.  See TRO, Part XI; Preliminary Injunction Order, Part XI. 

The Receiver promptly determined that experienced, qualified local counsel in 

the Dominican Republic was necessary due to the fact that substantial sums had been 

transferred to entities located in the Dominican Republic and engaged SPB pursuant 

to the authority granted to him in the TRO and Preliminary Injunction Order.  SPB 

immediately began work and has worked diligently and efficiently to assist the 

Receiver in carrying out his Court-ordered duties.  The firm has submitted a detailed 

fee application which describes the nature of the services rendered, and the identity 

and billing rate of each individual performing each task.  See Exhibit A. 
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SQUIRE PATTON BOGGS PEÑA PRIETO GAMUNDI 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9798934  
A010010010200005223 
05/23/16 
115953.00001 
 

Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 4,818.50

Disbursements: USD$ 7.13

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 4,825.63

 

 

 

 

 

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 (INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9798934.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 
Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 

Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 

Exhibit A, Page 10
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SQUIRE PATTON BOGGS PEÑA PRIETO GAMUNDI 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9798934 
A010010010200005223 
05/23/16 
115953.00001 
 

REMITTANCE COPY 
Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 4,818.50

Disbursements: USD$ 7.13

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 4,825.63

 

 

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 
(INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) 
LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9798934.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 

Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 
Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 
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SQUIRE PATTON BOGGS PEÑA PRIETO GAMUNDI 
 
 

  115953.00001 

05/23/16 Thomas Seaman Company / Assets search related to litigation in CA 

Page 1 Invoice Number: 9798934

NCF: A010010010200005223 
 

 

  

 

ASSETS SEARCH RELATED TO LITIGATION IN CA 
LEGAL SERVICES 

 
DATE  HOURS  TIMEKEEPER  NARRATIVE 
04/11/16  1.00  A. Ceballo  Meeting with c.soto and instructions to J.Marti to start assets related investigation; review 

exchange of emails; coordinate translation of order. 
 

04/11/16  1.60  C. Soto Hernandez  Prepare for and attend conference call with client; coordinate next actions with A. Ceballo; 
exchange of emails on same; review documents; draft and send email outlining next steps; 
review and respond comments from the client regarding the same. 
 

04/12/16  0.90  A. Ceballo  Review findings report sent by J.Marti and exchange of emails with C.Soto and J.Marti 
regarding the same. 
 

04/12/16  1.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and respond emails on pending tasks; review and respond emails on translation into 
Spanish of the order; follow upon investigation and obtainment of corporate documents for 
Ammine; draft outline for exequatur process. 
 

04/14/16  3.50  A. Ceballo  Review documents and exchange of emails sent by client; review and consolidate reports sent 
by J.Marti; request and review credit reports and research other information related to assets; 
attend conference call with C.Soto; prepare updated email with reports included and send to 
C.Soto for her review. 
 

04/14/16  3.90  J. Marti  Travel to and from the National Property Jurisdiction; review public records in order to obtain 
information regarding Ammine's property; draft report regarding said property; report to C. 
Soto and A. Ceballo. 
 

04/14/16  1.60  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on status of pending tasks; prepare for and attend conference call with 
client and receiver; meet with A. Ceballo on next steps; conference call with litigation manager 
of Scotiabank; calls to the SIB; conference call with client; instructions to A. Ceballo. 
 

04/19/16  1.50  A. Ceballo  Review translation into Spanish of Injunction Order and coordinate with official translator the 
final version for court filing purposes; contact land surveyor to request quote regarding real 
estate identification. 
 

04/21/16  1.50  J. Marti  Draft request for certification from the Ministry of Labor regarding employees of Ammine; 
draft request for certification from the National Mining Department; coordinate filing of the 
same; coordinate with Baliff investigation of domicile corresponding to Ammine. 
 

04/27/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow upon pending tasks, including request for exequatur and oposition to be notified to 
Scoatibank; exchange of emails with client. 

Exhibit A, Page 12
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  115953.00001 

05/23/16 Thomas Seaman Company / Assets search related to litigation in CA 

Page 2 Invoice Number: 9798934

NCF: A010010010200005223 
 

 

  

 

 
04/28/16  1.40  A. Ceballo  Follow up with J.Martí status of pending certifications; review reports sent by bailiff regarding 

actual addresses; discuss with C.Soto next steps and receive instructions to prepare drafts of 
exequatur request and opposition. 
 

04/28/16  0.70  C. Soto Hernandez  Reports on pictures, review; review status; coordinate next steps; exchange of emails with 
client. 
 

04/29/16  6.20  A. Ceballo  Work on request of exequatur; send draft to C.Soto. 
 

04/29/16  1.10  J. Marti  Draft request for certification from the National property Authorities addressing whether 
Ammine's properties have any encumbrances; address related matters to same; report to A. 
Ceballo. 
 

TOTAL HOURS FOR THIS MATTER:   26.60_

  
TOTAL SERVICES:  USD$ 4,818.50_

 
 

 
TIME SUMMARY 

TIMEKEEPER HOURLY RATE HOURS TOTAL)

Aided Ceballo 170.00 14.50 2,465.00)

Josue Marti 95.00 6.50 617.50)

Carolina Soto Hernandez 310.00 5.60 1,736.00)

 
TOTAL SERVICES: 
 

26.60 USD$ 4,818.50_

 
 
 

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY 

 
Telephone  7.13_
 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 7.13_

Exhibit A, Page 13
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MATTER TOTAL 

 
TOTAL SERVICES: USD$ 4,818.50)
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 7.13)
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE FOR THIS MATTER: USD$ 4,825.63)
 
 

Exhibit A, Page 14
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SQUIRE PATTON BOGGS PEÑA PRIETO GAMUNDI 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9806028  
A010010010200005289 
06/27/16 
115953.00001 
 

Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 6,126.75

Disbursements: USD$ 224.08

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 6,350.83
Previous Invoices Outstanding as of the Date of this Invoice: USD$ 4,825.63

TOTAL (INCLUDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES): USD$ 11,176.46

 

 

 

 

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 (INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9806028.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 
Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 

Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 

Exhibit A, Page 15

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 164   Filed 12/06/16   Page 16 of 53   Page ID
 #:6258



 

 
 
 

SQUIRE PATTON BOGGS PEÑA PRIETO GAMUNDI 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9806028 
A010010010200005289 
06/27/16 
115953.00001 
 

REMITTANCE COPY 
Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 6,126.75

Disbursements: USD$ 224.08

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 6,350.83
Previous Invoices Outstanding as of the Date of this Invoice: USD$ 4,825.63

TOTAL (INCLUDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES): USD$ 11,176.46

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 
(INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) 
LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9806028.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 

Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 
Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 
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ASSETS SEARCH RELATED TO LITIGATION IN CA 
LEGAL SERVICES 

 
DATE  HOURS  TIMEKEEPER  NARRATIVE 
04/11/16  1.00  C. Soto Hernandez  Review status of pending tasks; further instructions; exchange of emails; call with client. 

 
04/13/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow up on pending tasks and exchange of several emails regarding the same. 

 
05/03/16  6.70  A. Ceballo  Travel to and from El Seibo Titile Registry to file real estate status certification requests for 4 

of the 5 properties; prepare and send corresponding report. 
 

05/04/16  1.40  J. Marti  Work on draft of opposition regarding the notification of Preliminary Injunction to the Bank of 
Nova Scotia. 
 

05/05/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Conference call with representative of the Superintendence of Banks; address several matters 
in attention to indications received by the SIB. 
 

05/06/16  1.20  J. Marti  Work on draft of opposition regarding the notification of Preliminary Injunction to the Bank of 
Nova Scotia. 
 

05/10/16  0.60  A. Ceballo  Follow up with status of real state property and mining directorate; review report sent by 
J.Martí regarding the sames. 
 

05/11/16  6.00  C. Alvarez  Travel to and from the Properties Jurisdiction of El Seibo to retrieve certificate of 
encumbrances regarding AMMINE'S Real estate property. 
 

05/12/16  1.20  J. Marti  Follow up on certifications of labor ministry; prepare draft of report regarding all real estate 
property in favor of Ammine, S.R.L.; prepare draft of report regarding the investigation at the 
National Mining Authorities of Ammine's potential regulations. 
 

05/12/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow upon pending tasks; review updated report and revise the same 
 

05/12/16  0.60  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails with client; meet with J. Marti to discuss results and status of 
investigations; revise updated report and send it to the client. 
 

05/13/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Review email from A. Schoor; coordinate with J. Marti to prepare responses; exchange of 
emails on same. 
 

05/16/16  2.20  A. Ceballo  Revise and review oposition request to serve the scotiabank prepared by J,Marti; review the 
applicable law and court decisions; send revise draft to C.Soto. 
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05/16/16  1.30  J. Marti  Prepare draft of response regarding follow-up questions sent by A. Schoor; report to C. Soto; 
filing of retrieved documents in physical file of Thomas Seaman Company. 
 

05/16/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Review responses drafted by J. Marti and send the same to client; follow upon completion of 
pending tasks. 
 

05/18/16  0.10  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails with A. Schoor on updated report. 
 

05/20/16  0.90  J. Marti  Draft response to follow-up questions sent by Andrea regarding Ammine's real estate property 
and corporate investigation; report to C. Soto. 
 

05/20/16  0.90  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and revise final version of the opposition to be served to Scotiabank; exchange of 
emails on same. 
 

05/23/16  5.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and revise general updated report; work on Exequatur's request motion; exchange of 
several emails on same; coordinate translation. 
 

05/25/16  0.20  E. Brache  Receive instructions from C. Soto to include corrections on english version of opposition to be 
served to the Scotiabank to block accounts. 
 

05/25/16  0.75  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and respond email from A. Schoor; review suggestions included to the Exequatur 
motion; coordinate with E. Brache drafting of the revised version; exchange of emails on same; 
exchange of further emails with A. Schoor 
 

05/26/16  0.33  E. Brache  Include corrections made by A. Schoor on english version of opposition to be served to the 
Scotiabank to block accounts and report to C. Soto. 
 

05/26/16  0.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Draft email to A. Schoor on revised versions of the opposition and Exequatur's motion. 
 

TOTAL HOURS FOR THIS MATTER:   33.08_

  
TOTAL SERVICES:  USD$ 6,126.75_
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TIME SUMMARY 

TIMEKEEPER HOURLY RATE HOURS TOTAL)

Carla Alvarez 75.00 6.00 450.00)

Eugenia Brache 125.00 0.53 66.25)

Aided Ceballo 170.00 9.50 1,615.00)

Josue Marti 95.00 6.00 570.00)

Carolina Soto Hernandez 310.00 11.05 3,425.50)

 
TOTAL SERVICES: 
 

33.08 USD$ 6,126.75_

 
 
 

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY 

 
Certifications VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_05252016 DATE: 

5/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201605 -  Tran Date 5/04/2016 - Josue Marti - Marianne 
Elmudesi -Request certification of the potential registries of mining concesions in favor 
of Ammine. S.R.L. -Sort line 376 -  DOP 700 

15.23_

Translating Charge VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_05252016 DATE: 
5/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201605 -  Tran Date 5/04/2016 - Yolanda Cosme - Certified 
Translation prelimanary injuction - Inv: 49-2016 -Sort line 680 -  DOP 9600 

208.85_

 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 224.08_

 

 
 
 

MATTER TOTAL 

 
TOTAL SERVICES: USD$ 6,126.75)
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 224.08)
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE FOR THIS MATTER: USD$ 6,350.83)
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Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9819314  
A010010010200005414 
08/31/16 
115953.00001 
 

Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 12,244.25

Less Discount on Services: USD$ (749.25)

Disbursements: USD$ 3,137.14

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 14,632.14
Previous Invoices Outstanding as of the Date of this Invoice: USD$ 11,176.46

TOTAL (INCLUDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES): USD$ 25,808.60

 

 

 

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 (INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9819314.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 
Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 

Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 
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Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9819314 
A010010010200005414 
08/31/16 
115953.00001 
 

REMITTANCE COPY 
Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 12,244.25

Less Discount on Services: USD$ (749.25)

Disbursements: USD$ 3,137.14

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 14,632.14
Previous Invoices Outstanding as of the Date of this Invoice: USD$ 11,176.46

TOTAL (INCLUDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES): USD$ 25,808.60

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 
(INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) 
LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9819314.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 

Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 
Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 
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ASSETS SEARCH RELATED TO LITIGATION IN CA 

LEGAL SERVICES 
 
DATE  HOURS  TIMEKEEPER  NARRATIVE 
06/02/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and respond email from A. Schoor regarding motions; follow upon the pending tasks 

with J. Marti; exchange of emails on same. 
 

06/03/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Address several matters on pending tasks. 
 

06/06/16  0.60  E. Brache  Receive instructions from C. Soto to notify opposition to Scotiabank and file Exequatur 
request before the Civil and Commercial Chamber of the First Instance Court of the National 
District and discuss strategy and next steps. 
 

06/06/16  1.05  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of several emails on pending tasks and updated report to the client; review 
comments to the motion and instruct preparation of final version of the motions in attention to 
the same; exchange of further emails on same. 
 

06/07/16  1.00  E. Brache  Revise translation of Preliminary Injunction and exchange electronic messages with official 
translator to modify and sign; report to C. Soto. 
 

06/07/16  2.70  C. Soto Hernandez  Address several matters on pending tasks, including exequatur process; review and analyze 
original claim; coordinate further investigation of companies related to Chen; investigation of 
entities; coordinate further strategy for investigations; revise final versions of motions. 
 

06/08/16  4.00  E. Brache  Revise opposition and request for exequatur, insert corrections made by A. Schoor, coordinate 
retrieval of revised translation of Preliminary Injunction and coordinate legalization of said 
translation before General Attorney's office with J. Marti. 
 

06/08/16  0.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails with A. Schoor and E. Brache, respectively, on pending tasks. 
 

06/08/16  0.80  C. Soto Hernandez  Revise final versions of motions to be filed with the court; update report; follow upon the 
obtainment of the certification regarding where Chen is shareholder; send email to client 
reporting on status; follow upon the completion of the translation -of the decision- updated 
legalization for the Exequatur motion. 
 

06/09/16  2.50  E. Brache  Prepare opposition and exhibits for filing, coordinate notification of opposition to Scotiabank 
with bailiff, revise exequatur request with C. Soto's corrections; draft request to assign 
chamber to be filed before the presidency of the Civil and Commercial Chamber of the First 
Instance Court of the National District and coordinate filing of exequatur and assignment of 
chamber request with J. Marti; report all to C. Soto. 
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06/09/16  1.20  J. Marti  Travel to and from the Civil and Commercial Chamber of the First Instance of the National 

District; file request for chamber designation regarding the request for exequatur of 
Preliminary Injunction Order; file motion for exequatur of Preliminary Injunction Order; report 
to C. Soto. 
 

06/09/16  2.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Work on several final matters related to filing of the Exequatur motion and oposition to be 
served to the bank; exchange of emails; revise list of exhibits. 
 

06/10/16  1.00  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and respond email from client addressing concern issues; review motion duly filed 
update and revise general report; send revised report to the client, including copy of the 
Exequatur motion and opposition served to the bank; coordinate next steps. 
 

06/13/16  1.20  J. Marti  Prepare request to be filed in the Ministry of Labor regarding all employees of Ammine, S.R.L. 
and their current labor status; report to C. Soto; coordinate filing of request with the Ministry 
of Labor. 
 

06/13/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow upon the obtainment of the certification from the Ministry of Labor regarding the 
employees registered for Armine SRL; exchange of emails on same; review and revise new 
request on the same, as per new requirements indicated by the Ministry. 
 

06/17/16  0.60  C. Alvarez  Retrieve judgment regarding the exequatur of Thomas Seaman at the First Chamber of the 
Civil and Commercial Chamber of Santo Domingo. 
 

06/17/16  0.50  E. Brache  Follow up on obtaining the Exequatur; report to C. Soto when exequatur was issued. 
 

06/20/16  4.00  E. Brache  Follow-up on the registry of the exequatur of the Preliminary Injunction before the Civil 
Registry with C. Alvarez and report to C. Soto; receive instructions from C. Soto to further 
investigate all property that S. Chen and any related entities may have in the Dominican 
Republic and conduct several investigations. 
 

06/20/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Address several matters on pending tasks and enforcement actions of Exequatur. 
 

06/21/16  0.50  E. Brache  Confirm with C. Soto and give instructions to J. Marti to request a certification before the 
Mercantile Registry listing all companies in which Yan Chen, Steve Chen or Mary Oliva 
Alvarez Lam appear to be members of the board of directors or shareholders. 
 

06/22/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow upon pending tasks related to the exequatur requested for the California Judge' s 
decision, and certification requested to the Ministry of Labor. 
 

06/23/16  0.20  E. Brache  Telephone conference tribunal official to follow-up on registry of exequatur issued in favor of 
Preliminary Injunction and coordinate retrieval of the same. 
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06/24/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on next steps in accordance to exequatur. 

 
06/27/16  2.00  E. Brache  Review exequatur issued for Preliminary Injunction, telephone conference J. Marti to 

determine which tasks have been completed, revise list of pending tasks and report to C. Soto. 
 

06/27/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Review exequatur; exchange of emails on pending tasks. 
 

06/29/16  0.70  E. Brache  Meet with C. Soto and J. Marti to discuss possible options and next steps to freeze S. Chen's 
property; give instructions to J. Marti to prepare communication to Scotiabank requesting all 
information on Ammine SRL's bank account. 
 

06/29/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Meeting with E. Brache and J. Marti coordinating pending tasks in connection to exequatur 
and instructions received from client on same; exchange of emails. 
 

06/30/16  1.20  J. Marti  Confirm with the Superintendence of Banks regarding the procedure for requesting 
information to banks with a Tribunal (exequatur order); investigate with the Superintendence 
of Banks potential aid from the Superintendent to execute foreign Tribunal's order; discuss 
findings with E. Brache. 
 

07/01/16  0.70  E. Brache  Meet with J. Marti to discuss updates, pending tasks and new possible actions to identify S. 
Chen property. 
 

07/01/16  4.70  J. Marti  Draft request to the Bank of Nova Scotia regarding the issuance of exequatur in favor of the 
Preliminary Injuction Order and request for access to bank accounts and information regarding 
said bank accounts; travel to and from the Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo 
Domingo; retrieve certificates regarding corporate entities where Steve Chen, Mary Oliva 
Alvarez Lam and Yan Chen are shareholders or members of the board of administrators; report 
to C. Soto and E. Brache. 
 

07/01/16  0.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on pending tasks. 
 

07/05/16  0.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow upon pending tasks with J. Marti and E. Brache. 
 

07/06/16  1.00  E. Brache  Review certifications issued by the Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo Domingo 
regarding companies related to Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam, Steve Chan and Yan Chan; give 
instructions to J. Marti to request all corporate documents of Natural Gem and Amn before the 
Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo Domingo; report to C. Soto. 
 

07/07/16  2.00  E. Brache  Instruct J. Marti to prepare bailiff act to Scotiabank notifying Exequatur and requesting 
information on Ammine's bank account; revise letter prepared by J. Marti addressed to 
Scotiabank notifying Exequatur and requesting information on Ammine's bank account. 
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07/07/16  0.80  J. Marti  Prepare request for corporate documents of AMN, S. R. L. and Natural Gem, S. R. L. to be 

filed in the Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo Domingo; coordinate filing of 
request for corporate documents; report to E. Brache and C. Soto. 
 

07/07/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and revise notification of exequatur to Scotiabank and exchange of emails on pending 
tasks. 
 

07/08/16  1.80  J. Marti  Work on draft of Bailiff act for service to the Bank of Nova Scotia regarding the issuance of 
exequatur in favor of the Preliminary Injuction Order and request for access to bank accounts 
and information regarding said bank accounts; report to C. Soto and E. Brache. 
 

07/08/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on pending tasks vs. notification to the exequatur to the Scotiabank and 
other tasks. 
 

07/11/16  1.90  E. Brache  Attention to electronic messages with C. Soto and J. Marti; meet with C. Soto and revise bailiff 
act to Scotiabank notifying Exequatur and requesting information on Ammine's bank account, 
organize exhibits, coordinate notification with bailiff. 
 

07/11/16  2.50  J. Marti  Coordinate retrieval of Certificate issued by the Ministry of Labor regarding the employees of 
Ammine, S.R.L.; analyze information regarding the employees of Ammine; draft report 
regarding corporate documents of Natural Gem and Amn; draft report regarding the Certificate 
issued by the Ministry of Labor regarding the employees of Ammine; report to C. Soto and E. 
Brache. 
 

07/11/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and respond updated general report from J. Marti addressing new findings; exchange 
of further emails on same and pending tasks. 
 

07/12/16  3.00  E. Brache  Telephone conference bailiff to follow up on notification served to Scotiabank, receive, file 
and report to C. Soto; review all corporate documents issued by the Chamber of Commerce 
and Production of Santo Domingo pertaining to Natural Gem and Amn; review document 
issued by the Ministry of Labor regarding Ammine labor issues; revise report prepared by J. 
Marti to client regarding case updates and report to C. Soto; give instructions to J. Marti to 
proceed with pending tasks. 
 

07/12/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails regarding new findings; send brief report to A. Schoor. 
 

07/13/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Review general report prepared by J. Marti and send questions and further instructions on the 
same to J. Marti; review and respond emails from A. Schoor. 
 

07/15/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Review status of pending tasks; review and revise report prepared by J. Marti, and send the 
same to the client. 
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07/18/16  1.20  M. Elmudesi  Draft requests of certifications regarding pending judicial proceedings involving Natural Gem, 

AMN and Ammine; coordinate filing of said requests before i) the Civil and Commercial 
Chamber of the First Instance Tribunal of the National District and ii) the Civil and 
Commercial Chamber of the Court of Appeals of the National District. 
 

07/18/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and respond email from A. Schoor regarding updated info on pending tasks. 
 

07/18/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Draft email to client; exchange of emails on pending tasks with A. Schoor; meet with J. Marti. 
 

07/19/16  1.10  J. Marti  Participate in conference-call with T. Seaman, C. Soto et al; prepare email regarding summary 
of call and next steps; report to C. Soto. 
 

07/20/16  0.60  J. Marti  Follow-up status of reply from the Scotiabank regarding the request of information and 
designation of T. Seaman as authorized representative of Ammine with legal representative of 
the bank; report to C. Soto. 
 

07/20/16  0.90  C. Soto Hernandez  Meet with J. Marti instructing on next actions; exchange of emails with A. Schoor; conference 
call; discuss next steps with J. Marti in accordance to call's results; review and revise report 
prepared by J. Marti on parcels and include other relevant information. 
 

07/21/16  3.10  J. Marti  Work on draft of Bailiff Act regarding requesting information and the designation of T. 
Seaman as an administrator to be filed in all banks except Scotiabank; report to C. Soto. 
 

07/21/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Discuss pending tasks with J. Marti; exchange of emails regarding pending response from 
Scotiabank; send email to A. Schoor on the same; exchange of emails with J. Marti regarding 
reports by the investigator that visited the alleged plant of operations. 
 

07/22/16  0.70  J. Marti  Follow-up status of reply from the Scotiabank regarding the request of information and 
designation of T. Seaman as authorized representative of Ammine with legal representative of 
the bank; report to C. Soto. 
 

07/22/16  0.90  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails with A. Schoor; address several matters on pending tasks; send revised 
and final version of the new opposition; exchange of further emails on pending tasks. 
 

07/25/16  0.70  E. Brache  Meet with J. Marti to discuss current status of investigations on Steve Chen et all assets and 
prepare list of pending tasks, report to C. Soto. 
 

07/25/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on pending tasks; conference call with investigator; review email from 
client and instruct J. Marti to prepare responses in accordance to updated findings. 
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07/26/16  4.20  E. Brache  Receive instructions from C. Soto and investigate before Tax Authorities, National Office of 
Industrial Property and Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo Domingo if company 
"Piedras Preciosas y Ambar" exists; investigate before the National Board of Free Trade Zones 
and the General Directorate of Mining any company related to Steve Chan is registered before 
said institutions; telephone conference official from the Free Trade Zone park of San Isidro if 
AMN is domiciled in said park; receive letter from Scotiabank indicating amount of money in 
Ammine bank, prepare report, review J. Marti's report and report all to C. Soto. 
 

07/26/16  1.20  M. Elmudesi  Draft requests of certifications regarding ownership of trade names. 
 

07/26/16  0.80  J. Marti  Meet with E. Brache to review strategies; coordinate quote from land surveyor; draft report to 
T. Seaman regarding quote from the land surveyor; coordinate with M. Elmudesi the request of 
certifications at the National Industrial Property Office of registries related to S. Chen, M. 
Oliva Alvarez, L. Chen et al; report to C. Soto. 
 

07/26/16  0.25  C. Research Library  Searched Lexis Advance, Hoovers, and the internet for information on Natural Gem LLC 
(Saint Joseph, MI).  (C. Soto-Hernandez - DR) 
 

07/26/16  2.70  C. Soto Hernandez  Review pictures sent by investigator of the place where allegedlly was Ammine located 
according to the records of the Ministry of Labor; conference call with official of the 
Scoatiabank; review new findings reported by E .Brache; draft email to counsel for Scotiabank 
regarding oposition and request for information served to Scotiabank; further exchange of 
emails on pending tasks; draft and send updated general report to client; exchange of further 
emails on pending tasks, including investigation. 
 

07/27/16  2.20  E. Brache  Meet and discuss legal strategy with C. Soto and J. Marti; give instructions to J. Marti to 
prepare opposition to be notified to banks regarding possible bank accounts of Steve Chan, 
Related Companies, Ammine and Amn; legal research on ambar or larimar business in the 
country in general and identify any necessary registries to commercialize precious stones. 
 

07/27/16  1.30  J. Marti  Meet with E. Brache to review strategies; receive response from Scotiabank; review all 
information in reply from Scotiabank; meet with C. Soto and E. Brache to discuss reply and 
next steps. 
 

07/28/16  2.90  E. Brache  Legal research on  export/import registry available to the public in Customs and if not, 
requisites to obtain information on possible import/ export activities of Steve Chen or related 
companies; telephone conference Mining Directorate to obtain maps and list of all ambar- 
larimar concessions in the country. 
 

07/28/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails with client on next steps. 
 

07/29/16  1.50  E. Brache  Draft letter addressed to Customs requesting information on possible importation or 
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exportation of merchandise by Steve Chen or related companies; give instructions to J. Marti to 
confirm all information in letter addressed to Customs is valid and report to C. Soto for her 
approval; review report on ambar and larimar industry in the Dominican Republic and give 
instructions to J. Marti to review. 
 

07/29/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on pending tasks. 
 

TOTAL HOURS FOR THIS MATTER:   81.00_

  
TOTAL SERVICES:  USD$ 12,244.25_

 
 

 
TIME SUMMARY 

TIMEKEEPER HOURLY RATE HOURS TOTAL)

Carla Alvarez 75.00 0.60 45.00)

Eugenia Brache 125.00 36.10 4,512.50)

Marianne Elmudesi 80.00 2.40 192.00)

Josue Marti 95.00 21.00 1,995.00)

Clev Research Library 110.00 0.25 27.50)

Carolina Soto Hernandez 265.00 20.65 5,472.25)

 
TOTAL SERVICES: 
 

81.00 USD$ 12,244.25_

 
 
 

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY 

 
Certifications VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_08252016 DATE: 

8/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201608 -  Tran Date 7/28/2016 - Marianne Elmudesi del Rio 
- Fee to request certifications before the national office of Industrial Property -Sort line 
291 -  DOP 10740 

232.54_

Public Notices VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_08252016 DATE: 
8/25/2016    

25.98_
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Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201608 -  Tran Date 7/28/2016 - Hector Martin Subervi 
Mena - Notification Bank Nova Scotia. Act 220/16 -Sort line 232 -  DOP 1200 

Public Notices VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_08252016 DATE: 
8/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201608 -  Tran Date 7/28/2016 - Gestrella & Asoc. - Legal 
fees for cadastral measure of four plots of land in Hato Mayor -Sort line 301 -  DOP 
92000 

1,991.92_

Public Notices VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_06252016 DATE: 
6/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201606 -  Tran Date 5/25/2016 - Ramon Gilberto Feliz - 
Bailiff service fees to locate an address for notification purposes. -Sort line 435 -  DOP 
2500 

54.42_

Registration Fees VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_06252016 DATE: 
6/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201606 -  Tran Date 5/16/2016 - Josue Marti - Fee to 
register priliminar injuntion and orders with its proper translation before ministry of 
foreign affairs. -Sort line 173 -  DOP 620 

13.50_

Registration Fees VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_06252016 DATE: 
6/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201606 -  Tran Date 5/16/2016 - Naya Baez - Fee to register 
preliminar injuntion and orders with its proper translation before Procuradoria General de 
la Republica. -Sort line 175 -  DOP 600 

13.06_

Registration Fees VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_07252016 DATE: 
7/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201607 -  Tran Date 6/15/2016 - Carla Alvarez -Coordinate 
legalization of translated preliminary induction and order regarding Steve Chen Et All -
Sort line 443 -  DOP 600 

13.00_

Registration Fees VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_07252016 DATE: 
7/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201607 -  Tran Date 7/11/2016 - Carla Alvarez - Fee to 
retrieve Exequatur from the Court of First Instane of the National District -Sort line 523 -
 DOP 300 

6.50_

Registration Fees VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_07252016 DATE: 
7/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201607 -  Tran Date 7/11/2016 - Josue Marti - Request 
corporate documents of Natural Gem. S.R.L. and of Amin. S.R.L. -Sort line 551 -  DOP 
2000 

43.35_

Translating Charge VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_06252016 DATE: 
6/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201606 -  Tran Date 6/10/2016 - Yolanda Cosme - 
Translation of Thomas Seaman documents -Sort line 639 -  DOP 21600 

470.16_

Travel VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_08252016 DATE: 
8/25/2016    

3.25_
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Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201608 -  Tran Date 7/28/2016 - Carla Alvarez - Travel to 
and from the court of appeals of the Civil and Commercial Chamber of Santo Domingo 
to deposit a certification request. -Sort line 178 -  DOP 150 

Travel VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_06252016 DATE: 
6/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201606 -  Tran Date 5/20/2016 - Carla Alvarez - Travel to 
and from the properties jurisdition of El Seibo in order to retrieve certificate of 
encumbrance regarding AMMINE's Real Estate property. -Sort line 412 -  DOP 5430 

118.19_

Travel VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_06252016 DATE: 
6/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201606 -  Tran Date 5/27/2016 - Aided Ceballo - Travel to 
and from El Seibo Title Registry to file real estate statys certification requests for 4 of the 
5 properties. -Sort line 500 -  DOP 6680 

145.40_

Telephone  5.87_
 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 3,137.14_

 

 
 
 

MATTER TOTAL 

 
SUBTOTAL SERVICES: USD$ 12,244.25)
LESS  6.1% DISCOUNT: USD$ (749.25)
SERVICES LESS DISCOUNT: USD$ 11,495.00)
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 3,137.14)
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE FOR THIS MATTER: USD$ 14,632.14)
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Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9832843  
A010010010200005533 
10/17/16 
115953.00001 
 

Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 18,965.75

Disbursements: USD$ 1,406.90

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 20,372.65
Previous Invoices Outstanding as of the Date of this Invoice: USD$ 25,808.60

TOTAL (INCLUDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES): USD$ 46,181.25

 

 

 

 

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 (INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9832843.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 
Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 

Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 
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Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9832843 
A010010010200005533 
10/17/16 
115953.00001 
 

REMITTANCE COPY 
Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 18,965.75

Disbursements: USD$ 1,406.90

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 20,372.65
Previous Invoices Outstanding as of the Date of this Invoice: USD$ 25,808.60

TOTAL (INCLUDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES): USD$ 46,181.25

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 
(INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) 
LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9832843.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 

Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 
Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 
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ASSETS SEARCH RELATED TO LITIGATION IN CA 
LEGAL SERVICES 

 
DATE  HOURS  TIMEKEEPER  NARRATIVE 
08/01/16  5.70  E. Brache  Meet with J. Marti to discus updates, pending tasks and further actions to locate S. Chen 

property and report to C. Soto, receive instructions from C. Soto regarding next steps, give 
instructions to I. Santoni to investigate before the Property Jurisdiction if we may be issued a 
list of real estate owned by S. Chen or the related entities with the Preliminary Order and the 
Exequatur, receive report from I. Santoni and give further instructions; receive and revise from 
J. Marti bailiff act containing opposition, notification of exequatur and information request to 
be served to major banks, organize annexes and copies and coordinate with bailiff; prepare 
bailiff ct containing opposition, notification of exequatur and information request to be served 
to Scotiabank, organize annexes and copies and coordinate with bailiff; follow-up with M. 
Elmudesi on certification to be issued by the National Office of Industrial Property regarding 
intellectual property owned by S. Chen, Yan Chen, Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam or one of the 
related entities; follow-up with C. Alvarez on the certifications to be issued by the tribunals 
regarding any pending claims; attention to electronic messages between C. Soto and A. 
Schoor; electronic message to A. Schoor regarding land surveyor invoice and payment; 
exchange electronic messages with land surveyor regarding the travel date to Hato Mayor. 
 

08/02/16  1.00  E. Brache  Give instructions to J. Marti to request certification before the Chamber of Commerce and 
Production of Santo Domingo indicating related companies to Lai Shan Lam - whom appeared 
in Ammine bank statements issued by Scotiabank; investigate entity J & G Seguridad - whom 
appeared in Ammine bank statements issued by Scotiabank; follow-up on different pending 
requests with law clerks. 
 

08/03/16  1.00  E. Brache  Per Banco BHD Leon's request, confirm before the Tax Authorities the related entities to Steve 
Chen that have a National Taxpayers Registry Number and investigate before the tax 
authorities that said entities do not have any pending property tax; receive report from I. 
Santoni regarding possibility to obtain, before the Property Jurisdiction, a list of the properties 
owned by the related entities. 
 

08/03/16  1.90  M. Elmudesi  Travel to and from the National Office of Industrial Property to file requests of certifications 
regarding ownership of trade names; report to E. Brache. 
 

08/03/16  0.40  J. Marti  Prepare request for request of possible entities related to Lai Shan Lam; coordinate filing of 
said request; report to C. Soto and E. Brache. 
 

08/03/16  0.70  I. Santoni  Investigate the National Taxpayers Numbers for Entities involved and/or related to AMINE, 
AMN, Natural Gem, Steve and Yan Chen and Mary Alvarez; investigate about existing 
properties owned by the afore mentioned. 
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08/03/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails regarding pending tasks. 
 

08/04/16  1.00  E. Brache  Receive and review certifications of no claims pending with regard to Ammine, Natural Gem 
and Amn before the Civil and Commercial Chamber of First Instance Court and Court of 
Appeals of the National District; work on the response letter addressed to the Banco BHD 
Leon indicating the National Taxpayers ID of the related entities that are registered before the 
Tax Authorities and coordinate delivery of the same. 
 

08/04/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Discuss current status of tasks with E. Brache; revise report from J. Marti regarding statements 
received from the Scotiabank; report to client. 
 

08/05/16  2.00  E. Brache  Attention to electronic correspondence with A. Juroe regarding payment to land surveyor; 
review copies of checks payable to Ammine issued by Scotiabank; receive instructions from C. 
Soto and prepare electronic correspondence to Scotiabank requesting Ammine SRL bank 
records since the account was opened and legible copies of checks payable to Ammine; 
prepare electronic correspondence to A. Juroe detailing informations requested to Scotiabank; 
telephone conference with land surveyor regarding his payment to proceed conducting his 
report on property related to Steve Chen; coordinate payment to land surveyor. 
 

08/05/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Review letter responding to BHD; review and respond email from Alison; discuss current 
status of pending tasks. 
 

08/08/16  4.10  E. Brache  Legal research on possible liabilities and obligations arising from the appointment of Thomas 
Seaman as administrator of Ammine and Amn before the corresponding Chamber of 
Commerce and Production; exchange electronic messages with Chamber of Commerce and 
Production official with regard to investigation on possible liabilities and obligations; attention 
to electronic messages from A. Schoor; prepare case update report and send to C.Soto for 
revision; telephone conference and exchange electronic messages with land surveyor; attend to 
land surveyor and attend to land surveyor payment; receive and review response to Opposition 
and Request of Documents by Banco de Ahorro y Crédito Unión. 
 

08/08/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Address several matters on pending tasks and exchange of emails on same. 
 

08/09/16  3.50  E. Brache  Receive instructions to C. Soto and report A. Schoor updates of case; receive and review 
negative response from Scotiabank regarding AMN, report to A. Schoor and file; report to A. 
Juroe informations requested to Scotiabank regarding Ammine's bank a ccount and checks 
payable to Ammine; instruct investigation  before the Chamber of Commerce and Production 
of Santo Domingo on how they would include Thomas Seaman in Ammine, Amn and Natural 
Gem's Mercantile Registry if we were to notify his designa tion as permanent receiver, receive 
report and discuss with C. Soto; discuss with C. Soto travel to Hato Mayor and why it would 
be useful that i go with land surveyor; review report prepared by N. Cedeno on amber industry 
and related institutions and prepare list of possible actions and places we could further 
investigate and report to C. Soto and J. Marti. 
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08/09/16  0.50  I. Santoni  Receive instructions from E. Brache to investigate before the National Taxpayers Authorities 

and the Chamber of Commerce and Production procedure to notify entities involved of the 
position of T. Seaman holds as representative of the Assets of said Entities. 
 

08/10/16  2.40  E. Brache  Follow-up on payment to land-surveyor; receive report from I. Santoni regarding procedure 
before the Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo Domingo to notify the role of 
permanent receiver of a company and give further instructions; investigate possible differences 
between permanent receiver and judicial administrator. 
 

08/10/16  1.90  I. Santoni  Travel to and from the Chamber of Commerce and Production to investigate notification 
procedure for assigned representative of assets; report to E. Brache findings. 
 

08/10/16  0.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and respond report from E. Brache regarding the investigation before the Chamber of 
Commerce; follow up on pending tasks status. 
 

08/11/16  0.80  E. Brache  Coordinate travel to Hato Mayor Province with land surveyor; telephone conference with 
Scotiabank official regarding documents related to Ammine╔s account since it was opened and 
legible copies of checks payable to Ammine and report to C. Soto and A. Juroe. 
 

08/12/16  11.10  E. Brache  Travel to and from Hato Mayor Province with land surveyor to identify property linked to 
Ammine SRL and conduct field investigations on amber mines; report to C. Soto prelininary 
findings. 
 

08/12/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on different tasks and investigations. 
 

08/15/16  3.20  E. Brache  Attention to electronic messages between C. Soto and A. Schoor; give instructions to N. 
Cedeno to investigate meaning of permanent receiver in US; meet with C. Soto and discuss 
difference between judicial administrator and permanent receiver and ways to minimize risk of 
claims to be filed against Thomas Seaman if registered as judicial administrator of AMN, 
AMMINE and Natural Gem in the Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo Domingo; 
telephone conference officials from the General Directorate of Mining to discuss exploration  
or exploitation concessions issued to amber mines and request information on registry book for 
small semi-precious stone miners; meet with C. Soto and discuss contents of report to client 
and potential visit to the General Directorate of Mining to review registry book of small semi-
precious stone miners. 
 

08/17/16  4.60  E. Brache  Travel to and from the Department of Small Miners in the General Directorate of Mining, meet 
with officials and discuss mining activities and registry book of semi-precious stone miners 
and report to C. Soto; telephone conference land surveyor to follow-up on issuance of report; 
report to A. Schoor field information gathered during travel to Hato Mayor and General 
Directorate of Mining. 
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08/17/16  1.00  J. Marti  Meet with E. Brache to discuss updates and next steps; prepare and attend meeting with private 

investigator with C. Soto and E. Brache. 
 

08/18/16  3.30  E. Brache  Meet with J. Marti and land surveyor to discuss report on Ammine's property in Hato Mayor; 
meet with C. Soto to discuss land surveyor's report,findings and preliminary value of property 
given by land surveyor; attention to e-mail between internal team and client regarding the 
postponement of the telephone conference to discuss case; exchange electronic messages with 
internal team to determine informations to be requested to investigator; exchange electronic 
messages with investigator indicating informations to be investigated and requesting quote of 
his services. 
 

08/19/16  3.10  E. Brache  Telephone conference with ex-official of the Ministry of Environment to discuss 
environmental authorizations for amber mines; conduct further investigations on amber, Steve 
Chen and related entities and discuss updates with team; receive instructions from C. Soto to 
follow-up on oppositions and information requests made to banks; give instructions to J. Marti 
to request Ammine SRL recent corporate documents before the Chamber of Commerce and 
Production of Santo Domingo, contact official from the Ministry of Environment to request 
information on environmental authorizations or studies relating to amber, investigate before 
National Directory of Promotion and Development of Craftsmen (FODEARTE) key persons in 
amber industry, prepare list of dominican persons selling amber on internet, investigate the 
corporate liquidator assigned to Ammine SRL; prepare list of informations gathered to give to 
the investigator. 
 

08/22/16  4.50  E. Brache  Follow-up on oppositions/ document and information requests before banks (Banco Múltiple 
BHD León, S. A., Banco Popular Dominicano, S. A. Banco Múltiple, Banco Dominicano del 
Progreso, S. A. Banco Múltiple, Citibank, N. A.., Banco Múltiple Vimenca); prepare for and 
participate in telephone conference with internal team and T. Seaman, A. Schoor and A. Juroe 
regarding case updates and next steps; follow-up on quote to be issued by investigator; review 
declaration of Peter F. del Greco, identify related persons to S. Chen, confirm said persons are 
not registered before the Tax Authorities and report names to C. Soto and J. Marti; translate 
information requested to investigator and report. 
 

08/22/16  1.20  J. Marti  Investigate accountant who carried out process of liquidation for entities related to S. Chen; 
prepare and attend conference with client and internal team. 
 

08/22/16  1.00  C. Soto Hernandez  Review status of pending tasks before the chamber of commerce and review reports from E. 
Brache and J. Marti; prepare for and attend call; meet with E. Brache to discuss call's results 
and next steps; instruct for updated report to client; exchange of emails; coordinate further 
research on the alleged blue amber. 
 

08/23/16  6.50  E. Brache  Receive and review Banco BHD Leon response to opposition, notification of exequatur and 
document request and exchange electronic messages with C. Soto; telephone conference with 
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officials from the Banco BHD Leon to request bank statements and general information of 
Ammine's account; follow-up on opposition, notification of exequatur and document request 
with banks that have yet to respond and exchange electronic messages with bank officials; 
meet with J. Marti to discuss updates and next steps;  prepare and attend conference with client 
and internal team; review electronic message to be sent to the Chamber of Commerce and 
Production of Santo Domingo requesting they abstain from dissolving AMMINE; receive and 
revise opposition to be notified to the Chamber of Commerce and Production of Santo 
Domingo and Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam regarding AMN and AMMINE, meet with C. Soto, 
receive corrections, include corrections, prepare copies of notification and annexes and give 
instructions to J. Marti to coordinate notification with bailiff; review newspaper publications 
indicating that AMN and Natural Gem are in the process of dissolution and that Natural Gem 
lost a Title Deed and discuss strategy with C. Soto; give instructions to J. Marti to review 
newspaper publications and identify any notices of lost Title Deeds by AMN or AMMINE. 
 

08/23/16  4.20  J. Marti  Prepare draft of opposition to be notified to the Chamber of Commerce and Production of 
Santo Domingo and Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam regarding AMN and AMMINE; meet with E. 
Brache to discuss updates and next steps; prepare and attend conference with client and 
internal team; draft electronic message to be sent to the Chamber of Commerce and Production 
of Santo Domingo requesting they abstain from dissolving AMMINE; coordinate notification 
with bailiff. 
 

08/23/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Review response from BHD Leon bank; coordinate next steps; meet with E. Brache and J. 
Marti; review report on responses by banks; exchange of emails on same; review and respond 
email from counsel for Scotiabank. 
 

08/24/16  0.80  C. Alvarez  Prepare a Chart with information of all the companies that sell amber from the Dominican 
Republic on line; report to E.Brache. 
 

08/24/16  1.70  E. Brache  Organize list of pending tasks; meet with J. Marti and give instructions to complete certain 
tasks; receive, review and revise table with information of dominican persons selling amber on 
the internet, report to J. Marti and give further instructions; receive and review quote issued by 
investigator and report to C. Soto and J. Marti. 
 

08/24/16  3.40  J. Marti  Work on money trail regarding the last six months of Ammine's Scotiabank account; 
coordinate with C. Alvarez an investigation of all amber distributors in the Dominican 
Republic in accordance to online sales; coordinate notification of opposition to the Chamber of 
Commerce and Production of Santo Domingo and Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam regarding AMN 
and AMMINE; 
 

08/24/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on status; instruct E. Brache on pending tasks. 
 

08/25/16  0.30  E. Brache  Exchange electronic messages with C. Soto, J. Marti and investigator regarding quote issued 
by the latter. 
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08/26/16  1.50  E. Brache  Receive response to opposition from Progreso bank and telephone inference bank official to 

confirm response includes Steve Chen as an individual and report to C. Soto; update pending 
tasks report; telephone conference with investigator to confirm the quote issued includes all the 
public institutions that must be inquired; confirm with J. Marti that land surveyor can confirm 
that Title Deed allegedly lost by Natural Gem corresponds to property indicated as domicile of 
Ammine, Amn and Natural Gem. 
 

08/29/16  3.67  E. Brache  Confirm status of some tasks with J. Marti and update pending tasks report; prepare material 
for conference call with client and deliver to C. Soto and J. Marti; conference call with client; 
meet with C. Soto and revise details of case prepared by A. Schoor; email client updated 
pending tasks report; give further instructions to J. Marti. 
 

08/29/16  3.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Meet with E. Brache and J. Marti to discuss new findings, status and instruct on preparation of 
chart and certain pending actions; revise chart prepared by E. Brache; prepare for and attend 
conference call with client and team; meet with E. Brache and J. Marti instructing on next steps 
in accordance to call with client; exchange of several emails; revise general updated report 
from A. Schoor; discuss the same with E. Brache and send revised version to A. Schoor. 
 

08/30/16  2.00  E. Brache  Continue investigations on Mary Oliva Alvarez Lam and report to C. Soto and A. Schoor 
findings; receive approval from Thomas Seaman to proceed to request services from 
investigator and land surveyor; exchange electronic messages with investigator and coordinate 
meeting; coordinate payment to land surveyor; follow-up on informations requests to 
Scotiabank and report to C. Soto. 
 

08/30/16  0.80  C. Soto Hernandez  Meet on status and pending tasks; review updated report shared by E. Brache; instruct on 
report to client; call to counsel for Scotiabank; discuss pending tasks; review and respond 
several emails. 
 

08/31/16  4.50  E. Brache  Follow-up on the informations requested to BHD Leon bank with regard to Ammine's bank 
account; prepare certified copy requests of Amn and Natural Gem's corporate documents to be 
filed before the Chamber of Commerce; travel to and from the Chamber o  f Commerce and 
file certified copy requests, meet with official to confirm oppositions on Ammine and Amn 
have been registered in the Mercantile Registry, confirm  Ammine's dissolution request didn't 
go through and that Amn isn't dissolved and requ   est copy of dissolution request filed with 
regard to Ammine; receive and review documents issued by Scotiabank regarding bank records 
since Ammine's account was opened; instruct to prepare table including details of all checks 
paid by Ammine; exchan ge email with J. Marti and give instructions to request further 
certifications before the Chamber of Commerce and request certification of no litigations 
before the labor courts. 
 

08/31/16  1.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Address several issues regarding pending tasks; meetings with E. Brache discussing the same; 
review and respond several emails; conference call with counsel for Scotiabank followiing 
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upon pending statements; instruct E. Brache and J. Marti on actions before the Chamber of 
Commerce and the Land Registry, and matters related to the investigator's tasks. 
 

09/01/16  0.30  E. Brache  Follow-up on bank statements to be issued of Ammine's bank account in Banco BHD Leon 
with bank official and report to C. Soto. 
 

09/02/16  2.40  E. Brache  Meet with J. Marti to discuss status on tasks; give instructions to J. Marti to prepare 
documentation to be deliver to investigator, review documents and include additional 
documents; prepare non disclosure agreement for investigator to sign; meet with investigator, 
execute non disclosure agreement and discuss contents and relevance of documents delivered; 
report to C. Soto and J. Marti and file copy of executed non disclosure agreement and all 
documents delivered to investigator. 
 

09/02/16  1.80  J. Marti  Prepare inventory of documents regarding the dominican entities related to S. Chen to be 
handed in to private investigator; exchange of emails on pending tasks. 
 

09/05/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails on pending tasks; conference call with Scotiabank's representative; review 
and respond email from Scotitabank 
 

09/06/16  0.40  E. Brache  Meet with C. Soto, discuss emailing Mercantile Registry registrar to obtain name of persons 
requesting Amn and Ammine dissolution and give instructions to J. Marti to prepare first draft 
of email to registrar. 
 

09/06/16  0.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow upon pending tasks; exchange of emails with E. Brache. 
 

09/07/16  0.90  E. Brache  Per C. Soto's instructions, telephone conference official from Scotiabank to follow-up on 
internet access request to Ammine's bank account; follow-up on bank statements to be issued 
by Banco BHD Leon regarding Ammine's bank account with official; follow-up on payment to 
investigator; telephone conference investigator to ask when he can issue preliminary or official 
report. 
 

09/07/16  0.10  C. Soto Hernandez  Review email from client; coordinate response with E. Brache. 
 

09/07/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Review exchange of emails with Banco BHD; call to coordinate meeting with BHD general 
counsel. 
 

09/07/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Cnference call with counsel for Scotiabank discussing online access to be granted to T. 
Seaman; address pending tasks 
 

09/08/16  1.85  E. Brache  Receive negative response from Banco BHD Leon regarding bank statement request of 
Ammine's bank account, telephone conference official from bank and exchange electronic 
messages with C. Soto and J. Marti; meet with C. Soto and discuss legal arguments to be used 
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during meeting with Banco BHD Leon official, receive and give instructions to J. Marti to 
prepare documents for meeting with official of Banco BHD Leon; follow-up on payment to 
investigator; revise email prepare by J. Marti to be send to Chamber of Commerce registrar 
requesting name of person who filed dissolution request of Amn and Ammine. 
 

09/08/16  1.50  J. Marti  Work on draft of email to be sent to the Director of the Mercantile Registry requesting 
information regarding the dissolution of Ammine; report to E. Brache. 
 

09/08/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails; instruct E. Brache. 
 

09/09/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Exchange of emails and calls regarding meeting with VP for BHD-Leon. 
 

09/12/16  1.33  E. Brache  Meet with C. Soto and J. Marti to discuss meeting held between C. Soto and BHD Bank 
officials and receive instructions from C. Soto; receive message from client to prepare budget 
for last 3 months and work on message containing budget and other updates. 
 

09/12/16  1.60  J. Marti  Prepare chart of the dominican entities related to Steve Chen including their shareholders and 
administrators; discuss following steps; 
 

09/13/16  1.20  E. Brache  Receive and review message from A. Juroe regarding Ammine's Scotiabank account missing 
statements ( 2014 and 2015 for March, April, May, June, July and August 2014); exchange 
messages with Scotiabank official requesting missing statements; receive and revise report on 
updated prepared by J. Marti to be sent to client and report to C. Soto. 
 

09/13/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow up pending tasks. 
 

09/14/16  0.40  E. Brache  Meet with C. Soto and J. Marti to discuss pending tasks; receive missing Ammine bank 
statements from Scotiabank official and report to A. Juroe. 
 

09/14/16  0.90  J. Marti  Follow-up on the status of the investigation regarding the private investigator hired in order to 
review S. Chen et al; follow-up on the status of the report regarding the land surveyors and the 
property of Natural Gem with the lost title deed; report to E. Brache and C. Soto. 
 

09/14/16  0.50  A. Pena-Prieto  Draft correspondence to S. Mejia at Mercantile Registry. 
 

09/14/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Address issues related to pending tasks. 
 

09/15/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Address several matters related to pending tasks; exchange of emails on same. 
 

09/16/16  0.30  A. Pena-Prieto  Correspondence with Mercantile Registrar; discuss with C. Soto. 
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09/19/16  0.70  E. Brache  Receive report from J. Marti regarding property owner of Natural Gem, update general report 
to client and send to C. Soto. 
 

09/20/16  0.70  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and revise general report prepared by E. Brache and send it to client; exchange of 
further emails on pending tasks. 
 

09/21/16  0.80  E. Brache  Exchange electronic messages with Scotiabank official regarding Internet Banking access in 
favor of Mr. Seaman and report to C. Soto. 
 

09/22/16  1.00  C. Soto Hernandez  Attend several matters on pending tasks; exchange of emails; meeting with E. Brache. 
 

09/26/16  2.60  E. Brache  Follow-up on preliminary investigator report; receive Ammine's claim against exequatur and 
discuss with C. Soto; legal research;   exchange electronic messages with C. Soto regarding 
strategy and possible legal defenses; report to claim to client. 
 

09/26/16  0.70  P. Gamundi  Attend telephone call from Edward Salcedo, partner at Dejarden, Valenzuela, Molina & 
Salcedo, to inform us about their engagement by Ammine, SRL in appeal process, and bailiff 
act notice to be received shortly at our office to that effect; transfer call from E. Salcedo to C. 
Soto; discuss with the latter nature and implications of the referred engagement. 
 

09/26/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Discuss with E. Brache appeal filed by Ammine against the Exequatur and instruct on next 
steps; address several matters related to same; conference with A. Salcedo/ prepre report 
 

09/27/16  3.30  E. Brache  Analyze with J. Marti arguments and legal defenses against claim filed by Ammine and 
identify documentation we may need for our legal defense; prepare update of pending tasks 
and report to C. Soto; prepare for and attend conference call with client to discuss case; 
exchange electronic message with Scotiabank official requesting assistance for Mr. Seaman to 
access Ammine's Scotiabank account through internet banking. 
 

09/27/16  0.80  P. Gamundi  Confer with C. Soto before and after telephone conference with client, to report the 
engagement of the firm Dejarden, Valenzuela, Molina & Salcedo by Ammine, SRL to 
represent them in appeal process, and bailiff act notice received at our office to that effect. 
 

09/27/16  2.40  J. Marti  Meet with E. Brache; review appeal of exequatur; identify arguments of the counterpart; 
review potential arguments; participate in conference call with T. Seaman et al. 
 

09/27/16  0.70  C. Soto Hernandez  Conference call with client; coordinate several pending tasks. 
 

09/28/16  1.70  E. Brache  Exchange electronic messages with client regarding access to Ammine's Scotiabank internet 
account; meet with M. Elmudesi to discuss legal arguments and give instructions to conduct 
legal investigation on fraud and procedures that apply; prepare reminder to appoint counsel; 
give instructions to J. Marti to conduct research before Property Jurisdiction and actions that 
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we may take. with regard to any property owned by Ammine or Amn. 
 

09/29/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Address several matters on pending tasks. 
 

09/30/16  1.00  E. Brache  Meet with M. Elmudesi and discuss ideas for her legal research on fraud and procedure that 
applies in fraud cases. 
 

09/30/16  1.20  M. Elmudesi  Meet with E. Brache to discuss following steps regarding the appeal presented by M. Alvarez. 
 

09/30/16  0.30  C. Soto Hernandez  Draft and send instructions on pending tasks to E. Brache. 
 

TOTAL HOURS FOR THIS MATTER:   134.85_

  
TOTAL SERVICES:  USD$ 18,965.75_

 
 

 
TIME SUMMARY 

TIMEKEEPER HOURLY RATE HOURS TOTAL)

Carla Alvarez 75.00 0.80 60.00)

Eugenia Brache 125.00 90.35 11,293.75)

Marianne Elmudesi 80.00 3.10 248.00)

Pedro Gamundi 380.00 1.50 570.00)

Josue Marti 95.00 18.40 1,748.00)

Alejandro Pena-Prieto 390.00 0.80 312.00)

Isabella Santoni 75.00 3.10 232.50)

Carolina Soto Hernandez 267.95 16.80 4,501.50)

 
TOTAL SERVICES: 
 

134.85 USD$ 18,965.75_

 
 
 

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY 
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Certifications VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_09252016 DATE: 
9/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201609 -  Tran Date 8/30/2016 - Fee regarding the request 
of certification of entities linked to Lai Shan Lam -Sort line 814 -  DOP 2000 

43.32_

Outside Consultants VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_09252016 DATE: 
9/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201609 -  Tran Date 8/25/2016 - Gustavo Estrella - 
Remaining of fees for cadastral measure of four plots of land  -Sort line 421 -  DOP 
10222.22 

221.42_

Outside Consultants VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_09252016 DATE: 
9/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201609 -  Tran Date 9/01/2016 - G Estrlla & asoc. - Final 
payment of cadastral measure of plot of land in the National District -Sort line 556 -  
DOP 15593 

337.75_

Outside Consultants VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_09252016 DATE: 
9/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201609 -  Tran Date 9/08/2016 - Edward Andres Nuñez - 
Payment of 60% fees for investigation services. Inv. GAI-24-08-2016 -Sort line 566 -  
DOP 24454 

529.68_

Public Notices VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_09252016 DATE: 
9/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201609 -  Tran Date 8/31/2016 - Hector Martín Suberví 
Mena - Notifications (7) of Thomas Seaman  -Sort line 534 -  DOP 8400 

181.95_

Registration Fees VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_08252016 DATE: 
8/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201608 -  Tran Date 8/03/2016 - Fee to request certifications 
regarding regarding pending judicial proceedings. - 6 receipts of 10.00 - 12 stamps of 
30.00( 6 red 6 brown) -Sort line 415 -  DOP 420 

9.09_

Registration Fees VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_09252016 DATE: 
9/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201609 -  Tran Date 8/30/2016 - Request corporate 
documents of Ammine from April 2016 to current date -Sort line 822 -  DOP 1000 

21.66_

Telephone  62.03_
 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 1,406.90_

 

 
 
 

MATTER TOTAL 
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TOTAL SERVICES: USD$ 18,965.75)
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 1,406.90)
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE FOR THIS MATTER: USD$ 20,372.65)
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Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9840486  
A010010010200005606 
11/07/16 
115953.00001 
 

Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 5,951.75

Disbursements: USD$ 151.67

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 6,103.42
Previous Invoices Outstanding as of the Date of this Invoice: USD$ 46,181.25

TOTAL (INCLUDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES): USD$ 52,284.67

 

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 (INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9840486.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 
Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 

Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 
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Thomas Seaman Company 
Mr. Thomas A. Seaman, CFA 
3 Park Plaza 
Suite 550 
Irvine, California 92614 

Invoice Number: 
NCF: 
Invoice Date: 
Matter Number: 
 

9840486 
A010010010200005606 
11/07/16 
115953.00001 
 

REMITTANCE COPY 
Assets search related to litigation in CA 

INVOICE SUMMARY 
Fees: USD$ 5,951.75

Disbursements: USD$ 151.67

Amount Due for this Invoice: USD$ 6,103.42
Previous Invoices Outstanding as of the Date of this Invoice: USD$ 46,181.25

TOTAL (INCLUDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES): USD$ 52,284.67

PAYMENT  INSTRUCTIONS 

Remit Check Payments to: Remit Wire Payments to: Direct Billing Inquiries to: 

Squire Patton Boggs (US) LLP 
200 South Biscayne Blvd, 47th Floor 
Miami, FL 33131 
Phone: 305.577.7000 
Fax: 305.577.7001 
 

Citibank 
ABA: 266086554 (WITHIN US) 
SWIFT Code: CITIUS33 
(INTERNATIONAL) 
Account Name: Squire Patton Boggs (US) 
LLP,  
International  DR Operating Acct. 
Account #: 3200718328    
Reference: 9840486.115953 

Carolina  Soto Hernandez 
Av. Pedro Henriquez Urena No. 157 
La Esperilla 
Santo Domingo 
Dominican Republic 
Phone: +1.809.472.4900 
Fax: +1.809.472.4999 
email:  Carolina.Soto-
Hernandez@squirepb.com 

 

Please Include Invoice Number with all Payments 
Tax Identification Number RNC #101-79813-2 
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ASSETS SEARCH RELATED TO LITIGATION IN CA 
LEGAL SERVICES 

 
DATE  HOURS  TIMEKEEPER  NARRATIVE 
10/03/16  0.70  E. Brache  Attention to email between internal team; address several matters related to SEC claim's 

translation;  follow-up on investigators preliminary report and report to C. Soto and client; 
meet with C. Soto and discuss pending tasks and updates. 
 

10/03/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Discuss current status of tasks and pending reports; exchange of emails. 
 

10/04/16  2.70  E. Brache  Follow-up on fraud investigation with M. Elmudesi, discuss and give further instructions; 
follow-up on ethics investigation with J. Marti and discuss; work on spreadsheet containing 
Ammine's Scotiabank check information and report to C. Soto; exchange electronic messages 
with C. Soto regarding payment made to investigator; review newspaper for potential 
publications by Natural Gem, Ammine or Amn and report to C. Soto; exchange electronic 
messages with translator requesting quote for translation of SEC claim. 
 

10/04/16  0.20  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow upon the status of pending tasks with E. Brache. 
 

10/05/16  1.00  E. Brache  Attention to email from C. Soto regarding instructions and new tasks regarding appeals claim 
filed by Ammine against Exequatur; attention to email exchange between A. Pena and 
Chamber of Commerce registrar regarding request to disclose name of person who requested 
dissolution of Amn and Ammine; meet with M. Elmudesi, discuss findings of investigation on 
fraud according to local legislation and give further instructions. 
 

10/05/16  3.40  M. Elmudesi  Review and analyze laws and precedents regarding administrator appointment in the 
Dominican Republic; report to E. Brache. 
 

10/05/16  1.10  J. Marti  Carry out investigation of potential actions against the professional ethics violations; review 
applicable laws. 
 

10/05/16  0.40  A. Pena-Prieto  Correspondence to Mercantile Registrar; correspondence with C. Soto re follow up. 
 

10/05/16  0.90  C. Soto Hernandez  Review and respond report from E. Brache regarding status of each pending task; draft and 
send email to investigator; draft and send email to A. Pena for investigation with the Chamber 
of Commerce's registrar; follow upon pending tasks with client; draft emails to counsel for the 
Superintendence of Securities. 
 

10/06/16  2.60  J. Marti  Travel to and from the Court of Appeals of the Civil and Commercial Chamber of the National 
District; review potential filing of appeal claim requesting the annulment of the exequatur; 
continue investigation of potential actions against the professional ethics violations; review 
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applicable laws. 
 

10/06/16  0.60  A. Pena-Prieto  Meet with C. Soto; draft correspondence to legal counsel to Superintendence of Securities. 
 

10/07/16  5.00  E. Brache  Attention to email with C. Soto and J. Marti regarding pending tasks and further instructions; 
contact Notary Public and coordinate meeting to discuss preparation of statement indicating 
what is located in Amn and Ammine domiciles; coordinate obtainment of certified copy of 
Amn and Ammine's dissolution newspaper publication; meet with M. Elmudesi and work on 
outline of defenses regarding Ammine's appeals claim against Exequatur granted to 
Preliminary Injunction. 
 

10/07/16  0.50  J. Marti  Continue investigation of potential actions against the professional ethics violations; review 
applicable laws; send preliminary report to C. Soto. 
 

10/07/16  0.90  C. Soto Hernandez  Draft and send updated report to client; exchange of emails regarding the same; meet with E. 
Brache; address pending tasks; review and respond email on outline draft. 
 

10/10/16  2.60  E. Brache  Report to C. Soto recommended strategy regarding notary public to issue a statement 
indicating what exactly is located in Ammine and Amn domicile  (to demonstrate the address 
indicated as supposedly companies╔ domiciles is just home residency); receive instructions 
from C. Soto and meet with notary public, prepare non disclosure agreement, explain works, 
obtain quote of works and report to C. Soto for client approval; telephone conference 
investigator to follow up on report; give instructions to research assistant to identify fraud 
treaties between US and DR to be used by Mr. Seaman in Ammine's appeal defenses; receive, 
review and file certified copies of newspaper publications indicating that Ammine and Amn 
are in the dissolution process. 
 

10/10/16  0.40  C. Soto Hernandez  Discuss details of potential notary act on AMN and Ammine's domiciles with E. Brache; 
follow upon the responses from the SIV and Chamber of Commerce, respectively. 
 

10/11/16  0.70  E. Brache  Conference call with C. Soto regarding conversation with investigator concerning preliminary 
report; receive confirmation receipt from Ministry of Foreign Affairs indicating that appeals 
claim has been sent to Dominican consulate in California; prepare message to Mr. Seaman to 
remind him to inform us when he receives Ammine's appeals claim and attach Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs confirmation receipt; confirm with J. Marti that opposing counsel has yet to 
request presidency of civil court to assign the case to a courtroom. 
 

10/11/16  1.30  M. Elmudesi  Travel to and from the State Attorney's Office to obtain the notification of the appeal presented 
by M. Alvarez against the decision granting the Exequatur; report to E. Brache. 
 

10/11/16  0.40  A. Pena-Prieto  Exchange correspondence with legal counsel for Superintendence of Securities; discuss with 
C. Soto. 

Exhibit A, Page 49

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 164   Filed 12/06/16   Page 50 of 53   Page ID
 #:6292



SQUIRE PATTON BOGGS PEÑA PRIETO GAMUNDI 
 
 

  115953.00001 

11/07/16 Thomas Seaman Company / Assets search related to litigation in CA 

Page 3 Invoice Number: 9840486

NCF: A010010010200005606 
 

 

  

 

 
10/11/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Review certified copy of the complaint filed in California; send email to A. Schoor; 

instructions to J. Marti on same; follow upon the results of the investigation. 
 

10/13/16  3.22  E. Brache  Receive, review and analyze international treaties sent by research assistant for potential use in 
Mr. Seaman's defense against Ammine's appeal claim; discuss applicable treaties to case with 
C. Soto and give instructions to research assistant to obtain two other treaties and receive, 
review and analyze treaties; discuss with J. Marti potential actions regarding real estate 
property purchased by Ammine and give instructions to investigate further potential actions 
with property authority official. 
 

10/13/16  2.30  J. Marti  Travel to and from the Real Estate Jurisdiction; meet with oficial and discuss probability of 
filing an opposition on land property of Ammine et al; conference call with officials of the 
National Tax Authorities; discuss probability of  filing an opposition on the transfer of 
property of Ammine et al. 
 

10/14/16  2.00  E. Brache  Per C. Soto's instructions, legal research on obligation ofr companies under dissolution and the 
person called to represent them before judicial courts, discuss with C. Soto, receive 
instructions and discuss with A. Alcantara and report to C. Soto. 
 

10/14/16  0.50  C. Soto Hernandez  Follow upon several pending tasks; meeting to discuss the same and coordinate further tasks. 
 

10/19/16  0.20  E. Brache  Telephone conference investigator to follow up on report and report to C. Soto. 
 

10/20/16  0.60  E. Brache  Attention to email from Mr. Seaman regarding dissolution of Amn and Ammine and statement 
to be filed before California tribunal; review dissolution newspaper publications and local 
company law and report to Mr. Seaman that the dissolution by Amn and Ammine is not 
official nor binding. 
 

10/21/16  2.25  E. Brache  Review all allegations made by Mr Seaman in statement to be filed before the Californian 
courts; give instructions to J. Marti to verify real estate property statements; per C. Soto's 
instructions, research on exceptions for the rule of Dominican Court's exclusive jurisdiction. 
 

10/24/16  3.00  E. Brache  Attention to email between C. Soto and Mr Seaman, receive instructions and follow-up on 
pending investigator report; meet with J. Marti and discuss instructions to confirm points of Mr 
Seaman statement to be filed before Californian Courts, continue reviewing statement, receive, 
review and include J. Marti's suggestions and report final revised statement to Mr Seaman; 
confirm with law clerk that Ammine has yet to file claim before court and set hearing date; 
receive and review investigator's preliminary report and report to Mr Seaman et al; receive 
inquiry from A. Juroe regarding authorized person to sign Ammine's Scotiabank account and 
exchange emails with bank official to confirm. 
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10/25/16  0.30  E. Brache  Telephone conference Scotiabank official to confirm name of person originally  authorized to 
sign Ammine's Scotiabank account and report to A. Juroe. 
 

10/25/16  2.20  J. Marti  Conference call with officials of the National Tax Authorities; discuss probability of  filing an 
opposition on the transfer of the real estate property of Ammine et al; exchange emails with 
official of the National Tax Authorities; work on draft of report regarding possible actions that 
can be carried out in regards to the real estate property bought by Ammine et al. 
 

10/28/16  0.30  E. Brache  Exchange messages with investigator to confirm meeting; follow-up on possible newspaper 
publications by Amn or Ammine and report to C. Soto. 
 

10/31/16  1.00  E. Brache  Meet with investigator to discuss preliminary report and findings and give further instructions. 
 

TOTAL HOURS FOR THIS MATTER:   44.17_

  
TOTAL SERVICES:  USD$ 5,951.75_

 
 

 
TIME SUMMARY 

TIMEKEEPER HOURLY RATE HOURS TOTAL)

Eugenia Brache 125.00 25.57 3,196.25)

Marianne Elmudesi 80.00 4.70 376.00)

Josue Marti 95.00 8.70 826.50)

Alejandro Pena-Prieto 390.00 1.40 546.00)

Carolina Soto Hernandez 265.00 3.80 1,007.00)

 
TOTAL SERVICES: 
 

44.17 USD$ 5,951.75_

 
 
 

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY 

 
Public Notices VENDOR: Santo Domingo - DOP Only INVOICE#: 76079_10252016 DATE: 

10/25/2016    
Cash Detail Santo Domingo 201610 -  Tran Date 9/28/2016 - Ramon Gilberto Feliz - 

151.67_

Exhibit A, Page 51

Case 2:15-cv-07425-RGK-PLA   Document 164   Filed 12/06/16   Page 52 of 53   Page ID
 #:6294



SQUIRE PATTON BOGGS PEÑA PRIETO GAMUNDI 
 
 

  115953.00001 

11/07/16 Thomas Seaman Company / Assets search related to litigation in CA 

Page 5 Invoice Number: 9840486

NCF: A010010010200005606 
 

 

  

 

Bailiff service fee for notification in Boca Chica  -Sort line 175 -  DOP 7000 
 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 151.67_

 

 
 
 

MATTER TOTAL 

 
TOTAL SERVICES: USD$ 5,951.75)
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: USD$ 151.67)
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE FOR THIS MATTER: USD$ 6,103.42)
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